City of Frisco

CSB #1802-039

Water, Sewer, Meter Parts
Opened 3/21/2018 2:00pm CST

Core & Main
4333 Irving Blvd
Dallas, TX 75247

214-631-9410

dennis.woody@coreandmain.com

Ferguson Waterworks
10077 University Drive
McKinney, TX 76070

903-508-6341

ryan.reed1@ferguson.com

Ferguson Plumbing
2683 Euless Blvd
Euless, TX 76040

817-540-1888

steven.fletcher@ferguson.com

R Reed
Dennis Woody yan Ree Steven Fletcher
City of Est. Extended
|.y ° Description > Unit Price Extended Price | Brand Price Extended Price Brand Price X er1 € Brand
Frisco Qty Price
Tapping Saddles-All Tapping Saddles must be double band except
for line items #1 and #2 (Brass hinged bolt type for standard PVC).
Brass C.C. or |.P.. Acceptable brands are Ford, McDonald, and
Cambridge (Please annotate the brand you are quoting)
2x3/4 BRONZE TAPPING
1|SADDLE/BRASS HINGED BOLT 1|EA $15.60 $15.60|Ford $17.50 $17.50(Ford INo Bid
TYPE FOR STANDARD PVC
2X1 BRONZE TAPPING
2|SADDLE/BRASS HINGED BOLT 1|EA $15.60 $15.60|Ford $17.50 $17.50(Ford No Bid
TYPE FOR STANDARD PVC
3[4X3/4 BRONZE TAPPING SADDLE 1|EA $69.09 $69.09|Ford $77.90 $77.90(Ford INo Bid
4[4X1 BRONZE TAPPING SADDLE 1|EA $69.09 $69.09|Ford $77.90 $77.90(Ford INo Bid
5[4X2 BRONZE TAPPING SADDLE 1|EA $87.71 $87.71|Ford $98.80 $98.80(Ford INo Bid
6[6X3/4 BRONZE TAPPING SADDLE 5[EA $81.38 $406.90|Ford $91.75 $458.75|Ford INo Bid
7|6X1 BRONZE TAPPING SADDLE 3|EA $81.38 $244.14|Ford $91.75 $275.25|Ford INo Bid
8[6X1-1/2 BRONZE TAPPING SADDLE 1|EA $93.04 $93.04|Ford $104.90 $104.90|Ford INo Bid
9(6X2 BRONZE TAPPING SADDLE 1|EA $102.24 $102.24|Ford $115.25 $115.25|Ford INo Bid
10{8X3/4 BRONZE TAPPING SADDLE 1|EA $100.72 $100.72|Ford $113.50 $113.50|Ford INo Bid
11(8X1 BRONZE TAPPING SADDLE 10(EA $100.72 $1,007.20|Ford $113.50 $1,135.00|Ford INo Bid
12(8X1-1/2 BRONZE TAPPING SADDLE 1|EA $106.04 $106.04|Ford $119.50 $119.50(|Ford INo Bid
13|8X2 BRONZE TAPPING SADDLE 1|EA $115.43 $115.43|Ford $130.15 $130.15|Ford INo Bid
14{12X3/4 BRONZE TAPPING SADDLE 1|EA $146.03 $146.03|Ford $164.60 $164.60|Ford INo Bid
15(12X1 BRONZE TAPPING SADDLE 2|EA $146.03 $292.06|Ford $164.60 $329.20|Ford INo Bid
16 éifl()loilé BRONZE TAPPING 1|EA $164.70 $164.70|Ford $185.65 $185.65|Ford INo Bid
17(12X2 BRONZE TAPPING SADDLE 5[EA $167.67 $838.35|Ford $189.00 $945.00|Ford INo Bid
16"X3/4" DOUBLE STRAP BRASS .
18 TAPPING SADDLE 1|EA $357.59 $357.59|Ford $403.15 $403.15|Ford INo Bid
16"X1" DOUBLE STRAP BRASS .
19 TAPPING SADDLE 1|EA $357.59 $357.59|Ford $403.15 $403.15|Ford INo Bid
16"X1 1/2" DOUBLE STRAP BRASS .
20 TAPPING SADDLE 1|EA $379.43 $379.43|Ford $419.05 $419.05|Ford INo Bid
16"X2" DOUBLE STRAP BRASS .
21 TAPPING SADDLE 1|EA $419.30 $419.30|Ford $463.05 $463.05|Ford INo Bid
20"X3/4" DOUBLE STRAP BRASS .
22 TAPPING SADDLE 1|EA $511.73 $511.73|Ford $565.15 $565.15|Ford INo Bid
20"X1" DOUBLE STRAP BRASS .
23 TAPPING SADDLE 1|EA $511.73 $511.73|Ford $565.15 $565.15|Ford INo Bid
20"X11/2" DOUBLE STRAP BRASS .
24 TAPPING SADDLE 1|EA $511.73 $511.73|Ford $565.15 $565.15|Ford INo Bid




20"X2" DOUBLE STRAP BRASS

25 TAPPING SADDLE 1|EA $511.73 $511.73|Ford $565.15 $565.15|Ford No Bid
SUBTOTAL $7,434.77 SUBTOTAL $8,315.35 SUBTOTAL
ALL FITTINGS HAVE MINIMUM WORKING P.S.I. 250. NO LEAD
26|6" MJ PLUG 1|EA $23.18 $23.18 $21.80 $21.80| Tyler/Sigma INO Bid
2716" MJ CAP 1|EA $17.47 $17.47 $16.25 $16.25|Tyler/Sigma INo Bid
28(6" MJ 22-1/2 BEND 1|EA $32.26 $32.26 $30.15 $30.15| Tyler/Sigma INo Bid
29]6" MJ 45 BEND 1|EA $35.28 $35.28 $33.15 $33.15| Tyler/Sigma INo Bid
30(6" MJ 90 BEND 1|EA $43.34 $43.34 $40.75 $40.75| Tyler/Sigma INo Bid
31(6" X 12" DI SLEEVE 5|EA $39.31 $196.55 $36.90 $184.50| Tyler/Sigma INo Bid
32|6" X 24" ANCHOR COUPLING 1|EA $105.51 $105.51 $99.00 $99.00| Tyler/Sigma INo Bid
33|6" ANCHOR 90 1|EA $83.66 $83.66 $78.25 $78.25| Tyler/Sigma INo Bid
34|16 X6 X 6" MJ TEE 1|EA $62.83 $62.83 $59.05 $59.05| Tyler/Sigma INo Bid
35(8" MJ PLUG 2|EA $34.61 $69.22 $32.25 $64.50| Tyler/Sigma INo Bid
36(8" MJ CAP 2|EA $28.90 $57.80 $27.00 $54.00| Tyler/Sigma INo Bid
37(8"MJ 11-1/4 1|EA $45.70 $45.70 $42.90 $42.90| Tyler/Sigma INo Bid
38(8" MJ 22-1/2 BEND 1|EA $50.40 $50.40 $47.35 $47.35|Tyler/Sigma INo Bid
39|8" MJ 45 BEND 1|EA $51.41 $51.41 $48.05 $48.05| Tyler/Sigma INo Bid
40|8" MJ 90 BEND 1|EA $63.17 $63.17 $59.15 $59.15| Tyler/Sigma INo Bid
41|8 X 12" DI SLEEVE 1|EA $64.18 $64.18 $60.25 $60.25| Tyler/Sigma INo Bid
42|18 X8 X 8" MJ TEE 1|EA $94.42 $94.42 $88.25 $88.25| Tyler/Sigma INo Bid
43]12" MJ PLUG 2|EA $59.47 $118.94 $55.60 $111.20|Tyler/Sigma INo Bid
44]12" MJ CAP 2|EA $54.10 $108.20 $50.80 $101.60|Tyler/Sigma INo Bid
45(12" MJ 11-1/4 1|EA $91.73 $91.73 $86.25 $86.25| Tyler/Sigma INo Bid
46(12" 22-1/2 BEND 1|EA $97.78 $97.78 $91.40 $91.40| Tyler/Sigma INo Bid
47112" MJ 45 1|EA $111.89 $111.89 $104.50 $104.50| Tyler/Sigma INo Bid
48]12" MJ 90 BEND 1|EA $135.07 $135.07 $126.25 $126.25|Tyler/Sigma INo Bid
49]12" X 12" DI SLEEVE 15(EA $103.15 $1,547.25 $95.95 $1,439.25|Tyler/Sigma INo Bid
50]12" X 6" MJ TEE 1|EA $127.34 $127.34 $118.40 $118.40|Tyler/Sigma INo Bid
51(12" X 12 X 12" MJ TEE 1|EA $188.16 $188.16 $175.00 $175.00| Tyler/Sigma INo Bid
52]|12" X 6" MJ X FLANGE TEE 1|EA $168.00 $168.00 $156.25 $156.25|Tyler/Sigma INo Bid
53]16" x 15 INCH DI SLEEVE 1|EA $197.23 $197.23 $187.30 $187.30| Tyler/Sigma INo Bid
54116" DI SLEEVE 1|EA $182.45 $182.45 $187.30 $187.30| Tyler/Sigma INo Bid
55|18" X 15" INCH DI SLEEVE 1|EA $252.34 $252.34 $239.60 $239.60| Tyler/Sigma INO Bid
56|18 DI SLEEVE 1|EA $230.83 $230.83 $239.60 $239.60| Tyler/Sigma INo Bid
57|20 DI SLEEVE 1|EA $252.58 $252.58 $289.50 $289.50| Tyler/Sigma INo Bid
58]20" X 15" INCH DI SLEEVE 1|EA $304.75 $304.75 $289.50 $289.50| Tyler/Sigma INo Bid
59|24” DI SLEEVE 1|EA $374.91 $374.91 $381.05 $381.05|Tyler/Sigma INO Bid
60(24" X 15" INCH DI SLEEVE 1|EA $401.18 $401.18 $381.05 $381.05|Tyler/Sigma INo Bid
61(30” DI SLEEVE 1|EA $771.37 $771.37 $757.85 $757.85|Tyler/Sigma INo Bid
62(36” DI SLEEVE 1|EA $1,046.91 $1,046.91 $1,064.25 $1,064.25|Tyler/Sigma INo Bid
63(42” DI SLEEVE 1|EA $1,488.84 $1,488.84 $1,423.30 $1,423.30|Tyler/Sigma INo Bid
64(3" PVC MEGALUG 1|EA $15.38 $15.38 $13.75 $13.75|Tyler/Sigma INo Bid
65(6" PVC MEGALUG 20|EA $20.09 $401.80 $18.65 $373.00| Tyler/Sigma INo Bid
66(8" PVC MEGALUG 5|EA $29.71 $148.55 $27.65 $138.25|Tyler/Sigma INo Bid
67|12" PVC MEGALUG 30|EA $59.12 $1,773.60 $54.90 $1,647.00|Tyler/Sigma INo Bid
68|16" PVC MEGALUG 10(EA $131.46 $1,314.60 $121.95 $1,219.50( Tyler/Sigma INo Bid




69(20" PVC MEGALUG 5|EA $202.19 $1,010.95 $187.50 $937.50| Tyler/Sigma INO Bid
70{24" PVC MEGALUG 1[EA $233.51 $233.51 $212.25 $212.25|Tyler/Sigma INO Bid
71|30" DI MEGALUG 1[EA $553.17 $553.17 $502.50 $502.50( Tyler/Sigma INO Bid
72|36" DI MEGALUG 1[EA $707.62 $707.62 $643.00 $643.00| Tyler/Sigma INO Bid
3" MEGALUG ACCESSORY PACK . .
73| ESS GLAND 1{EA $22.75 $22.75 $7.00 $7.00| Tyler/Sigma INo Bid
4" MEGALUG ACCESSORY PACK . .
74| ESS GLAND 1{EA $24.48 $24.48 $8.25 $8.25| Tyler/Sigma INo Bid
6" MEGALUG ACCESSORY PACK . .
75| ESS GLAND 35(EA $30.64 $1,072.40 $11.25 $393.75|Tyler/Sigma INo Bid
8" MEGALUG ACCESSORY PACK . .
76|, ESS GLAND 10(EA $41.35 $413.50 $12.00 $120.00| Tyler/Sigma INo Bid
12" MEGALUG ACCESSORY PACK . .
77| ESS GLAND 40(EA $75.56 $3,022.40 $17.15 $686.00(Tyler/Sigma INo Bid
16" MEGALUG ACCESSORY PACK . .
78|, ESS GLAND 10(EA $155.67 $1,556.70 $27.50 $275.00| Tyler/Sigma INo Bid
18" MEGALUG ACCESSORY PACK . .
79|, ESS GLAND 1{EA $188.99 $188.99 $28.50 $28.50|Tyler/Sigma INo Bid
20" MEGALUG ACCESSORY PACK . .
80( EsS GLAND 5(EA $231.40 $1,157.00 $29.00 $145.00(Tyler/Sigma INo Bid
24" MEGALUG ACCESSORY PACK . .
81| ESS GLAND 1|EA $268.02 $268.02 $33.00 $33.00| Tyler/Sigma INo Bid
30" MEGALUG ACCESSORY PACK . .
82| ESS GLAND 1|EA $709.13 $709.13 $85.00 $85.00| Tyler/Sigma INo Bid
36" MEGALUG ACCESSORY PACK . I .
83|, £sS GLAND 4{EA $865.09 $3,460.36 $100.00 $400.00|Tyler/Sigma |No Bid
84(3" HYMAX DRESSER COUPLING 1{EA $122.53 $122.53|HYMAX $105.50 $105.50|HYMAX $158.11 $158.11|Krausz
85(4" HYMAX DRESSER COUPLING 2|EA $158.89 $317.78|HYMAX $143.60 $287.20|HYMAX $202.59 $405.18|Krausz
86(6" HYMAX DRESSER COUPLING 1{EA $347.91 $347.91|HYMAX $188.25 $188.25|HYMAX $268.31 $268.31|Krausz
87(8" HYMAX DRESSER COUPLING 2|EA $370.45 $740.90|HYMAX $212.50 $425.00|HYMAX $302.92 $605.84|Krausz
4" MJ RESTRAINT WITH . .
88| ACCESSORIES 1{EA $21.29 $21.29 $21.05 $21.05|Tyler/Sigma INo Bid
6" MJ RESTRAINT WITH . .
89 ACCESSORIES 1|EA $26.32 $26.32 $25.50 $25.50| Tyler/Sigma INo Bid
8" MJ DI RETRAINT WITH . .
90| ACCESSORIES 1|EA $35.85 $35.85 $33.95 $33.95| Tyler/Sigma INo Bid
91(2" STAINLESS REPAIR COUPLING 3|EA $33.50 $100.50 $44.65 $133.95|SmithBlair INO Bid
92(4" STAINLESS REPAIR COUPLING 1{EA $60.58 $60.58 $60.10 $60.10(SmithBlair INO Bid
6" X 15 INCH FULL CIRCLE REPAIR . . .
93|cLaMP 1|EA $92.07 $92.07 $94.05 $94.05|SmithBlair INo Bid
8" X 15 INCH FULL CIRCLE REPAIR . . .
94 CLAMP 1[EA $112.02 $112.02 $114.45 $114.45|SmithBlair INO Bid
8" X 15 INCH AC FULL CIRCLE . . .
95 AMP 1|EA $112.02 $112.02 $115.30 $115.30|SmithBlair INo Bid
12" X 15 INCH FULL CIRCLE . . .
96 REPAIR CLAMP 1[EA $171.19 $171.19 $174.85 $174.85|SmithBlair INo Bid
97(3" FLANGE ACCESSORY PACK 45|EA $3.22 $144.90 $3.40 $153.00|EGW INO Bid
98(4' FLANGE ACCESSORY PACK 1[EA $5.32 $5.32 $5.60 $5.60|EGW INO Bid
99(6" FLANGE ACCESSORY PACK 1[EA $8.05 $8.05 $8.50 $8.50|EGW INO Bid
100|8" FLANGE ACCESSORY PACK 1[EA $9.14 $9.14 $9.65 $9.65|EGW INO Bid
101|12" FLANGE ACCESSORY PACK 1{EA $18.51 $18.51 $19.50 $19.50(EGW INO Bid
102(10" MJ ACCESSORY SET 1{EA $13.95 $13.95 $19.65 $19.65| Tyler/Sigma INO Bid




103|3/4" MIP X COMP 10|EA $11.16 $111.60 $12.85 $128.50|Ford INO Bid
104(3/4" FIP X COMP 20(EA $11.74 $234.80 $13.55 $271.00|Ford INO Bid
105(3/4" COMP TEE 5[EA $32.90 $164.50 $37.95 $189.75|Ford INO Bid
106|3/4" COMP X COMP 30[EA $13.60 $408.00 $15.70 $471.00|Ford INO Bid
107(3/4" CC CORP 15[EA $28.69 $430.35 $28.10 $421.50|Ford INO Bid
108(3/4" IP CORP 5[EA $28.69 $143.45 $28.10 $140.50|Ford INO Bid
109(3/4" ANGLE STOP KEY TYPE 65|EA $29.64 $1,926.60 $34.20 $2,223.00|Ford INO Bid
110(3/4" STRAIGHT STOP 15[EA $29.84 $447.60 $38.70 $580.50|Ford INO Bid
111|3/4" COMP 90 5|EA $17.58 $87.90 $20.25 $101.25|Ford INO Bid
112(3/4" POLY INSERT 20(EA $1.06 $21.20 $0.75 $15.00|[EGW INO Bid
113|3/4" BRASS TEE 1|EA $3.73 $3.73 $3.65 $3.65|Merit INO Bid
114(3/4" BRASS COUPLING 2|EA $2.45 $4.90 $2.50 $5.00|Merit INO Bid
115|3/4" BRASS 90 1|EA $3.04 $3.04 $3.05 $3.05|Merit INO Bid
116(3/4" IP BRASS PLUG 5|EA $1.77 $8.85 $1.80 $9.00|Merit INO Bid
117(3/4" CC BRASS PLUG 5|EA $5.72 $28.60 $6.85 $34.25|Merit INO Bid
118(3/4" X CLOSE NIPPLE 1|EA $1.55 $1.55 $1.40 $1.40|Merit INO Bid
119(3/4" X 4 INCH BRASS NIPPLE 1|EA $3.39 $3.39 $3.00 $3.00|Merit INO Bid
120(3/4" X 6 INCH BRASS NIPPLE 1|EA $4.95 $4.95 $4.30 $4.30[Merit INO Bid
121(3/4" BALL CORP GRIP JOINT NUT 7[EA $36.03 $252.21 $54.65 $382.55|Ford INO Bid
122(3/4" X 1 INCH COMP TEE 1|EA $35.05 $35.05 $40.45 $40.45|Ford INO Bid
123(3/4" NYLON WASHER 1|EA $0.18 $0.18 $0.15 $0.15 INO Bid
124(3/4" ANGLE STOP BALL TYPE 20(EA $70.18 $1,403.60 $38.15 $763.00|Ford INO Bid
125/|1" MIP X COMP 10|EA $13.23 $132.30 $15.25 $152.50|Ford INO Bid
126|1" FIP X COMP 10|EA $15.94 $159.40 $18.40 $184.00|Ford INO Bid
127|1" COMP TEE 1|EA $35.22 $35.22 $40.65 $40.65|Ford INO Bid
128|1" COMP X COMP 50(EA $15.55 $777.50 $17.95 $897.50|Ford INO Bid
129|1" CC CORP 45|EA $43.38 $1,952.10 $42.50 $1,912.50|Ford INO Bid
130|1" IP CORP 5|EA $43.38 $216.90 $42.50 $212.50|Ford INO Bid
131|1" ANGLE STOP KEY TYPE 170(EA $40.57 $6,896.90 $46.80 $7,956.00|Ford INO Bid
132|1" STRAIGHT STOP 5|EA $66.50 $332.50 $87.60 $438.00|Ford INO Bid
133|1" COMP 90 5|EA $22.57 $112.85 $26.05 $130.25|Ford INO Bid
134|1" POLY INSERT 30[EA $1.12 $33.60 $0.90 $27.00|[EGW INO Bid
135|1" BRASS TEE 1|EA $6.63 $6.63 $6.50 $6.50|Merit INO Bid
136|1" BRASS COUPLING 5|EA $3.73 $18.65 $3.75 $18.75|Merit INO Bid
137|1" BRASS 90 1|EA $4.68 $4.68 $10.50 $10.50|Merit INO Bid
138|1" IP BRASS PLUG 15[EA $2.35 $35.25 $2.35 $35.25|Merit INO Bid
139|1" CC BRASS PLUG 15[EA $9.34 $140.10 $10.20 $153.00|Merit INO Bid
140|1" X CLOSE BRASS NIPPLE 1|EA $2.28 $2.28 $2.05 $2.05|Merit INO Bid
141|1" X 4 INCH BRASS NIPPLE 1|EA $4.91 $4.91 $4.10 $4.10|Merit INO Bid
142|1" X 6 INCH BRASS NIPPLE 2|EA $7.23 $14.46 $6.30 $12.60|Merit INO Bid
143(1" X 1/2 INCH IP BRASS BUSHING 1|EA $2.45 $2.45 $2.75 $2.75|Merit INO Bid
144(1" X 3/4 INCH IP BUSHING 20|EA $2.45 $49.00 $2.75 $55.00|Merit INO Bid
145(1" X 3/4 INCH CC BUSHING 1|EA $9.38 $9.38 $27.00 $27.00|Merit INO Bid
146(1" X 3/4 INCH COMP TEE 1|EA $36.14 $36.14 $41.20 $41.20|Ford INO Bid
147|1" BALL CORP GRIP JOINT NUT 70|EA $47.38 $3,316.60 $54.65 $3,825.50|Ford INO Bid
148|1" NYLON WASHER 1|EA $0.37 $0.37 $0.20 $0.20 INO Bid
149|1" CORP NYLON WASHER 1|EA $0.37 $0.37 $1.50 $1.50|Ford INO Bid




150|1" ANGLE STOP BALL TYPE 1|EA $84.81 $84.81 $97.85 $97.85|Ford INO Bid
151(1-1/2" MIP X COMP 1|EA $36.22 $36.22 $41.80 $41.80|Ford INO Bid
152(1-1/2" FIP X COMP 1|EA $46.33 $46.33 $53.45 $53.45|Ford INO Bid
153(1-1/2" COMP TEE 1|EA $78.52 $78.52 $90.60 $90.60|Ford INO Bid
154(1-1/2" COMP X COMP 1|EA $52.04 $52.04 $60.05 $60.05|Ford INO Bid
155(1-1/2" CC CORP 1|EA $106.19 $106.19 $122.50 $122.50|Ford INO Bid
156(1-1/2" IP CORP 1|EA $106.19 $106.19 $122.50 $122.50|Ford INO Bid
157(1-1/2" ANGLE STOP 10|EA $195.64 $1,956.40 $225.75 $2,257.50|Ford INO Bid
158(1-1/2" STRAIGHT STOP 1|EA $144.85 $144.85 $156.60 $156.60|Ford INO Bid
159(1-1/2" COMP 90 1|EA $72.47 $72.47 $83.65 $83.65|Ford INO Bid
160(1-1/2" POLY INSERT 1|EA $1.55 $1.55 $1.50 $1.50|EGW INO Bid
161(1-1/2" BRASS TEE 1|EA $12.79 $12.79 $12.75 $12.75|Merit INO Bid
162(1-1/2" BRASS COUPLING 1|EA $7.92 $7.92 $8.15 $8.15[Merit INO Bid
163|1-1/2" BRASS 90 1|EA $9.29 $9.29 $13.15 $13.15|Merit INO Bid
164(1-1/2" IP BRASS PLUG 1|EA $4.44 $4.44 $5.90 $5.90(Merit INO Bid
165(1-1/2" CC BRASS PLUG 1|EA $22.57 $22.57 $26.90 $26.90|Merit INO Bid
166|1-1/2" X CLOSE BRASS NIPPLE 1|EA $4.67 $4.67 $3.95 $3.95|Merit INO Bid
167(1-1/2" X 4 INCH BRASS NIPPLE 1|EA $8.61 $8.61 $7.65 $7.65|Merit INO Bid
168[1-1/2" X 6 INCH BRASS NIPPLE 1|EA $12.72 $12.72 $11.05 $11.05|Merit INO Bid
169|1_1/2" X 3/4 INCH BRASS BUSHING 1|EA $6.53 $6.53 $6.50 $6.50(Merit No Bid
170(1-1/2" X 1 INCH BRASS BUSHING 1|EA $5.35 $5.35 $6.00 $6.00|Merit INO Bid
171|2" MIP X COMP 20(EA $52.77 $1,055.40 $60.90 $1,218.00|Ford INO Bid
172|2" FIP X COMP 10|EA $55.16 $551.60 $63.65 $636.50|Ford INO Bid
173|2" COMP X COMP 10|EA $70.26 $702.60 $81.05 $810.50|Ford INO Bid
174|2" CC CORP 10|EA $175.62 $1,756.20 $202.65 $2,026.50|Ford INO Bid
175|2" IP CORP 5|EA $175.62 $878.10 $202.65 $1,013.25|Ford INO Bid
176|2" ANGLE STOP 35|EA $248.35 $8,692.25 $286.60 $10,031.00(Ford INO Bid
177|2" STRAIGHT STOP 5|EA $201.38 $1,006.90 $265.30 $1,326.50|Ford INO Bid
178(2" COMP 90 1|EA $146.84 $146.84 $169.20 $169.20|Ford INO Bid
179|2" POLY INSERT 20(EA $1.55 $31.00 $1.60 $32.00|[EGW INO Bid
180|2" BRASS TEE 1|EA $20.95 $20.95 $21.10 $21.10|Merit INO Bid
181|2" BRASS COUPLING 15[EA $13.05 $195.75 $12.85 $192.75|Merit INO Bid
182(2" BRASS 90 5|EA $15.13 $75.65 $15.25 $76.25|Merit INO Bid
183|2" IP BRASS PLUG 5|EA $7.00 $35.00 $6.90 $34.50|Merit INO Bid
184|2" CC BRASS PLUG 5|EA $38.66 $193.30 $24.75 $123.75|Merit INO Bid
185|2" X CLOSE BRASS NIPPLE 10(EA $6.80 $68.00 $6.05 $60.50|Merit INO Bid
186|2" X 4 INCH BRASS NIPPLE 10|EA $11.08 $110.80 $9.80 $98.00|Merit INO Bid
187|2" X 6 INCH BRASS NIPPLE 10|EA $16.36 $163.60 $14.35 $143.50|Merit INO Bid
188(2" BALL CORP GRIP JOINT NUT 1|EA $175.62 $175.62 $202.65 $202.65|Ford INO Bid
189(2" X 3/4 INCH IP BUSHING 1|EA $9.55 $9.55 $9.50 $9.50(Merit INO Bid
190|2" X 3/4 INCH CC BUSHING 1|EA $41.45 $41.45 $24.85 $24.85|Merit INO Bid
191(2" X 1-1/2 IP BUSHING 2|EA $7.92 $15.84 $7.80 $15.60|Merit INO Bid
192|2" X 12 INCH BRASS NIPPLE 5|EA $32.24 $161.20 $27.95 $139.75|Merit INO Bid
193|2" X 1 INCH IP BRASS BUSHING 1|EA $9.55 $9.55 $9.60 $9.60|Merit INO Bid
194|2" NYLON WASHER 1|EA $1.77 $1.77 $1.10 $1.10 INO Bid
195 8 X 15 AC FULL CIRCLE CLAMP 1|EA $112.89 $112.89 $114.05 $114.05|SmithBlair No Bid

W/STAIN BOLTS & LUGS




12 X 15 CI FULL CIRCLE CLAMP . . )
196 WI/STAIN BOLTS & LUGS 1|EA $171.19 $171.19 $172.95 $172.95|SmithBlair INo Bid
16 X 24 Cl FULL CIRCLE CLAMP . . )
197 W/STAIN BOLTS & LUGS 1|EA $697.29 $697.29 $690.10 $690.10|SmithBlair INo Bid
6 X 15 Cl FULL CIRCLE CLAMP . . )
198 W/STAIN B OLTS & LUGS 1|EA $102.60 $102.60 $102.65 $102.65|SmithBlair INo Bid
6 X 15 AC FULL CIRCLE CLAMP . . )
199 W/STAIN BOLTS & LUGS 1|EA $102.60 $102.60 $93.05 $93.05|SmithBlair INo Bid
8 X 15 CI FULL CIRCLE CLAMP . . )
200 W/STAIN BOLTS & LUGS 1|EA $112.89 $112.89 $94.05 $94.05|SmithBlair No Bid
SUBTOTAL $70,005.30 SUBTOTAL $63,653.35 SUBTOTAL _
philmac UTC Fittings Acceptable brands are Philmac and Harco
201|6” CL200 PVC DR 14-GSK BLUE 12|20' PIECE $98.60 $1,183.20 $96.40 $1,156.80|Diamond INo Bid
202|8” CL200 PVC DR 14-GSK BLUE 12|20' PIECE $170.40 $2,044.80 $165.60 $1,987.20|Diamond INo Bid
203|12" CL150 PVC DR 18-GSK BLUE 12|20' PIECE $361.20 $4,334.40 $281.60 $3,379.20|Diamond INo Bid
204]16” CL150 PVC DR 18 —-GSK BLUE 6|20' PIECE $570.40 $3,422.40 $643.00 $3,858.00|Diamond INo Bid
205|18” CL150 PVC DR18-GSK BLUE 4|20' PIECE $735.40 $2,941.60 $810.00 $3,240.00|Diamond INo Bid
206|20" CL150 PVC DR18-GSK BLUE 4|20' PIECE $936.00 $3,744.00 $993.00 $3,972.00|Diamond INo Bid
207|24” CL150 PVC DR18 — GSK BLUE 2|20' PIECE $1,479.20 $2,958.40 $1,483.00 $2,966.00|Diamond INo Bid
208|30" DUCTILE IRON PIPE 2|20' PIECE $1,878.80 $3,757.60 $2,025.00 $4,050.00|American INo Bid
209|36" DUCTILE IRON PIPE 2|20' PIECE $2,606.20 $5,212.40 $2,745.00 $5,490.00|American INo Bid
210]|¥ COPPER TUBING “K” 1/100' ROLL $368.00 $368.00 $361.25 $361.25|Mueller $357.00 $357.00|Mueller
211|1” COPPER TUBING “K" 1/100' ROLL $479.00 $479.00 $470.05 $470.05|Mueller $464.52 $464.52|Mueller
212|1-1/2 COPPER TUBING “K” 1/100' ROLL $750.00 $750.00 $735.68 $735.68|Mueller $727.02 $727.02|Mueller
213|2" COPPER TUBING “K” 1/100' ROLL $1,191.00 $1,191.00 $1,186.18 $1,186.18|Mueller $1,172.22| $1,172.22|Mueller
3/4” Poly Pipe 200 PSI Rating \ )
214 ENDOTRACE 10{100' ROLL $92.00 $920.00 $91.30 $913.00|EGW INo Bid
1” Poly Pipe 200 PSI Rating i I )
215 ENDOTRACE 30({100' ROLL $106.00 $3,180.00 $104.60 $3,138.00(EGW No Bid
1 %" Poly Pipe 200 PSI Rating . I .
216 ENDOTRACE 1/100' ROLL $172.00 $172.00 $148.50 $148.50|EGW No Bid
2" Poly Pipe 200 PSI Rating . .
217 ENDOTRACE 5/100' ROLL $264.00 $1,320.00 $264.00 $1,320.00(EGW INo Bid
218|PLASTIC PIPE WRAP 29"x200’ 8 mil 15|ROLLS $107.13 $1,606.95 $115.65 $1,734.75|EGW No Bid
219|BLACK PLASTIC TAPE 5|CASES $94.08 $470.40 $4.25 $21.25|EGW $9.51 $47.55|Proselect
220|1-1/4" 2 BOLT DRESSER 2|EA $20.07 $40.14 $19.65 $39.30|SmithBlair INo Bid
221(1-1/2" 2 BOLT DRESSER 2|EA $23.97 $47.94 $23.50 $47.00|SmithBlair INo Bid
222]2" 2 BOLT DRESSER 15|EA $27.16 $407.40 $29.65 $444.75|SmithBlair No Bid
SUBTOTAL $40,551.63 SUBTOTAL $40,658.91 SUBTOTAL _
Philmac UTC Fittings Acceptable brands are Philmac and Harco
223|Size B 10|EA $31.99 $319.90|HARCO $13.65 $136.50|HARCO INo Bid
224|Size C 10|EA $41.60 $416.00|HARCO $20.00 $200.00|HARCO INo Bid
225|Size D 10|EA $43.45 $434.50|HARCO $24.95 $249.50|HARCO INo Bid
226|Size E 5|EA $40.37 $201.85|HARCO $23.50 $117.50|HARCO INo Bid
227|Size F 5|EA $62.79 $313.95|HARCO $36.90 $184.50|HARCO INo Bid
228|Size G 5|EA $72.07 $360.35|HARCO $43.85 $219.25|HARCO INo Bid
229|Size C to Size B 5|EA $36.15 $180.75|HARCO $19.95 $99.75|HARCO INo Bid
230]Size D to Size C 5|EA $65.08 $325.40|HARCO $37.85 $189.25|HARCO INo Bid
231|Size E to Size D 5|EA No Bid No Bid $23.40 $117.00|HARCO INo Bid




232|Size Fto Size E 5|EA $85.08 $425.40|HARCO $49.50 $247.50|HARCO INO Bid
SUBTOTAL $2,978.10 SUBTOTAL $1,760.75 |SUBTOTAL
SEWER MAINTENANCE
233 éA'OHIG(CZI;;EA_IﬁENHOLE RISER 40|EA $14.44 $577.60 $16.25 $650.00|Turner INO Bid
234 ?é(g&(CzF’;EAQNHOLE RISER 40|EA $18.31 $732.40 $21.05 $842.00|Turner INO Bid
235 zzéli(czééﬂéNHOLE RISER 40|EA $21.76 $870.40 $21.05 $842.00|Turner INO Bid
236(4” SDR 35 PVC PIPE (GREEN) 25|14' PIECE $14.14 $353.50 $11.34 $283.50|Diamond INo Bid
237(6” SDR 35 PVC PIPE (GREEN) 12|14' PIECE $31.08 $372.96 $24.36 $292.32|Diamond INo Bid
238(8” SDR 35 PVC PIPE (GREEN) 7(14' PIECE $55.86 $391.02 $43.54 $304.78|Diamond INo Bid
239(10” SDR 35 PVC PIPE (GREEN) 7(14' PIECE $87.50 $612.50 $68.32 $478.24|Diamond INo Bid
240(12" SDR 35 PVC PIPE (GREEN) 7|14' PIECE $125.72 $880.04 $98.00 $686.00|Diamond INo Bid
241|15" SDR 35 PVC PIPE (GREEN) 7|14' PIECE $186.62 $1,306.34 $145.88 $1,021.16|Diamond INo Bid
242(4” SLIP COUPLING (GASKET) 50|EA $7.41 $370.50 $7.65 $382.50|Plastic trends INO Bid
243(6” SLIP COUPLING (GASKET) 10(EA $14.81 $148.10 $15.65 $156.50|Plastic trends INO Bid
2448 SLIP COUPLING (GASKET) 10(EA $26.16 $261.60 $26.25 $262.50|Plastic trends INO Bid
245|10" SLIP COUPLING (GASKET) 10(EA $55.82 $558.20 $58.50 $585.00|Plastic trends INO Bid
246|6 X 4 TEE SDR 35 (GASKET) 5|EA $20.38 $101.90 $21.05 $105.25|Plastic trends INO Bid
247|8 X 4 TEE SDR 35 (GASKET) 5|EA $31.45 $157.25 $32.85 $164.25|Plastic trends INO Bid
248(10 X 4 TEE SDR 35 (GASKET) 5|EA $102.29 $511.45 $106.75 $533.75|Plastic trends INO Bid
249(4” GLUE COUPLING 50|EA $1.45 $72.50 $1.60 $80.00(Plastic trends INO Bid
250(4” SLIP 22 (GASKET) 50|EA $6.00 $300.00 $6.40 $320.00|Plastic trends INO Bid
251(4” SLIP 45 (GASKET) 50|EA $6.00 $300.00 $6.40 $320.00|Plastic trends INO Bid
252(4” SLIP STREET 22 (GASKET) 50|EA $5.71 $285.50 $6.05 $302.50|Plastic trends INO Bid
253(4” GLUE STREET 22 50|EA $2.96 $148.00 $3.25 $162.50|Plastic trends INO Bid
254(4” SLIP STREET 45 (GASKET) 50|EA $5.40 $270.00 $5.60 $280.00|Plastic trends INO Bid
255(4” GLUE STREET 45 50|EA $2.96 $148.00 $3.15 $157.50|Plastic trends INO Bid
256(4X4 SDR 35 WYE 50|EA $10.35 $517.50 $10.80 $540.00|Plastic trends INO Bid
257(SDR35 X SCH 40 REDUCER 40|EA $3.68 $147.20 $3.95 $158.00|Plastic trends INO Bid
258(15X4 RUBBER TEE (SADDLE) 20|EA $24.23 $484.60 $25.00 $500.00|Plastic trends INO Bid
259(15X4 RUBBER WYE (SADDLE) 10(EA $28.56 $285.60 $30.15 $301.50|Plastic trends Ino Bid
260(4” PVC PLUG 30|EA $2.93 $87.90 $3.05 $91.50(Plastic trends $2.88 $86.40(Charlotte
261(6" PVC PLUG 20|EA $4.48 $89.60 $4.85 $97.00|Plastic trends $9.06 $181.20|Charlotte
262(8” PVC PLUG 20|EA $15.89 $317.80 $16.75 $335.00|Plastic trends $34.79 $695.80|Charlotte
263|4" EXPANDABLE PLUG 2|EA $5.16 $10.32 $5.25 $10.50(Chane $7.73 $15.46|Charlotte
26416”" EXPANDABLE PLUG 2|EA $13.97 $27.94 $15.15 $30.30({Chane $21.42 $42.84|Charlotte
265(8" EXPANDABLE PLUG 2|EA $26.58 $53.16 $27.75 $55.50(Chane $40.75 $81.50(Charlotte
266|10" EXPANDABLE PLUG 2|EA $227.21 $454.42 $215.50 $431.00|Chane INo Bid
267|CAST IRON CLEAN OUT 40|EA $227.73 $9,109.20 $42.25 $1,690.00(Sigma INo Bid
268|CAST IRON CLEAN OUT LID 40|EA $25.51 $1,020.40 $18.50 $740.00|Sigma INo Bid
269(4” RUBBER CAP 50|EA $2.68 $134.00 $2.95 $147.50|Fernco $3.07 $153.50|Proflo
270|4" PVC-PVC CT ADAPTER 100|EA $3.21 $321.00 $3.50 $350.00|Fernco $4.87 $487.00|Fernco
271|4" PVC-CLAY CT ADAPTER 50|EA $3.21 $160.50 $3.50 $175.00|Fernco $4.87 $243.50|Fernco
272|6" PVC-PVC CT ADAPTER 50|EA $6.85 $342.50 $7.05 $352.50|Fernco $10.42 $521.00|Fernco
273|6" PVC-CLAY CT ADAPTER 50|EA $6.85 $342.50 $7.05 $352.50|Fernco $10.42 $521.00|Fernco
27418" PVC-PVC CT ADAPTER 20|EA $10.55 $211.00 $11.00 $220.00|Fernco $16.03 $320.60(|Fernco




275(8” PVC-CLAY CT ADAPTER 20|EA $10.55 $211.00 $11.00 $220.00(Fernco $16.03|  $320.60|Fernco
276(10” PVC-PVC CT ADAPTER 20|EA $15.83 $316.60 $16.50 $330.00(Fernco $24.06|  $481.20|Fernco
277|10” PVC-CLAY CT ADAPTER 20|EA $15.83 $316.60 $16.50 $330.00(Fernco $24.06|  $481.20|Fernco
278|12” PVC-PVC CT ADAPTER 20|EA $18.47 $369.40 $19.95 $399.00(Fernco $28.08|  $561.60|Fernco
279(12” PVC-CLAY ADAPTER 10|EA $18.47 $184.70 $19.95 $199.50(Fernco $28.08|  $280.80|Fernco
7-5/16" X 3-1/2" VALVE BOX COVER )
280\ REUSE WATER LOGO 50|EA $27.88 $1,394.00 $25.75 $1,287.50|B&H INo Bid
281(24” 300 LB MANHOLE LID 15|EA $159.37 $2,390.55 $84.45 $1,266.75|Sigma INo Bid
282(24” 400 LB MANHOLE LID 15|EA $196.44 $2,946.60 $114.15 $1,712.25|Sigma INo Bid
283[24” 300 LB MANHOLE RING 15|EA $175.91 $2,638.65 $105.50 $1,582.50|Sigma INo Bid
284(24” 400 LB MANHOLE RING 15|EA $195.23 $2,928.45 $131.85 $1,977.75|Sigma INo Bid
285(24” 300 LB MANHOLE RING & LID 15|EA $335.29 $5,029.35 $186.50 $2,797.50|Sigma INo Bid
286(24” 400 LB MANHOLE RING & LID 15|EA $391.67 $5,875.05 $244.55 $3,668.25|Sigma INo Bid
30" 400 LB HINGED MANHOLE, BH )
287|120 WILOGO 15|EA $398.79 $5,981.85 $407.50 $6,112.50|B&H INo Bid
288 S\f/Lg'ggED MANHOLE LID PAMREX 15(EA $596.81 $8,952.15 $619.50 $9,292.50|Jim Cax INo Bid
2gg|JET PLUG CEMENT - 5 GALLON 100|EA $37.00 $3,700.00 $27.75 $2,775.00|Sigma No Bid
BUCKETS
290|HTH GRANULAR 5 LBS. 50|EA $11.95 $597.50 $12.25 $612.50|EGW INo Bid
291|TRACING DYE -GREEN 160z 10|EA $21.82 $218.20 $24.39 $243.90(Norlab INo Bid
Manhole Cover Bolts, 1/2" X 2" SS i .
292|L/HEAD BOLT F/ EV1420D/WT 100|EA $2.39 $239.00 $2.45 $245.00|Sigma No Bid
293|1/2" SS 304 FLT WASHER 100|EA $1.49 $149.00 $1.55 $155.00|Sigma Ino Bid
SUBTOTAL $68,285.55 SUBTOTAL $50,997.45 [SUBTOTAL _
METER MAINTENANCE
294 iEl//j) METER FLANGE SET -NO 30|EA $44.33 $1,329.90 $50.50 $1,515.00 INo Bid
295|2" METER FLANGE SET /NO LEAD 90|EA $45.88 $4,129.20 $60.75 $5,467.50 INo Bid
3,
296 ﬁOSIER:leGHT METER COUPLING/ 30(EA $8.76 $262.80|Ford $8.36 $250.80|Ford $9.72 $291.60(|Jones/Stephens
297 ,{IOSIEQI'DGHT METER COUPLING/ 2100(EA $13.02 $27,342.00|Ford $12.88 $27,048.00|Ford $7.94| $16,674.00|Jones/Stephens
% “X7" METER RISER / NO )
298| LA D/BALL VALVES 1|EA $73.42 $73.42|Ford $77.13 $77.13|Ford INo Bid
%, “X15” METER RISER /NO )
299 E A D/BALL VALVES 1|EA $79.71 $79.71|Ford $84.24 $84.24|Ford INo Bid
1"X10" METER RISER / NO )
300|, £ AD/BALL VALVES 1|EA $151.92 $151.92|Ford $171.51 $171.51|Ford INo Bid
1"X12" METER RISER /NO )
301|, CAD/BALL VALVES 1|EA $155.01 $155.01|Ford $175.00 $175.00|Ford INo Bid
1"X18” METER RISER /NO )
302(, A D/BALL VALVES 1|EA $180.90 $180.90|Ford $171.50 $171.50|Ford INo Bid
1-1/2"X18” METER RISER / NO )
303|, CAD/BALL VALVES 1|EA $970.11 $970.11|Ford $740.70 $740.70|Ford INo Bid
304[14"X18" PLASTIC METER BOX 350(EA $53.06 $18,571.00| DFW $82.65 $28,927.50| DFW INo Bid
DFW-18AMRBLSBD-LID — SERIES F
305|12"X1-1/2" ID 11-3/8", OD 12-3/8" — 350|EA $29.00 $10,150.00(DFW $29.60 $10,360.00|DFW No Bid
Proread Plastic
306|18”X24" METER BOX 35|EA $191.34 $6,696.90( DFW $97.40 $3,409.00|DFW INo Bid




DFW-CILTR-LID SERIES F 20" X 1-

|No Bid

307|1/2" ID 19-1/4”, OD 20" — Proread Cast 35|EA $80.30 $2,810.50|DFW $82.05 $2,871.75|DFW
Iron
308 2-1/2" FIRE HYDRANT METER 100(EA $0.84 $84.00 $1.60 $160.00 INO Bid
GASKET
309|1-1/2" METER GASKETS 150|EA $0.59 $88.50 $0.48 $72.00 INo Bid
310(2” METER GASKETS 300(EA $0.69 $207.00 $0.60 $180.00 INo Bid
311(%" METER GASKETS 1600|EA $0.07 $112.00 $0.12 $192.00 INo Bid
312(1" METER GASKETS 4000(EA $0.09 $360.00 $0.14 $560.00 INo Bid
313|ADAPTER A34 / NO LEAD 5|EA $15.77 $78.85 $21.35 $106.75|Ford INo Bid
2-1/2" HEX BOLT W/NUT SET / . .
314 GRADE A ZINC/ NO LEAD 750(EA $2.03 $1,522.50 $0.58 $435.00|Sigma INO Bid
2" DOUBLE CHECK VALVE WATTS
315(007M1QT2 (DOUBLE CHECK VALVE, 200(EA $272.98 $54,596.00|Watts $262.05 $52,410.00|Watts $307.79| $61,558.00|Watts
BACKFLOW PREVENT) NO LEAD
2" DOUBLE CHECK VALVE WATTS
316(G2839112 (REDUCED PRESSURE 1 $379.37 $379.37|Watts $364.25 $364.25|Watts $427.74 $427.74|Watts
ZONE BACKFLOW PREVENTOR)
Brooks Barrel Lock w/cap and weather
317|seal-hardened steel "F" - P/N 6830000 500(EA $4.15 $2,075.00(Brooks $2.56 $1,280.00|Brooks INo Bid
1
318 ?g?g'g;eia”e' Lock Key w/ loop ring 15|EA $35.83 $537.45|Brooks $42.50 $637.50|Brooks Ino sia
a19| "t 007 DOUble Check Valve Repalr | 150/ea $7207|  $10,81050|Watts $72.85|  $10,927.50|Watts $85.71| $12,856.50|Watts
30| Vatts 007M1 Double Check Valve 150|EA $98.50 $14,775.00|Watts $99.50 $14,925.00|Watts $117.12| $17,568.00|Watts
Repair Kits. 0887192
321|5/8" X 1/16" METER GASKETS 100(EA $0.06 $6.00 $0.10 $10.00 |No Bid
322(1" X 1/6" METER GASKETS 100(EA $0.09 $9.00 $0.12 $12.00 INO Bid
DFW36C-5BA-LID "REUSE WATER" - I
32315 9/16" X 10 3/16" X 1 7/8" - 1(EA $42.72 $42.72|DFW $45.65 $45.65(DFW No Bid
PLASTIC
DFW36C5-12-BODY - 18 7/8" X 13 .
324 3/4" X 12 - PLASTIC 1{EA $45.45 $45.45|DFW $48.50 $48.50(DFW INo Bid
DFW1730F-5BA-LID "REUSE
325|WATER" - 29 1/2" X 16 13/16" X 2" - 1{EA $87.67 $87.67|DFW $93.65 $93.65(DFW INo Bid
PLASTIC
DFW1/30F5-18-BODY - 37" X 25 .
326|3/16" X 18 3/4" - PLASTIC 1|EA $150.73 $150.73|DFW $161.00 $161.00|DFW INO Bid
SUBTOTAL $158,871.11 SUBTOTAL $163,890.43 SUBTOTAL
Grand Total $348,126.46 Grand Total $329,276.24 Grand Total
Award Total $206,857.51 Award Total $116,411.55 Award Total NA
Manufacturer/ Brand % Discount Ford 10%
Manufacturer/ Brand % Discount Smith-Blair 5%
Manufacturer/ Brand % Discount EGW 10%
Manufacturer/ Brand % Discount Tyler/Sigma 15%

Manufacturer/ Brand % Discount

HYMAX

10%
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