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1 6X1 BRONZE TAPPING SADDLE 5 EA $38.40 $192.00 5 8 AYMCDONALD $88.38 $441.90 5 8 FORD $92.00 $460.00 10 10 ford

2 8X1 BRONZE TAPPING SADDLE 10 EA $52.75 $527.50 5 4 AYMCDONALD $109.96 $1,099.60 5 350 FORD $114.00 $1,140.00 10 200 ford

3 12X1 BRONZE TAPPING SADDLE 5 EA $130.25 $651.25 5 2 AYMCDONALD $158.60 $793.00 5 20 FORD $165.00 $825.00 10 50 ford

4 6" PVC MEGALUG 30 EA $24.45 $733.50 2 60 TYLER UNION $23.29 $698.70 5 128 STAR-PIPE $22.30 $669.00 10 200 ford/star

5 6" MEGALUG ACCESSORY PACK LESS GLAND 30 EA $12.85 $385.50 2 120 TRI-PAC $18.61 $558.30 5 171 STAR-PIPE $9.00 $270.00 10 200 egw/star

6 8" PVC MEGALUG 20 EA $35.80 $716.00 2 60 TYLER UNION $34.45 $689.00 5 1216 STAR-PIPE $33.00 $660.00 10 300 ford-star

7 8" MEGALUG ACCESSORY PACK LESS GLAND 20 EA $14.10 $282.00 2 120 TRI-PAC $27.98 $559.60 5 117 STAR-PIPE $10.50 $210.00 10 300 star-egw

8 12" PVC MEGALUG 30 EA $69.70 $2,091.00 2 60 TYLER UNION $68.54 $2,056.20 5 338 STAR-PIPE $58.50 $1,755.00 10 100 ford-star

9 12" MEGALUG ACCESSORY PACK LESS GLAND 30 EA $18.75 $562.50 2 50 TRI-PAC $60.41 $1,812.30 5 8 STAR-PIPE $14.40 $432.00 10 100 star-egw

10 3/4" CC CORP 30 EA $25.85 $775.50 4 20 AYMCDONALD $27.75 $832.50 5 13 FORD $28.50 $855.00 10 182 ford

11 3/4" ANGLE STOP KEY TYPE 75 EA $32.50 $2,437.50 4 20 AYMCDONALD $33.60 $2,520.00 5 40 FORD $35.00 $2,625.00 10 200 ford

12 3/4" ANGLE STOP BALL TYPE 40 EA $61.90 $2,476.00 4 20 AYMCDONALD $37.69 $1,507.60 5 6 FORD $66.00 $2,640.00 10 20 ford

13 1" COMP X COMP 50 EA $16.85 $842.50 4 20 AYMCDONALD $17.72 $886.00 5 53 FORD $18.20 $910.00 10 50 ford

14 1" CC CORP 60 EA $39.30 $2,358.00 4 28 AYMCDONALD $41.96 $2,517.60 5 264 FORD $43.00 $2,580.00 10 100 ford

15 1" ANGLE STOP KEY TYPE 170 EA $44.70 $7,599.00 4 32 AYMCDONALD $45.99 $7,818.30 5 145 FORD $47.00 $7,990.00 10 282 ford

16 1" POLY INSERT 1000 EA $1.50 $1,500.00 2 1200 AYMCDONALD $1.27 $1,270.00 5 2773 FORD $1.50 $1,500.00 10 700 ford

17 1" BALL CORP GRIP JOINT NUT 50 EA $9.25 $462.50 4 10 AYMCDONALD $53.99 $2,699.50 5 398 FORD $55.00 $2,750.00 10 143 ford

18 1" ANGLE STOP BALL TYPE 60 EA $91.90 $5,514.00 4 20 AYMCDONALD $96.63 $5,797.80 5 366 FORD $98.00 $5,880.00 10 20 ford

19 2" MIP X COMP 35 EA $57.50 $2,012.50 4 8 AYMCDONALD $199.09 $6,968.15 5 9 FORD $61.00 $2,135.00 10 20 ford

20 2" ANGLE STOP 40 EA $263.70 $10,548.00 4 6 AYMCDONALD $281.54 $11,261.60 5 24 FORD $208.00 $8,320.00 10 40 ford

21 3/4” Poly Pipe 200 PSI  Rating ENDOTRACE 15 100' ROLL $87 $1,305.00 2 0 EGW $87.83 $1,317.45 5 100 ENDOT IND $95.00 $1,425.00 10 10 egw   

22 1” Poly Pipe 200 PSI Rating ENDOTRACE 40 100' ROLL $102.50 $4,100.00 2 0 EGW $102.27 $4,090.80 5 1300 ENDOT IND $110.00 $4,400.00 10 14 egw

23 BLACK PLASTIC TAPE 5 CASES $95 $475.00 2 6 EGW $87.12 $435.60 5 26 PROSELECT $120.00 $600.00 10 33 egw/accucast

24 2” METER FLANGE SET /NO LEAD 130 EA $43 $5,590.00 2 12 EGW $45.20 $5,876.00 5 0 EGW $70.00 $9,100.00 10 5 egw/accucast

25 1” STRAIGHT METER COUPLING/ NO LEAD 2500 EA $11.95 $29,875.00 2 30 AYMCDONALD $12.79 $31,985.00 5 68 FORD $14.50 $36,250.00 10 24 ford

26 14”X18” PLASTIC METER BOX 300 EA $52.50 $15,750.00 30 24 DFW $49.88 $14,964.00 5 43 DFW PLASITCS $54.00 $16,200.00 28 110 dfw

27
DFW-18AMRBLSBD-LID – SERIES F  12”X1-1/2” ID 
11-3/8”, OD 12-3/8” – Proread Plastic

300 EA $29.30 $8,790.00 30 0 DFW $27.84 $8,352.00 5 6 DFW PLASITCS $30.00 $9,000.00 28 237 dfw

28 18”X24” METER BOX 60 EA $187.45 $11,247.00 30 16 DFW $179.96 $10,797.60 5 42 DFW PLASITCS $190.00 $11,400.00 28 0 dfw

29
DFW-CILTR-LID SERIES F 20” X 1-1/2” ID 19-1/4”, 
OD 20” – Proread Cast Iron 

60 EA $79.45 $4,767.00 30 0 DFW $75.48 $4,528.80 5 0 DFW PLASITCS $80.00 $4,800.00 28 0 dfw

30 2-1/2” FIRE HYDRANT METER GASKET 100 EA $2.95 $295.00 3 15 SEAL FAST $1.50 $150.00 5 267 DIXON $1.50 $150.00 10 10 egw

31 2” METER GASKETS 300 EA $0.85 $255.00 3 40 EGW $0.95 $285.00 5 0 EGW $1.25 $375.00 10 4 egw

32 1” METER GASKETS 4000 EA $0.13 $520.00 2 8000 EGW $0.13 $520.00 5 53 EGW $0.15 $600.00 10 235 egw

33
2-1/2” HEX BOLT W/NUT SET / GRADE A ZINC/ NO 
LEAD

1000 EA $1.85 $1,850.00 2 0 EGW $1.91 $1,910.00 5 0 EGW $1.00 $1,000.00 10 0 egw

34
2” DOUBLE CHECK VALVE WATTS 007M1QT2 
(DOUBLE CHECK VALVE, BACKFLOW PREVENT) 
NO LEAD

50 EA $312.75 $15,637.50 7 4 WATTS $282.47 $14,123.50 5 46 WATTS $295.00 $14,750.00 10 2 watts

35
Brooks Barrel Lock w/cap and weather seal-hardened 
steel "F" - P/N 6830000-1

500 EA $4.20 $2,100.00 3 60 BROOKS $4.27 $2,135.00 5 0 BROOKS $4.00 $2,000.00 14 0 highfield

36 Brooks Barrel Lock Key w/ loop ring “F” series 15 EA $36.70 $550.50 20 2 BROOKS $37 $555.00 5 3 BROOKS $50 $750.00 14 0 highfield

37 6 INCH CL200 PVC DR 14-GSK BLUE 3 20’ STICK $103.60 $310.80 2 800 VARIES $97 $291.00 5 130 DIAMOND No Bid $0.00 N/A N/A N/A

38 8 INCH CL200 PVC DR 14-GSK BLUE 3 20’ STICK $178 $534.00 2 600 VARIES $166.80 $500.40 5 102 DIAMOND No Bid $0.00 N/A N/A N/A

39 12 INCH CL150 PVC DR18 - GSK BLUE 2 20’ STICK $303 $606.00 2 1800 VARIES $283.60 $567.20 5 31 DIAMOND No Bid $0.00 N/A N/A N/A

40 16 INCH CL150 PVC DR18 - GSK BLUE 2 20’ STICK $634.60 $1,269.20 15 0 VARIES $520 $1,040.00 5 12 DIAMOND No Bid $0.00 N/A N/A N/A

41 18 INCH CL 235 PVC DR18 - GSK BLUE  1 20’ STICK $822.50 $822.50 15 0 VARIES $654.20 $654.20 5 0 DIAMOND No Bid $0.00 N/A N/A N/A

42 20 INCH CL150 PVC DR18 – GSK BLUE 1 20’ STICK $882.35 $882.35 15 0 VARIES $806.40 $806.40 5 0 DIAMOND No Bid $0.00 N/A N/A N/A

43 24 INCH CL150 PVC DR18 – GSK BLUE 1 20’ STICK $1,275.50 $1,275.50 15 0 VARIES $1,163.60 $1,163.60 5 0 DIAMOND No Bid $0.00 N/A N/A N/A

Totals $151,474.10 Totals $159,836.20 Totals $157,406.00
Manufacturer/ Brand % Discount - FORD 10% 20% 0%
Manufacturer/ Brand % Discount - SMITH BLAIR 10% 20% 0%
Manufacturer/ Brand % Discount - EGW 10% 20% 0%
Manufacturer/ Brand % Discount - TYLER/SIGMA 10% 20% 0%
Manufacturer/ Brand % Discount - ROMAC 10% 20% 0%
Manufacturer/ Brand % Discount - MCDONALD 10% 5% 0%
Manufacturer/ Brand % Discount - CAMBRIDGE 10% 5% 0%
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ALL BIDS SUBMITTED FOR THE DESIGNATED PROJECT ARE REFLECTED ON THIS BID TAB SHEET.  HOWEVER, THE LISTING OF A BID ON THIS SHEET SHOULD NOT BE CONSTRUED AS A COMMENT ON THE RESPONSIVENESS OF SUCH BID OR AS ANY INDICATION THAT THE CITY ACCEPTS SUCH BID AS RESPONSIVE. THE CITY WILL MAKE 
A DETERMINATION AS TO THE RESPONSIVENESS OF BIDS SUBMITTED BASED UPON COMPLIANCE WITH ALL APPLICABLE LAWS. CITY OF FRISCO PURCHASING GUIDELINES, AND PROJECT DOCUMENTS, INCLUDING BUT NOT LIMITED TO THE PROJECT SPECIFICATIONS AND CONTRACT DOCUMENTS.  THE CITY WILL NOTIFY THE 
SUCCESSFUL BIDDER UPON AWARD OF THE CONTRACT AND, ACCORDING TO LAW, ALL BIDS RECEIVED WILL BE AVAILABLE FOR INSPECTION AT THAT TIME.


