Bid Form (BT-57CF)

Legend

The green cells with bolded numbers indicate that this bid was the lowest price. $123

The orange cells indicate that this item from that vendor was selected.

The green cells with orange outline indicate that this item from that vendor was selected, and
has the lowest price.



City of Frisco

Bid #2110-004 Poolsure DCC HASA, Inc. Leslie's Poolmart, Inc. PVS Minibulk, Inc.
Pool Chemicals
Total Cost $45,303.4 $69,769.26 $58,268.5 $5,890.45 $53,490.0
Quantity
Items Required  UnitofMeasure UnitPrice  TotalCost UnitPrice TotalCost UnitPrice TotalCost UnitPrice  TotalCost UnitPrice  TotalCost
Sodium Hypochlorite {25000 Gallons $1.46 $36,500.00 $1.82 | $45,500.00 $1.67 | $41,750.00 No Bid No Bid $1.63 $40,750.00
Sodium Thiosulfate 300 Lbs. $0 $0 $1.50 $450.06 $0.82 $246.00 $1.00 $299.70 No Bid No Bid
Calcium Chloride 1500 Lbs. $0.94 $1,406.40 $0.88 $1,321.20 $0.27 $405.00 $0.34 $502.50 No Bid No Bid
Hydrochloric Acid 3500 Gallons $0 $0 $4.28 | $14,962.50 $3.01 | $10,535.00 No Bid No Bid $3.64 | $12,740.00
Calcium Hypochlorite {1500 Lbs. $2.48 $3,712.50 $2.07 | $3,108.00 $1.76 | $2,640.00 $1.50 $2,250.00 No Bid No Bid
Sodium Bicarbonate 6750 Lbs. $0.45 $3,064.50 $0.54 | $3,631.50 $0.29 $1,957.50 $0.34 $2,288.25 No Bid No Bid
Cyanuric Acid 500 Lbs. $1.24 $620.00 $1.59 $796.00 $1.47 $735.00 $1.10 $550.00 No Bid No Bid
Subtotal Awards $36,500.00 $13,143.50 $2,800.00

Award Totals

$52,443.50
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