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1
#1-1 Eldorado Water Tower 12134 Eldorado Rd 18 $45.50 $819.00 $130 $2,340.00 $79.86 $1,437.48 $60 $1,080.00 $292.50 $5,265.00 $39 $702 $123.50 $2,223.00 $34.96 $629.28 $70.20 $1,263.60 $42.32 $761.76 $91.19 $1,641.42
#1-2 Fairways Lift Stion 10555 Smotherman Road 18 $35 $630 $70 $1,260.00 $43 $774 $60 $1,080.00 $225 $4,050.00 $21 $378 $66.50 $1,197.00 $18.75 $337.50 $37.80 $680.40 $22.79 $410.22 $4.91 $88.38
#1-3 Frisco-1 Pump Station 6309 Custer Road 18 $374.50 $6,741.00 $1,070.00 $19,260.00 $657.22 $11,829.96 $350 $6,300.00 $2,407.00 $43,326.00 $321 $5,778.00 $1,016.50 $18,297.00 $253.30 $4,559.40 $577.80 $10,400.40 $348.44 $6,271.92 $750.59 $13,510.62
#1-4 Frisco-2 Pump Station 10500 Humington Road 18 $45.50 $819.00 $130 $2,340.00 $79.85 $1,437.30 $60 $1,080.00 $292.50 $5,265.00 $39 $702 $123.50 $2,223.00 $33.47 $602.46 $70.20 $1,263.60 $42.34 $762.12 $91.19 $1,641.42
#1-5 Frisco-3 Fill valve 11310 Research Road 18 $65 $1,170.00 $130 $2,340.00 $79.85 $1,437.30 $60 $1,080.00 $292.50 $5,265.00 $39 $702 $123.50 $2,223.00 $43.46 $782.28 $70.20 $1,263.60 $42.34 $762.12 $91.19 $1,641.42
#1-6 Frisco-3 Pump Station 11310 Research Road 18 $266 $4,788.00 $760 $13,680.00 $466.82 $8,402.76 $350 $6,300.00 $1,710.00 $30,780.00 $228 $4,104.00 $722 $12,996.00 $110.63 $1,991.34 $410.40 $7,387.20 $247.49 $4,454.82 $533.13 $9,596.34
#1-7 Grayhawk Lift Stion 12590 FM 423 18 $35 $630 $50 $900 $30.71 $552.78 $60 $1,080.00 $225 $4,050.00 $20.30 $365.40 $47.50 $855.00 $11.49 $206.82 $27 $486 $16.29 $293.22 $35.07 $631.26
#1-8 Hillcrest  Water Tower 6500 Hillcrest Road 18 $35 $630 $70 $1,260.00 $42.99 $773.82 $60 $1,080.00 $225 $4,050.00 $21 $378 $66.50 $1,197.00 $19.82 $356.76 $37.80 $680.40 $22.79 $410.22 $49.10 $883.80
#1-9 Legacy Water Tower 5435 Warren Pkwy 18 $35 $630 $90 $1,620.00 $55.28 $995.04 $60 $1,080.00 $225 $4,050.00 $27 $486 $85.50 $1,539.00 $16.61 $298.98 $48.60 $874.80 $29.31 $527.58 $63.13 $1,136.34
#1-10 Lone Star Lift Station 350 Lone Star PKWy 18 $35 $630 $90 $1,620.00 $55.28 $995.04 $60 $1,080.00 $225 $4,050.00 $27 $486 $85.50 $1,539.00 $14.71 $264.78 $48.60 $874.80 $29.31 $527.58 $63.13 $1,136.34
#1-11 Parkwood Water Tower 3966 Parkwood Blvd 18 $35 $630 $80 $1,440.00 $49.14 $884.52 $60 $1,080.00 $225 $4,050.00 $24 $432 $76 $1,368.00 $17.65 $317.70 $43.20 $777.60 $26.05 $468.90 $56.12 $1,010.16
#1-12 Stewart Creek Reuse 5100 4th Army Memorial 18 $35 $630 $50 $900 $30.71 $552.78 $60 $1,080.00 $225 $4,050.00 $20.30 $365.40 $47.50 $855.00 $17.33 $311.94 $27 $486 $16.29 $293.22 $35.07 $631.26
#1-13 Stonebrook Water Tower 484 Stonebrook Pkwy 18 $38.50 $693.00 $110 $1,980.00 $67.57 $1,216.26 $60 $1,080.00 $247.50 $4,455.00 $33 $594 $104.50 $1,881.00 $28.62 $515.16 $59.40 $1,069.20 $35.82 $644.76 $77.16 $1,388.88
#1-14 Teel Water Tower 13772 Teel Pkwy 18 $73.50 $1,323.00 $210 $3,780.00 $128.99 $2,321.82 $60 $1,080.00 $472.50 $8,505.00 $63 $1,134.00 $200 $3,600.00 $71.93 $1,294.74 $113.40 $2,041.20 $68.39 $1,231.02 $147.31 $2,651.58
#1-15 The Gates Lift Station 3625 Dallas Pkwy 18 $35 $630 $50 $900 $2.23 $40.14 $60 $1,080.00 $225 $4,050.00 $20.30 $365.40 $20 $360 $9.05 $162.90 $10.80 $194.40 $6.51 $117.18 $14.03 $252.54
#1-16 Timber Ridge Water Tower 6050 Timber Ridge Drive 18 $65 $1,170.00 $140 $2,520.00 $86 $1,548.00 $60 $1,080.00 $315 $5,670.00 $42 $756 $133 $2,394.00 $45.17 $813.06 $75.60 $1,360.80 $45.59 $820.62 $98.21 $1,767.78
#1-17 Trails Lift Station 9858 Planter Row 18 $35 $630 $80 $1,440.00 $5.03 $90.54 $60 $1,080.00 $225 $4,050.00 $24 $432 $76 $1,368.00 $25.74 $463.32 $43.20 $777.60 $26.05 $468.90 $56.12 $1,010.16

Sub Total $23,193 $59,580.00 $35,289.54 $28,800.00 $144,981.00 $18,160 $56,115.00 $13,908.42 $31,881.60 $19,226.16 $40,619.70
2
#2-1 Independence Practice Site 11955 Independence Parkway 35 $511 $17,885.00 $949 $33,215.00 $489.56 $17,134.60 $600 $21,000.00 No Bid No Bid $423.40 $14,819.00 $1,387.00 $48,545.00 $447.85 $15,674.75 $788.40 $27,594.00 $397.43 $13,910.05 $731.55 $25,604.25
#2-2 Stewart Creek Park 4900 4th Army Memorial Road 35 $742 $25,970.00 $1,378.00 $48,230.00 $710.87 $24,880.45 $700 $24,500.00 No Bid No Bid $614.80 $21,518.00 $2,014.00 $70,490.00 $735.12 $25,729.20 $1,144.80 $40,068.00 $577.09 $20,198.15 $1,062.26 $37,179.10
#2-3 Wranglers Range Park 777 Cedar Ranch Road 35 $294 $10,290.00 $546 $19,110.00 $281.67 $9,858.45 $300 $10,500.00 No Bid No Bid $243.60 $8,526.00 $798 $27,930.00 $341.62 $11,956.70 $453.60 $15,876.00 $228.66 $8,003.10 $420.89 $14,731.15
#2-4 Yucca Ridge Park 13813 Graham Avenue 35 $430.50 $15,067.50 $799.50 $27,982.50 $412.43 $14,435.05 $400 $14,000.00 No Bid No Bid $356.70 $12,484.50 $1,168.50 $40,897.50 $392.19 $13,726.65 $664.20 $23,247.00 $334.82 $11,718.70 $616.31 $21,570.85

Sub Total $69,212.50 $128,537.50 $66,308.55 $70,000.00 $57,347.50 $187,862.50 $67,087.30 $106,785.00 $53,830.00 $99,085.35
3
#3-1 Central Fire Station & Safety Town 8601 Gary Burns Drive 35 $200 $7,000.00 $344.50 $12,057.50 $129.39 $4,528.65 $320 $11,200.00 No Bid No Bid $161.65 $5,657.75 $503.50 $17,622.50 $49.55 $1,734.25 $286.20 $10,017.00 $151.95 $5,318.25 $371.79 $13,012.65
#3-2 Fire Fleet Maintenance Facility 8860 Tomlin Drive 35 $60 $2,100.00 $123.50 $4,322.50 $46.38 $1,623.30 $80 $2,800.00 No Bid No Bid $57.95 $2,028.25 $181 $6,335.00 $21.36 $747.60 $102.60 $3,591.00 $54.47 $1,906.45 $133.28 $4,664.80
#3-3 Fire Station #2 3711 Ohio Drive 35 $35 $1,225.00 $71.50 $2,502.50 $26.85 $939.75 $80 $2,800.00 No Bid No Bid $33.55 $1,174.25 $105 $3,675.00 $10.20 $357.00 $59.40 $2,079.00 $31.54 $1,103.90 $77.16 $2,700.60
#3-4 Fire Station #3 5449 Warren Parkway 35 $40 $1,400.00 $97.50 $3,412.50 $36.62 $1,281.70 $80 $2,800.00 No Bid No Bid $45.75 $1,601.25 $143 $5,005.00 $23 $805 $81 $2,835.00 $43.01 $1,505.35 $105.22 $3,682.70
#3-5 Fire Station #4 4485 Cotton Gin Road 35 $120 $4,200.00 $208 $7,280.00 $78.12 $2,734.20 $120 $4,200.00 No Bid No Bid $97.60 $3,416.00 $304 $10,640.00 $63.15 $2,210.25 $172.80 $6,048.00 $91.74 $3,210.90 $224.48 $7,856.80
#3-6 Fire Station #5 14300 Eldorado Parkway 35 $70 $2,450.00 $156 $5,460.00 $58.59 $2,050.65 $100 $3,500.00 No Bid No Bid $73.20 $2,562.00 $228 $7,980.00 $33.18 $1,161.30 $129.60 $4,536.00 $68.81 $2,408.35 $168.36 $5,892.60
#3-7 Fire Station #6 3535 Eldorado Parkway 35 $90 $3,150.00 $175.50 $6,142.50 $65.91 $2,306.85 $100 $3,500.00 No Bid No Bid $82.35 $2,882.25 $256 $8,960.00 $257.43 $9,010.05 $145.80 $5,103.00 $77.41 $2,709.35 $189.40 $6,629.00
#3-8 Fire Station #7 330 W. Stonebrook Parkway 35 $80 $2,800.00 $214.50 $7,507.50 $80.56 $2,819.60 $120 $4,200.00 No Bid No Bid $100.65 $3,522.75 $314 $10,990.00 $69.10 $2,418.50 $178.20 $6,237.00 $94.61 $3,311.35 $231.49 $8,102.15
#3-9 Fire Station #8 14700 Rolater Road 35 $150 $5,250.00 $344.50 $12,057.50 $129.39 $4,528.65 $120 $4,200.00 No Bid No Bid $161.65 $5,657.75 $504 $17,640.00 $56.43 $1,975.05 $286.20 $10,017.00 $151.95 $5,318.25 $371.79 $13,012.65
#3-10 Fire Station #9 & Training Facility 15151 Donnie Mayfield Way 35 $350 $12,250.00 $734.50 $25,707.50 $275.87 $9,655.45 $800 $28,000.00 No Bid No Bid $344.65 $12,062.75 $1,074.00 $37,590.00 $163.06 $5,707.10 $610.20 $21,357.00 $323.97 $11,338.95 $792.68 $27,743.80
#3-11 Frisco Athletic Center & Pond 5828 Nancy Jane Lane 35 $330 $11,550.00 $1,033.50 $36,172.50 $388.18 $13,586.30 $480 $16,800.00 No Bid No Bid $484.95 $16,973.25 $1,510.00 $52,850.00 $231.72 $8,110.20 $858.60 $30,051.00 $455.85 $15,954.75 $1,115.37 $39,037.95
#3-12 Police Headquarters 7200 Stonebrook Parkway 35 $300 $10,500.00 $767 $26,845.00 $288.08 $10,082.80 $480 $16,800.00 No Bid No Bid $359.90 $12,596.50 $1,121.00 $39,235.00 $155.94 $5,457.90 $637.20 $22,302.00 $338.31 $11,840.85 $827.76 $28,971.60
#3-13 Public Works Facility 11300 Research Road 35 $450 $15,750.00 $1,131.00 $39,585.00 $424.80 $14,868.00 $320 $11,200.00 No Bid No Bid $530.70 $18,574.50 $1,653.00 $57,855.00 $169.90 $5,946.50 $939.60 $32,886.00 $498.86 $17,460.10 $1,220.59 $42,720.65

Sub Total $79,625.00 $189,052.50 $71,005.90 $112,000.00 $88,709.25 $276,377.50 $45,640.70 $157,059.00 $83,386.80 $204,027.95
4
#4-1 FM 423 Hwy 380 to Little Ranch Rd. 35 $225 $7,875.00 $182 $6,370.00 $133.64 $4,677.40 $140 $4,900.00 No Bid No Bid $134.40 $4,704.00 $308 $10,780.00 $126.09 $4,413.15 $151.20 $5,292.00 $119.33 $4,176.55 $199.89 $6,996.15
#4-2 FM 423 Main St. to Lone Star Pkwy. 35 $510 $17,850.00 $396.50 $13,877.50 $291.13 $10,189.55 $300 $10,500.00 No Bid No Bid $292.80 $10,248.00 $671 $23,485.00 $343.31 $12,015.85 $329.40 $11,529.00 $330.30 $11,560.50 $441 $15,435.00
#4-3 Lone Star Ranch Pkwy. Lebanon Rd. to FM 423 35 $190 $6,650.00 $240.50 $8,417.50 $176.59 $6,180.65 $180 $6,300.00 No Bid No Bid $177.60 $6,216.00 $407 $14,245.00 $144.86 $5,070.10 $199.80 $6,993.00 $157.68 $5,518.80 $284.71 $9,964.85
#4-4 Rock Creek Pkwy. Lebanon Rd. to 2 Medians past Agnes Creek Dr 35 $165 $5,775.00 $182 $6,370.00 $133.64 $4,677.40 $140 $4,900.00 No Bid No Bid $134.40 $4,704.00 $308 $10,780.00 $117.64 $4,117.40 $151.20 $5,292.00 $151.61 $5,306.35 $188.29 $6,590.15
#4-5 Teel Pkwy. Little Ranch Rd. to Timber Ridge Dr. 35 $1,240.00 $43,400.00 $1,345.50 $47,092.50 $987.93 $34,577.55 $1,040.00 $36,400.00 No Bid No Bid $993.60 $34,776.00 $2,277.00 $79,695.00 $1,053.89 $36,886.15 $1,117.80 $39,123.00 $1,120.86 $39,230.10 $1,388.27 $48,589.45
#4-6 Teel Pkwy. Lebanon Rd. to Carraway Dr. 35 $80 $2,800.00 $91 $3,185.00 $66.82 $2,338.70 $60 $2,100.00 No Bid No Bid $67.20 $2,352.00 $154 $5,390.00 $60.25 $2,108.75 $75.60 $2,646.00 $75.81 $2,653.35 $93.29 $3,265.15
#4-7 Legacy Dr. Panther Creek Pkwy to SH 121 35 $1,700.00 $59,500.00 $1,553.50 $54,372.50 $1,145.23 $40,082.89 $1,200.00 $42,000.00 No Bid No Bid $1,147.20 $40,152.00 $2,629.00 $92,015.00 $1,295.24 $45,333.40 $1,290.60 $45,171.00 $1,294.13 $45,294.55 $1,659.88 $58,095.80
#4-8 Frisco St. Cobb Hill Dr. to 1 Median S. of Main St. 35 $495 $17,325.00 $435.50 $15,242.50 $321.05 $11,236.63 $320 $11,200.00 No Bid No Bid $321.60 $11,256.00 $737 $25,795.00 $353.22 $12,362.70 $361.80 $12,663.00 $362.79 $12,697.65 $465.98 $16,309.30
#4-9 Parkwood Blvd 1 Median N. of Stonebrook Pkwy. to  1 Median     35 $420 $14,700.00 $416 $14,560.00 $306.67 $10,733.49 $320 $11,200.00 No Bid No Bid $307.20 $10,752.00 $704 $24,640.00 $334.32 $11,701.20 $345.60 $12,096.00 $346.54 $12,128.90 $435.77 $15,251.95
#4-10 Preston Rd. Hwy 380 to Main St. 35 $915 $32,025.00 $344.50 $12,057.50 $253.96 $8,888.67 $280 $9,800.00 No Bid No Bid $318 $11,130.00 $5,830.00 $204,050.00 $214.27 $7,499.45 $286.20 $10,017.00 $286.98 $10,044.30 $470.75 $16,476.25
#4-11 Preston Rd. Main St. to SR 121 35 $1,025.00 $35,875.00 $575 $20,125.00 $186.88 $6,540.72 $200 $7,000.00 No Bid No Bid $187.20 $6,552.00 $429 $15,015.00 $246.25 $8,618.75 $210.60 $7,371.00 $211.18 $7,391.30 $361.35 $12,647.25
#4-12 Hillcrest Rd. Panther Creek Pkwy to Eldorado Pkwy. 35 $230 $8,050.00 $286 $10,010.00 $210.84 $7,379.28 $200 $7,000.00 No Bid No Bid $211.20 $7,392.00 $484 $16,940.00 $198.55 $6,949.25 $216.50 $7,577.50 $238.25 $8,338.75 $289.92 $10,147.20
#4-13 Hillcrest Rd. Main St. to SR 121 35 $770 $26,950.00 $611 $21,385.00 $450.42 $15,764.82 $480 $16,800.00 No Bid No Bid $451.20 $15,792.00 $1,034.00 $36,190.00 $522.22 $18,277.70 $507.60 $17,766.00 $508.99 $17,814.65 $668.21 $23,387.35
#4-14 Ohio Dr. Hillcrest Rd. to SR 121 35 $550 $19,250.00 $377 $13,195.00 $277.92 $9,727.23 $300 $10,500.00 No Bid No Bid $278.40 $9,744.00 $638 $22,330.00 $365.29 $12,785.15 $313.20 $10,962.00 $314.06 $10,992.10 $426.42 $14,924.70
#4-15 Coit Rd. HW 380 to Main St. 35 $1,115.00 $39,025.00 $1,228.50 $42,997.50 $905.64 $31,697.35 $980 $34,300.00 No Bid No Bid $907.20 $31,752.00 $2,079.00 $72,765.00 $942.87 $33,000.45 $1,020.60 $35,721.00 $805.45 $28,190.75 $1,266.69 $44,334.15
#4-16 Coit Rd. Main St. to SR 121 35 $635 $22,225.00 $663 $23,205.00 $488.76 $17,106.51 $520 $18,200.00 No Bid No Bid $489.60 $17,136.00 $1,122.00 $39,270.00 $484.57 $16,959.95 $550.80 $19,278.00 $552.31 $19,330.85 $689.84 $24,144.40
#4-17 Independence Pkwy. JFK Blvd. to SR 121 35 $1,075.00 $37,625.00 $1,105.00 $38,675.00 $814.60 $28,510.84 $540 $18,900.00 No Bid No Bid $816 $28,560.00 $1,870.00 $65,450.00 $809.93 $28,347.55 $918 $32,130.00 $724.48 $25,356.80 $1,154.05 $40,391.75
#4-18 Legendary Dr Lebanon Rd. to 1 Median S. of John Hickman Pk 35 $125 $4,375.00 $25 $875 $4.79 $167.71 $10 $350 No Bid No Bid $23.20 $812.00 $23 $805 $29.95 $1,048.25 $10 $350 $5.41 $189.35 $29.75 $1,041.25

Sub Total $401,275.00 $352,013 $250,477.39 $252,350 $254,030.00 $759,640 $267,495.20 $281,978 $266,215.60 $367,992.10
5
#5-1 Gaylord Pkwy. Preston Rd to 1 Median E. of Ohio 35 $70 $2,450.00 $26 $910 $16.63 $582.05 $20 $700 No Bid No Bid $23.20 $812.00 $44 $1,540.00 $38.85 $1,359.75 $21.60 $756.00 $21.66 $758.10 $35.10 $1,228.50
#5-2 College Pkwy Hillcrest Rd. to Coit Rd. 35 $225 $7,875.00 $97.50 $3,412.50 $73.61 $2,576.35 $60 $2,100.00 No Bid No Bid $72 $2,520.00 $165 $5,775.00 $148.17 $5,185.95 $81 $2,835.00 $64.98 $2,274.30 $126.07 $4,412.45
#5-3 Cotton Gin Rd. 2 Medians W. of Legacy to 1 Median E. of DNT 35 $150 $5,250.00 $136.50 $4,777.50 $103.06 $3,607.10 $80 $2,800.00 No Bid No Bid $100.80 $3,528.00 $231 $8,085.00 $112.58 $3,940.30 $113.40 $3,969.00 $113.71 $3,979.85 $146.60 $5,131.00
#5-4 Rockhill Pkwy 1 Island W of Broadmark Ln. to FM423 35 $150 $5,250.00 $84.50 $2,957.50 $63.79 $2,232.65 $60 $2,100.00 No Bid No Bid $62.40 $2,184.00 $143 $5,005.00 $91.14 $3,189.90 $70.20 $2,457.00 $70.39 $2,463.65 $100.54 $3,518.90
#5-5 PGA Pkwy. Odyssey Way to 1 Median East of Preston Rd. 35 $360 $12,600.00 $169 $5,915.00 $157.59 $5,515.65 $120 $4,200.00 No Bid No Bid $124.80 $4,368.00 $286 $10,010.00 $205.64 $7,197.40 $140.40 $4,914.00 $140.78 $4,927.30 $213.70 $7,479.50
#5-6 Panther Creek Pkwy. FM 423 to 2 Medians East of DNT 35 $725 $25,375.00 $864.50 $30,257.50 $626.05 $21,911.75 $680 $23,800.00 No Bid No Bid $638.40 $22,344.00 $1,463.00 $51,205.00 $610.17 $21,355.95 $718.20 $25,137.00 $566.80 $19,838.00 $881.56 $30,854.60
#5-7 Panther Creek Pkwy. Preston Rd. to Eden Drive 35 $250 $8,750.00 $273 $9,555.00 $206.12 $7,214.20 $200 $7,000.00 No Bid No Bid $201.60 $7,056.00 $462 $16,170.00 $201.11 $7,038.85 $226.80 $7,938.00 $178.99 $6,264.65 $283 $9,905.00
#5-8 Eldorado Pkwy. FM 423 to Preston Rd. 35 $1,020.00 $35,700.00 $500.50 $17,517.50 $377.89 $13,226.15 $400 $14,000.00 No Bid No Bid $369.60 $12,936.00 $847 $29,645.00 $561.42 $19,649.70 $415.80 $14,553.00 $416.94 $14,592.90 $625 $21,875.00
#5-9 Eldorado Pkwy. Preston Rd. to Custer Rd. 35 $885 $30,975.00 $526.50 $18,427.50 $397.52 $13,913.20 $420 $14,700.00 No Bid No Bid $388.80 $13,608.00 $891 $31,185.00 $516.87 $18,090.45 $437.40 $15,309.00 $438.60 $15,351.00 $616.95 $21,593.25
#5-10 All Stars Ave. 1 Median W. of Frisco St. to North County Rd 35 $115 $4,025.00 $39 $1,365.00 $29.44 $1,030.40 $30 $1,050.00 No Bid No Bid $28.80 $1,008.00 $66 $2,310.00 $58.20 $2,037.00 $32.40 $1,134.00 $32.49 $1,137.15 $54.36 $1,902.60
#5-11 Sports Village Rd. Frisco St. to John W Elliot Dr. 35 $35 $1,225.00 $25 $875 $4.90 $171.50 $20 $700 No Bid No Bid $23.20 $812.00 $20 $700 $4.91 $171.85 $10 $350 $5.41 $189.35 $7.63 $267.05
#5-12 Main St. DNT to Preston Rd. 35 $370 $12,950.00 $110.50 $3,867.50 $83.43 $2,920.05 $80 $2,800.00 No Bid No Bid $81.60 $2,856.00 $187 $6,545.00 $191.45 $6,700.75 $91.80 $3,213.00 $92.05 $3,221.75 $165.40 $5,789.00
#5-13 Main St. Preston Rd. to Custer Rd. 35 $840 $29,400.00 $370.50 $12,967.50 $279.73 $9,790.55 $280 $9,800.00 No Bid No Bid $273.60 $9,576.00 $627 $21,945.00 $326.68 $11,433.80 $307.80 $10,773.00 $308.64 $10,802.40 $476.98 $16,694.30
#5-14 Hutson Dr. Preston Rd. to Kings Ridge Rd 35 $130 $4,550.00 $65 $2,275.00 $49.07 $1,717.45 $40 $1,400.00 No Bid No Bid $48 $1,680.00 $110 $3,850.00 $86.49 $3,027.15 $54 $1,890.00 $54.15 $1,895.25 $80.57 $2,819.95
#5-15 Stonebrook Pkwy (West) 1 Median W. of Mast Dr. to FM 423 35 $405 $14,175.00 $448.50 $15,697.50 $338.62 $11,851.70 $360 $12,600.00 No Bid No Bid $331.20 $11,592.00 $759 $26,565.00 $319.76 $11,191.60 $372.60 $13,041.00 $294.05 $10,291.75 $463.69 $16,229.15
#5-16 Stonebrook Pkwy Plum Creek Dr. to Preston Rd. 35 $930 $32,550.00 $604.50 $21,157.50 $456.41 $15,974.35 $480 $16,800.00 No Bid No Bid $446.40 $15,624.00 $1,023.00 $35,805.00 $555.13 $19,429.55 $502.20 $17,577.00 $503.57 $17,624.95 $696.50 $24,377.50
#5-17 Rolater Rd. Preston Rd. to Custer Rd. 35 $990 $34,650.00 $962 $33,670.00 $726.33 $25,421.55 $760 $26,600.00 No Bid No Bid $710.40 $24,864.00 $1,628.00 $56,980.00 $709.37 $24,827.95 $799.20 $27,972.00 $801.38 $28,048.30 $1,010.61 $35,371.35
#5-18 Wade Blvd. Preston Rd. to 1 Median E. of Ohio Dr. 35 $195 $6,825.00 $221 $7,735.00 $166.86 $5,840.10 $160 $5,600.00 No Bid No Bid $163.20 $5,712.00 $374 $13,090.00 $157.89 $5,526.15 $183.60 $6,426.00 $184.10 $6,443.50 $226.88 $7,940.80
#5-19 Lebanon Rd. (W) Frisco City Limit(1 median W. of Pine Ln.) to FM 35 $250 $8,750.00 $312 $10,920.00 $235.56 $8,244.60 $240 $8,400.00 No Bid No Bid $230.40 $8,064.00 $528 $18,480.00 $223.94 $7,837.90 $259.20 $9,072.00 $204.56 $7,159.60 $1 $35
#5-20 Lebanon Rd. FM 423 to Preston Rd. 35 $1,325.00 $46,375.00 $1,378.00 $48,230.00 $1,030.42 $36,064.70 $1,000.00 $35,000.00 No Bid No Bid $1,017.60 $35,616.00 $2,332.00 $81,620.00 $931.37 $32,597.95 $1,134.00 $39,690.00 $1,147.93 $40,177.55 $1,437.30 $50,305.50
#5-21 Lebanon Rd. Preston Rd. to Custer Rd. 35 $520 $18,200.00 $442 $15,470.00 $333.72 $11,680.20 $360 $12,600.00 No Bid No Bid $326.40 $11,424.00 $748 $26,180.00 $354.43 $12,405.05 $367.20 $12,852.00 $368.20 $12,887.00 $475.95 $16,658.25
#5-22 John Hickman Pkwy. Parkwood Blvd. to Preston Rd. 35 $120 $4,200.00 $65 $2,275.00 $49.07 $1,717.45 $40 $1,400.00 No Bid No Bid $48 $1,680.00 $110 $3,850.00 $67.34 $2,356.90 $54 $1,890.00 $54.15 $1,895.25 $79.31 $2,775.85
#5-24 Preston Place Preston Rd. to Ohio Dr. 35 $50 $1,750.00 $25 $875 $4.90 $171.50 $20 $700 No Bid No Bid $23.20 $812.00 $20 $700 $48.77 $1,706.95 $10 $350 $5.41 $189.35 $14.98 $524.30
#5-25 Wade Blvd.* Parkwood Blvd. to Preston Rd. 35 $160 $5,600.00 $84.50 $2,957.50 $63.79 $2,232.65 $40 $1,400.00 No Bid No Bid $62.40 $2,184.00 $143 $5,005.00 $91.90 $3,216.50 $70.20 $2,457.00 $70.39 $2,463.65 $103.53 $3,623.55
#5-26 Warren Pkwy Preston Rd. to Hillcrest Rd. 35 $200 $7,000.00 $71.50 $2,502.50 $53.98 $1,889.30 $40 $1,400.00 No Bid No Bid $52.80 $1,848.00 $121 $4,235.00 $105.71 $3,699.85 $59.40 $2,079.00 $59.56 $2,084.60 $99.54 $3,483.90
#5-27 Ikea Dr. DNT service Rd. to Parkwood Dr. 35 $70 $2,450.00 $26 $910 $19.63 $687.05 $20 $700 No Bid No Bid $23.20 $812.00 $44 $1,540.00 $36.52 $1,278.20 $21.60 $756.00 $21.66 $758.10 $34.82 $1,218.70
#5-28 Spring Creek Pkwy. Frisco City Limit (RR tracks) to SH 121 35 $90 $3,150.00 $84.50 $2,957.50 $63.79 $2,232.65 $60 $2,100.00 No Bid No Bid $62.40 $2,184.00 $143 $5,005.00 $66.51 $2,327.85 $70.20 $2,457.00 $70.39 $2,463.65 $89.57 $3,134.95
#5-29 Town and Country Blvd. 1 Median East of Legacy to 1 Median East of Le 35 $35 $1,225.00 $25 $875 $4.90 $171.50 $20 $700 No Bid No Bid $23.20 $812.00 $20 $700 $6.13 $214.55 $10 $350 $5.41 $189.35 $7.52 $263.20
#5-30 Town and Country Blvd. 1 Median East of Spring Creek to 1 Median East   35 $35 $1,225.00 $25 $875 $4.90 $171.50 $20 $700 No Bid No Bid $23.20 $812.00 $20 $700 $7.62 $266.70 $10 $350 $5.41 $189.35 $8.15 $285.25

Sub Total $374,500.00 $282,188 $210,759.85 $213,850 $209,328.00 $474,425.00 $239,262.45 $232,547.00 $220,561.60 $299,698.35
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