CSB 2104-064
Water Valves and Hydrants
Opened 5-4-2021 2 PM

Core & Main LP
4650 HWY 377 Branch 143
Krugerville, TX 76227
940-365-9117
joshua.zinke@coreandmain.com
Joshua Zinke

FERGUSON WATERWORKS
10077 W University Dr
McKinney, TX 75071
972-434-2600
Troy.Mccamish@ferguson.com
Troy McCamish

Fortiline, Tnc.

11200 Seagoviller Rd
Balch Springs, TX 75180
214-660-3662
whistle.maza@fortiline.com
Luthario "Whistle" Maza

Total Cost $169,621.09 $175,200.11 $87,934.00
Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total

# Items Quantity UuoM Price Cost Price Cost Price Cost
1
#1-1 3’ Fire Hydrant 4 EA $1,671.78 $6,687.12 | $1,719.29 $6,877.16 |No Bid No Bid
#1-2 4’ Fire Hydrant 6 EA $1,753.21 $10,519.26 | $1,803.03 $10,818.18 [No Bid No Bid
#1-3 5’ Fire Hydrant 10 EA $1,834.64 $18,346.40 | $1,886.78 $18,867.80 [No Bid No Bid
#1-4 5’ Vertical Inlet Hydrant 3 EA $1,996.98 $5,990.94 | $2,053.73 $6,161.19 |No Bid No Bid
#1-5 6” Fire Hydrant Extension - Waterous 10 EA $205 $2,050.00 $209.97 $2,099.70 |No Bid No Bid
#1-6 6” Fire Hydrant Extension — American Darling 1 EA $169 $169 $172.41 $172.41 [No Bid No Bid
#1-7 6” Fire Hydrant Extension - Mueller 10 EA $255 $2,550.00 $261.05 $2,610.50 |No Bid No Bid
#1-8 6” Fire Hydrant Extension — M&H 5 EA $445 $2,225.00 $455.63 $2,278.15 $455 $2,275.00
#1-9 12” Fire Hydrant Extension - Waterous 5 EA $242 $1,210.00 $247.21 $1,236.05 |No Bid No Bid
#1-10 12” Fire Hydrant Extension — American Darling 1 EA $197 $197 $201.31 $201.31 [No Bid No Bid
#1-11 12” Fire Hydrant Extension - Mueller 5 EA $295 $1,475.00 $301.05 $1,505.25 |No Bid No Bid
#1-12 12” Fire Hydrant Extension -M&H 5 EA $520 $2,600.00 $532.05 $2,660.25 $532 $2,660.00
#1-13 18” Fire Hydrant Extension -Waterous 5 EA $280 $1,400.00 $287.02 $1,435.10 |No Bid No Bid
#1-14 18” Fire Hydrant Extension — American Darling 1 EA $224 $224 $229.35 $229.35 [No Bid No Bid
#1-15 18” Fire Hydrant Extension - Mueller 1 EA $343 $343 $350.53 $350.53 [No Bid No Bid
#1-16 18” Fire Hydrant Extension — M&H 1 EA $590 $590 $603.84 $603.84 $603 $603
#1-17 24” Fire Hydrant Extension — Waterous 1 EA $317 $317 $324.59 $324.59 [No Bid No Bid
#1-18 24” Fire Hydrant Extension — American Darling 1 EA $253 $253 $258.77 $258.77 |No Bid No Bid
#1-19 24” Fire Hydrant Extension - Mueller 1 EA $387 $387 $395.79 $395.79 [No Bid No Bid
#1-20 24" Fire Hydrant Extension -M&H 1 EA $640 $640 $655.95 $655.95 $655 $655
#1-21 Safety Repair Kit —Hydrant -M &H 5 EA $200 $1,000.00 $206.11 $1,030.55 $206 $1,030.00
#1-22 Safety Repair Kit —Hydrant - Mueller 5 EA $136 $680 $138.95 $694.75 [No Bid No Bid
#1-23 Safety Repair Kit —Hydrant - Waterous 20 EA $102.75 $2,055.00 $104.91 $2,098.20 |No Bid No Bid
#1-24 Safety Repair Kit -American Darling 2 EA $105.75 $211.50 $108.03 $216.06 [No Bid No Bid
#1-25 Hydrant Main Valve Gasket -Mueller 20 EA $152 $3,040.00 $155.58 $3,111.60 |No Bid No Bid
#1-26 Hydrant Main Valve Gasket - Waterous 20 EA $6.85 $137.00 $69.90 $1,398.00 |No Bid No Bid
#1-27 Hydrant Main Valve Gasket - M&H 20 EA $56.45 $1,129.00 $57.63 $1,152.60 $125 $2,500.00
#1-28 Main Valve Gasket-American Darling 2 EA $102.50 $205.00 $104.84 $209.68 [No Bid No Bid
#1-29 2-1/2” Pacer Cap Gasket -Waterous 24 EA $6.85 $164.40 $6.99 $167.76 [No Bid No Bid
#1-30 4” Pacer Cap Gasket -Waterous 24 EA $9.40 $225.60 $9.61 $230.64 [No Bid No Bid
#1-31 Valve Seat Kit-Waterous 24 EA $583.50 $14,004.00 $595.85 $14,300.40 [No Bid No Bid
#1-32 18”-24" Cl Valve Box 20 EA $33.45 $669.00 $30.53 $610.60 $30.50 $610.00
#1-33 24”-36" Cl Valve Box 20 EA $48.50 $970.00 $42.11 $842.20 $42 $840




#1-34 48”-59” Cl Valve Box 20 EA $79.90 $1,598.00 $90.53 $1,810.60 $90 $1,800.00
#1-35 14” ClI Valve Box Extension 20 EA $25.50 $510.00 $23.16 $463.20 $23 $460
#1-36 2’ Cl Valve Box Extension 15 EA $35.90 $538.50 $31.58 $473.70 $31 $465
#1-37 2” Valve Box Riser 30 EA $15.85 $475.50 $9.74 $292.20 $10 $300
#1-38 4” Valve Box Riser 30 EA $37.50 $1,125.00 $14.21 $426.30 S14 $420
#1-39 6” Valve Box Riser 30 EA $53.35 $1,600.50 $19.47 $584.10 $19 $570
#1-40 10” Cl Valve Box Top 24 EA $14.50 $348.00 $13.16 $315.84 $13.25 $318.00
#1-41 16” Cl Valve Box Top 24 EA $21.45 $514.80 $18.95 $454.80 $19 $456
#1-42 26" Cl Valve Box Top 24 EA $33.90 $813.60 $36.32 $871.68 $36.50 $876.00
#1-43 5-1/4” Cl Valve Box Lid 24 EA $9.25 $222.00 $9.47 $227.28 $12 $288
#1-44 2-1/2” Hose Nozzle-Waterous 30 EA $118 $3,540.00 $120.57 $3,617.10 |No Bid No Bid

#1-45 4” Steamer Nozzle-Waterous 15 EA $335.40 $5,031.00 $342.48 $5,137.20 |No Bid No Bid

#1-46 2-1/2” Hose Nozzle-Mueller 15 EA $70.25 $1,053.75 $71.74 $1,076.10 |No Bid No Bid

#1-47 4” Steamer Nozzle-Mueller 10 EA $225.75 $2,257.50 $230.56 $2,305.60 |No Bid No Bid

#1-48 2-1/2” Hose Nozzle-M&H 30 EA $103.50 $3,105.00 $106.04 $3,181.20 $110 $3,300.00
#1-49 4” Steamer Nozzle-M&H 15 EA $158 $2,370.00 $232.83 $3,492.45 $225 $3,375.00
#1-50 5-1/4” Bronze Valve Seat-Waterous 20 EA $209.50 $4,190.00 $214.05 $4,281.00 |No Bid No Bid

#1-51 5-1/4” Bronze Valve Seat-Mueller 10 EA $270.50 $2,705.00 $276.34 $2,763.40 |No Bid No Bid

#1-52 3” Romac FL Coupling Adapter 3 EA $125 $375 $69.47 $208.41 $165 $495
#1-53 4” Romac FL Coupling Adapter 3 EA $165 $495 $93.86 $281.58 $175 $525
#1-54 2” IP Gate Valve (Sq. Nut) 6 EA $228 $1,368.00 $242.61 $1,455.66 $245 $1,470.00
#1-55 3” FL X FL Gate Valve 3 EA $345 $1,035.00 $352.60 $1,057.80 $340 $1,020.00
#1-56 4” FL X FL Gate Valve 3 EA $385 $1,155.00 $393.79 $1,181.37 $380 $1,140.00
#1-57 6” MJ Gate Valve 12 EA $491.87 $5,902.44 $507.40 $6,088.80 $495 $5,940.00
#1-58 6” MJ X FL Gate Valve 1 EA $514.69 $514.69 $507.40 $507.40 $495 $495
#1-59 8” MJ Gate Valve 6 EA $782.78 $4,696.68 $807.50 $4,845.00 $780 $4,680.00
#1-60 8” MJ X FL Gate Valve 1 EA $768.30 $768.30 $792.56 $792.56 $770 $770
#1-61 12” MJ Gate Valve 1 EA $1,544.06 $1,544.06 | $1,591.76 $1,591.76 | $1,550.00 $1,550.00
#1-62 12” MJ X FL Gate Valve 1 EA $1,473.85 $1,473.85 | $1,520.39 $1,520.39 | $1,490.00 $1,490.00
#1-63 16” MJ Gate Valve 1 EA $2,175.80 $2,175.80 | $4,845.36 $4,845.36 | $5,515.00 $5,515.00
#1-64 18” MJ Gate Valve 1 EA $8,227.60 $8,227.60 | $8,230.93 $8,230.93 | $10,025.00 $10,025.00
#1-65 20” MJ Gate Valve 1 EA $9,844.13 $9,844.13 | $9,882.47 $9,882.47 | $11,688.00 $11,688.00
#1-66 24” MJ Gate Valve 1 EA $14,049.92 $14,049.92 | $14,031.96 $14,031.96 | $16,100.00 $16,100.00
#1-67 12” X 6” Reducer 3 EA $103.50 $310.50 $83.67 $251.01 $85 $255
#1-68 12” X 6” MJ X FL Tee 3 EA $276.25 $828.75 $223.33 $669.99 $225 $675
#1-69 5/8” X 2-1/2” SS Bolt W/Nut 50 EA $1.14 $57.00 $1.05 $52.50 $1.50 $75.00
#1-70 5/8” X 3” SS Bolt W/Nut 50 EA $1.20 $60.00 $1.11 $55.50 $2 $100
#1-71 5/8” X 3-3/4” SS Bolt W/Nut 50 EA $1.54 $77.00 $1.42 $71.00 $2.50 $125.00




Discount By Brand Core and Main Ferguson Fortiline

American Darling 10% 20% No Bid
M&H 10% No Bid 10%

Pro Select No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tyler Union 10% No Bid 20%

Mueller 10% 20% No Bid

Waterous 10% 20% No Bid
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