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#1-1 Mobilization  (5% Max) 1.00 LS $ 900,000.0 $ 900,000.0 $ 880,934.0 $ 880,934.0 $ 930,000.0 $ 930,000.0 $ 950,000.0 $ 950,000.0 $ 890,000.0 $ 890,000.0

#1-2

Barricades, Signs  & Traffic Handling (incl. all 
detouring, electronic signs, signage, temp striping, 
and barriers) 1.00 LS $ 340,000.0 $ 340,000.0 $ 139,962.75 $ 139,962.75 $ 400,000.0 $ 400,000.0 $ 950,000.0 $ 950,000.0 $ 450,000.0 $ 450,000.0

#1-3 Project Sign 6.00 EA $ 2,000.0 $ 12,000.0 $ 482.86 $ 2,897.16 $ 750 $ 4,500.0 $ 1,000.0 $ 6,000.0 $ 1,000.0 $ 6,000.0

#1-4 Portable Changeable Message Sign (Allowance) 4.00 EA $ 9,000.0 $ 36,000.0 $ 16,820.0 $ 67,280.0 $ 9,000.0 $ 36,000.0 $ 5,000.0 $ 20,000.0 $ 25,000.0 $ 100,000.0

#1-5

Install, Maintain, & Remove Temporary Pavement 
(incl. excavation and fill)(6-inches 3600 psi concrete 
with #3 bars @ 24" OCEW on 6-inches of Flex Base 
w/ TX140 Geogrid) 6700.00 SY $ 90 $ 603,000.0 $ 58.44 $ 391,548.0 $ 90 $ 603,000.0 $ 50 $ 335,000.0 $ 52.27 $ 350,209.0

#1-6
6" Temp Type B Asphalt Driveway Pavement 
(Allowance) 2000.00 SY $ 25 $ 50,000.0 $ 39.61 $ 79,220.0 $ 50 $ 100,000.0 $ 35 $ 70,000.0 $ 53.47 $ 106,940.0

#1-7
Install/Maintain/Remove Temporary Metal Beam 
Guardfence (with Timber Post) 550.00 LF $ 40 $ 22,000.0 $ 116 $ 63,800.0 $ 60 $ 33,000.0 $ 20 $ 11,000.0 $ 2.58 $ 1,419.0

#1-8
Install/Maintain/Remove Low Profile Traffic Barrier 
over 6" Ty A non-reinf. Concrete (Allowance) 250.00 LF $ 20 $ 5,000.0 $ 127.88 $ 31,970.0 $ 130 $ 32,500.0 $ 70 $ 17,500.0 $ 125 $ 31,250.0

#1-9
Install, Maintain, & Remove Temporary Business 
Entrance Directional Signs (Allowance) 30.00 EA $ 400 $ 12,000.0 $ 145 $ 4,350.0 $ 250 $ 7,500.0 $ 400 $ 12,000.0 $ 200 $ 6,000.0

#1-10 General Site Preparation (incl. tree removal) 1.00 LS $ 880,000.0 $ 880,000.0 $ 262,898.0 $ 262,898.0 $ 650,000.0 $ 650,000.0 $ 815,000.0 $ 815,000.0 $ 638,996.0 $ 638,996.0

#1-11 Unclassified Street Excavation 42260.00 CY $ 17 $ 718,420.0 $ 12.76 $ 539,237.6 $ 17.5 $ 739,550.0 $ 30 $ 1,267,800.0 $ 22 $ 929,720.0

#1-12 Embankment (Roadway)(Density Control)(Ty D) 9190.00 CY $ 3 $ 27,570.0 $ 2.32 $ 21,320.8 $ 5 $ 45,950.0 $ 15 $ 137,850.0 $ 10 $ 91,900.0

#1-13
Embankment (Retaining Wall)(Density Control)(Ty 
C)(Retaining Wall) 1220.00 CY $ 37 $ 45,140.0 $ 8 $ 9,760.0 $ 55 $ 67,100.0 $ 45 $ 54,900.0 $ 50 $ 61,000.0

#1-14 Remove Exist Inlet 21.00 EA $ 2,100.0 $ 44,100.0 $ 844.63 $ 17,737.23 $ 1,500.0 $ 31,500.0 $ 450 $ 9,450.0 $ 3,000.0 $ 63,000.0

#1-15
Sawcut, Rem. & Disp. of Conc Pvmt (incl. curb and 
gutter) 50140.00 SY $ 10 $ 501,400.0 $ 10.61 $ 531,985.4 $ 11 $ 551,540.0 $ 10 $ 501,400.0 $ 9.43 $ 472,820.2

#1-16
Sawcut, Rem. & Disp. of Concrete Sidewalk and 
Ramp 3220 SY $ 10 $ 32,200.0 $ 4.06 $ 13,073.199999999999 $ 8 $ 25,760.0 $ 11 $ 35,420.0 $ 3.61 $ 11,624.199999999999

#1-17 Remove Paved Median and Pavers 820.00 SY $ 10 $ 8,200.0 $ 9.28 $ 7,609.599999999999 $ 15 $ 12,300.0 $ 10 $ 8,200.0 $ 8.25 $ 6,765.0

#1-18 Remove Ex Illumination Pole 37.00 EA $ 600 $ 22,200.0 $ 696 $ 25,752.0 $ 1,000.0 $ 37,000.0 $ 400 $ 14,800.0 $ 600 $ 22,200.0

#1-19 Remove Ex Illumination Foundation 37.00 EA $ 350 $ 12,950.0 $ 1,506.84 $ 55,753.079999999994 $ 1,000.0 $ 37,000.0 $ 375 $ 13,875.0 $ 233.92 $ 8,655.039999999999

#1-20
Remove Exist Street Sign (incl. post and base) and 
Exist Pavement Markings 1.00 LS $ 8,800.0 $ 8,800.0 $ 39,672.0 $ 39,672.0 $ 5,500.0 $ 5,500.0 $ 6,000.0 $ 6,000.0 $ 17,100.0 $ 17,100.0

#1-21
Remove, Storage, Reinstall Frisco Wayfinding Signs 
(incl. foundation/mounting design) 3.00 EA $ 3,000.0 $ 9,000.0 $ 5,784.42 $ 17,353.260000000002 $ 2,000.0 $ 6,000.0 $ 2,500.0 $ 7,500.0 $ 1,200.0 $ 3,600.0

#1-22
Remove Exist Fire Hydrant (deliver to Public Works 
building) 7.00 EA $ 2,750.0 $ 19,250.0 $ 794.55 $ 5,561.849999999999 $ 2,500.0 $ 17,500.0 $ 500 $ 3,500.0 $ 500 $ 3,500.0

#1-23
Remove Exist Stone Column and foundation (with 
lights) (NE Corner of Legacy and SH 121) 3.00 EA $ 1,500.0 $ 4,500.0 $ 1,740.0 $ 5,220.0 $ 2,500.0 $ 7,500.0 $ 500 $ 1,500.0 $ 316.88 $ 950.64

#1-24
Remove Exist Stone Column and foundation 
(without lights) (NE Corner of Legacy and SH 121) 1.00 EA $ 2,000.0 $ 2,000.0 $ 1,740.0 $ 1,740.0 $ 2,000.0 $ 2,000.0 $ 500 $ 500.0 $ 250.13 $ 250.13

#1-25
Remove and Dispose of Exist Wrought Iron Fence 
(incl. Masonry Column and Piers)(Golf Course) 330.00 LF $ 10 $ 3,300.0 $ 19.72 $ 6,507.599999999999 $ 12 $ 3,960.0 $ 2.5 $ 825.0 $ 8.72 $ 2,877.6000000000004

#1-26 Remove 21" RCP 120.00 LF $ 30 $ 3,600.0 $ 20.84 $ 2,500.8 $ 15 $ 1,800.0 $ 13 $ 1,560.0 $ 41.65 $ 4,998.0

#1-27 Remove 24" RCP 30.00 LF $ 30 $ 900.0 $ 18.14 $ 544.2 $ 20 $ 600.0 $ 13 $ 390.0 $ 41.65 $ 1,249.5

#1-28 Remove 36" RCP 440.00 LF $ 40 $ 17,600.0 $ 18.49 $ 8,135.599999999999 $ 25 $ 11,000.0 $ 13 $ 5,720.0 $ 41.39 $ 18,211.6

#1-29 Remove Stone Retaining Wall (up to 5' tall) 240.00 LF $ 20 $ 4,800.0 $ 26.99 $ 6,477.599999999999 $ 30 $ 7,200.0 $ 17 $ 4,080.0 $ 15.84 $ 3,801.6

Bid 2102-050 Legacy Drive Reconstruction
Opened 5/6/2021 at 2:00 PM CDT $ 17,601,420.099999998 $ 17,234,545.150000013 $ 18,912,840.459999993 $ 19,487,053.609999996 $ 18,199,496.219999995

Mario sinacola & Sons Excavating, Inc. McMahon Contracting RPM xConstruction Ragle Inc. Texas Sterling Construction



#1-30 Remove Exist Solar Irrigation Controller 3.00 EA $ 350 $ 1,050.0 $ 964.07 $ 2,892.21 $ 2,000.0 $ 6,000.0 $ 2,000.0 $ 6,000.0 $ 500 $ 1,500.0

#1-31
Remove Exist Water Meter / Service and Cap at 
Main Line 6.00 EA $ 1,750.0 $ 10,500.0 $ 826.38 $ 4,958.28 $ 1,500.0 $ 9,000.0 $ 400 $ 2,400.0 $ 500 $ 3,000.0

#1-32 Remove Bridge Rail 220.00 LF $ 45 $ 9,900.0 $ 29.85 $ 6,567.0 $ 50 $ 11,000.0 $ 20 $ 4,400.0 $ 7 $ 1,540.0

#1-33
Adjust Exist Sanitary Sewer Manhole (replace w/ 
new Cone, Ring & Cover) 2.00 EA $ 2,750.0 $ 5,500.0 $ 3,682.6 $ 7,365.2 $ 3,000.0 $ 6,000.0 $ 1,100.0 $ 2,200.0 $ 1,202.85 $ 2,405.7

#1-34 Remove Columns and Foundation/Piers 11.00 EA $ 250 $ 2,750.0 $ 850.43 $ 9,354.73 $ 600 $ 6,600.0 $ 500 $ 5,500.0 $ 345.69 $ 3,802.59

#1-35

Install, Maintain, & Remove 6 foot tall Chain Link 
Fence w/ Post (Retaining Wall Construction 
Protection)(incl. filter fabric) 300.00 LF $ 10 $ 3,000.0 $ 14.56 $ 4,368.0 $ 28 $ 8,400.0 $ 30 $ 9,000.0 $ 15 $ 4,500.0

#1-36

9" Reinf. Concrete Pavement (Class P1 - 4,000 psi 
Machine Pour) or (Class P2 - 4,500 psi Hand 
Pour)(incl. 6" Mono Curb) 59588 SY $ 57 $ 3,396,516.0 $ 54.26 $ 3,233,244.88 $ 60 $ 3,575,280.0 $ 80 $ 4,767,040.0 $ 78 $ 4,647,864.0

#1-37
12" FL BS (CMP IN PLC)(TY D GR 1-2) with BX2525 
Geogrid orTX140 Geogrid 58252 SY $ 18.5 $ 1,077,662.0 $ 17.48 $ 1,018,244.9600000001 $ 25 $ 1,456,300.0 $ 20 $ 1,165,040.0 $ 15.46 $ 900,575.92

#1-38
36" FL BS (CMP IN PLC)(TY D GR 1-2) with BX 2525 
Geogrid or  TX140 Geogrid 14321 SY $ 46 $ 658,766.0 $ 48.72 $ 697,719.12 $ 55 $ 787,655.0 $ 50 $ 716,050.0 $ 43.3 $ 620,099.2999999999

#1-39 10" TxDOT CRCP 1380 SY $ 87 $ 120,060.0 $ 99.01 $ 136,633.80000000002 $ 90 $ 124,200.0 $ 100 $ 138,000.0 $ 95.44 $ 131,707.19999999998

#1-40 4" HMAC (TY B) 310 TON $ 112 $ 34,720.0 $ 112.17 $ 34,772.7 $ 110 $ 34,100.0 $ 96.7 $ 29,977.0 $ 96.7 $ 29,977.0

#1-41 Lime Treat Exist Subgrade (12") 1400 SY $ 10 $ 14,000.0 $ 25.73 $ 36,022.0 $ 15 $ 21,000.0 $ 6.5 $ 9,100.0 $ 15.49 $ 21,686.0

#1-42 Hydrated Lime (11%) 7 TON $ 170 $ 1,190.0 $ 189.08 $ 1,323.5600000000002 $ 165 $ 1,155.0 $ 160 $ 1,120.0 $ 163 $ 1,141.0

#1-43

9" Min. Reinf. Concrete Driveway 3600 psi (Include 
Curb)(Compacted Subgrade) (Outside of City 
ROW)(HES) 360 SY $ 85 $ 30,600.0 $ 67.7 $ 24,372.0 $ 90 $ 32,400.0 $ 75 $ 27,000.0 $ 77.75 $ 27,990.0

#1-44
9" HES Concrete Paving (incl. 6" Mono Curb)(Incl. 
Intersections and Driveways) 8673 SY $ 65 $ 563,745.0 $ 66.86 $ 579,876.78 $ 80 $ 693,840.0 $ 50 $ 433,650.0 $ 88.79 $ 770,075.67

#1-45

9" HES Concrete Paving (Panel Replacement incl. 
12" FL BS (CMP IN PLC)(TY D GR 1-2) with BX2525 
Geogrid or TX140 Geogrid)(Allowance) 3000.00 SY $ 175 $ 525,000.0 $ 109.8 $ 329,400.0 $ 90 $ 270,000.0 $ 50 $ 150,000.0 $ 116.71 $ 350,130.0

#1-46

Raising and Undersealing Concrete Slab w/ 
Polyurethane (3 lbs/sy)(incl. concrete joint grinding 
at transverse joints and reseal)(2500 LF Concrete 
Grinding is Subsidiary) 24000.00 LBS $ 5 $ 120,000.0 $ 4.52 $ 108,479.99999999999 $ 5 $ 120,000.0 $ 8.5 $ 204,000.0 $ 5.54 $ 132,960.0

#1-47
2" Type D Asphalt Overlay over Exist Concrete 
(Allowance) 2000.00 SY $ 21 $ 42,000.0 $ 21.46 $ 42,920.0 $ 20 $ 40,000.0 $ 18.5 $ 37,000.0 $ 18.5 $ 37,000.0

#1-48 4" Thick Up to 6' Wide Concrete Sidewalk 2520 SY $ 53 $ 133,560.0 $ 60.32 $ 152,006.4 $ 60 $ 151,200.0 $ 45 $ 113,400.0 $ 63.54 $ 160,120.8

#1-49 6" Thick 7'-10' Wide Concrete Sidewalk 1000.00 SY $ 60 $ 60,000.0 $ 58.23 $ 58,230.0 $ 80 $ 80,000.0 $ 50 $ 50,000.0 $ 64.62 $ 64,620.00000000001

#1-50
Construct 6" Thick Sidewalk Wall (Height Varies) (w/ 
2" form liner) 2339 SF $ 22 $ 51,458.0 $ 23.2 $ 54,264.799999999996 $ 50 $ 116,950.0 $ 40 $ 93,560.0 $ 33.73 $ 78,894.46999999999

#1-51 Decorative Stone Veneer (Sidewalk Wall)(2") 2339 SF $ 20 $ 46,780.0 $ 31.67 $ 74,076.13 $ 30 $ 70,170.0 $ 18.5 $ 43,271.5 $ 29.91 $ 69,959.49

#1-52
Curb Ramp TxDOT TY 7  (w/ Tekway Dome) 
(regardless of width) 60 EA $ 2,200.0 $ 132,000.0 $ 1,914.0 $ 114,840.0 $ 2,000.0 $ 120,000.0 $ 1,750.0 $ 105,000.0 $ 2,500.0 $ 150,000.0

#1-53
Curb Ramp TxDOT TY 2  (w/ Tekway Dome) 
(regardless of width) 1.00 EA $ 2,400.0 $ 2,400.0 $ 2,146.0 $ 2,146.0 $ 2,000.0 $ 2,000.0 $ 1,700.0 $ 1,700.0 $ 3,000.0 $ 3,000.0

#1-54
Curb Ramp TxDOT TY 10  (w/ Tekway Dome) 
(regardless of width) 10.00 EA $ 2,400.0 $ 24,000.0 $ 2,262.0 $ 22,620.0 $ 2,200.0 $ 22,000.0 $ 2,000.0 $ 20,000.0 $ 2,300.0 $ 23,000.0

#1-55 Construct 6" Sidwalk Curb (Mono) (Allowance) 200.00 LF $ 25 $ 5,000.0 $ 17.4 $ 3,479.9999999999995 $ 6 $ 1,200.0 $ 11 $ 2,200.0 $ 20 $ 4,000.0

#1-56 Mono Median Nose (Type 1) 20.00 EA $ 1,100.0 $ 22,000.0 $ 1,512.76 $ 30,255.2 $ 1,500.0 $ 30,000.0 $ 800 $ 16,000.0 $ 2,000.0 $ 40,000.0

#1-57 Mono Median Nose (Type 2) 13.00 EA $ 1,300.0 $ 16,900.0 $ 2,162.08 $ 28,107.04 $ 1,600.0 $ 20,800.0 $ 1,000.0 $ 13,000.0 $ 1,800.0 $ 23,400.0

#1-58 Median Pavers w/Conc. Base 18612 SF $ 14 $ 260,568.0 $ 15.99 $ 297,605.88 $ 15 $ 279,180.0 $ 12 $ 223,344.0 $ 11.8 $ 219,621.6

#1-59
Remove, Store and Replace Median Pavers (incl. 
concrete base)(SH 121) 480.00 SF $ 15 $ 7,200.0 $ 18.56 $ 8,908.8 $ 20 $ 9,600.0 $ 9 $ 4,320.0 $ 14.87 $ 7,137.599999999999



#1-60 Median Maintenance Ramp 13.00 EA $ 1,100.0 $ 14,300.0 $ 658.68 $ 8,562.84 $ 1,500.0 $ 19,500.0 $ 750 $ 9,750.0 $ 192.09 $ 2,497.17

#1-61
Metal Beam Guard Fence (CL. A, TY 1 Steel Post w/ 
Conc. Mow Strip) 50.00 LF $ 25 $ 1,250.0 $ 64.96 $ 3,247.9999999999995 $ 85 $ 4,250.0 $ 33.76 $ 1,688.0 $ 54.05 $ 2,702.5

#1-62
Metal Beam Guard Fence Transition (Thrie-
Beam)(w/ Conc. Mow Strip) 4.00 EA $ 1,800.0 $ 7,200.0 $ 2,842.0 $ 11,368.0 $ 2,500.0 $ 10,000.0 $ 1,768.0 $ 7,072.0 $ 2,135.59 $ 8,542.36

#1-63 Single Guardrail Terminal (SGT)(w/ Conc. Mow Strip) 4.00 EA $ 2,500.0 $ 10,000.0 $ 4,002.0 $ 16,008.0 $ 3,750.0 $ 15,000.0 $ 1,768.0 $ 7,072.0 $ 3,510.91 $ 14,043.64

#1-64 Bridge Approach Slab (TxDOT BAS-C)(9-inch thick) 310.00 SY $ 260 $ 80,600.0 $ 186.91 $ 57,942.1 $ 375 $ 116,250.0 $ 160 $ 49,600.0 $ 120.68 $ 37,410.8

#1-65
3' x 3' x 5' Masonary Column, Pier and Cap (Match 
exiting material and size) (~ Sta SPGL 32+90) 1.00 EA $ 3,500.0 $ 3,500.0 $ 6,380.0 $ 6,380.0 $ 2,500.0 $ 2,500.0 $ 4,300.0 $ 4,300.0 $ 2,175.0 $ 2,175.0

#1-66
Concrete Riprap (Slope Paving) (4 IN)(3,000 psi)(w/ 
WWR reinforcement) along SH 121 SBFR 10.00 SY $ 125 $ 1,250.0 $ 96.4 $ 964.0 $ 150 $ 1,500.0 $ 65 $ 650.0 $ 149.64 $ 1,496.3999999999999

#1-67

Remove & Replace Exist Sidewalk Wall (SB Legacy at 
SH 121 SBFR NW Corner) (Match Exist Pattern & 
Color)(Approx. 3' tall) 100.00 SF $ 70 $ 7,000.0 $ 11.1 $ 1,110.0 $ 100 $ 10,000.0 $ 40 $ 4,000.0 $ 58.68 $ 5,868.0

#1-68
Remove & Replace Exist Sidewalk & Ramp (SB 
Legacy at SH 121 SBFR NW Corner) 30.00 SY $ 150 $ 4,500.0 $ 261 $ 7,830.0 $ 110 $ 3,300.0 $ 72 $ 2,160.0 $ 205.6 $ 6,168.0

#1-69 CL C Conc (Rail Foundation) 3.00 CY $ 2,300.0 $ 6,900.0 $ 1,168.2 $ 3,504.6000000000004 $ 1,000.0 $ 3,000.0 $ 600 $ 1,800.0 $ 889.49 $ 2,668.4700000000003

#1-70 Riprap (Conc)(4 in)(3,000 psi) 4.00 CY $ 1,000.0 $ 4,000.0 $ 600.13 $ 2,400.52 $ 550 $ 2,200.0 $ 650 $ 2,600.0 $ 622.89 $ 2,491.56

#1-71 Rail (Handrail) (TY E) 20.00 LF $ 150 $ 3,000.0 $ 173.92 $ 3,478.3999999999996 $ 250 $ 5,000.0 $ 125 $ 2,500.0 $ 302.11 $ 6,042.200000000001

#1-72 Retrofit Rail (TY C2P) 350.00 LF $ 375 $ 131,250.0 $ 384.74 $ 134,659.0 $ 325 $ 113,750.0 $ 240 $ 84,000.0 $ 410.18 $ 143,563.0

#1-73 Retaining Wall (Spread footing) (Golfcourse) 2280.00 SF $ 115 $ 262,200.0 $ 91.15 $ 207,822.0 $ 80 $ 182,400.0 $ 47 $ 107,160.0 $ 54.73 $ 124,784.4

#1-74
Retaining Wall (Golfcourse)(Decorative Stone 
Veneer)(4") 2808.00 SF $ 29 $ 81,432.0 $ 31.67 $ 88,929.36 $ 40 $ 112,320.0 $ 18.5 $ 51,948.0 $ 20.16 $ 56,609.28

#1-75 Retaining Wall (Golfcourse)(Cap Stone) 264.00 LF $ 1 $ 264.0 $ 121.8 $ 32,155.2 $ 60 $ 15,840.0 $ 40 $ 10,560.0 $ 44.49 $ 11,745.36

#1-76 Temporary SPL Shoring (Retaining Wall) 1.00 LS $ 6,500.0 $ 6,500.0 $ 9,338.0 $ 9,338.0 $ 45,000.0 $ 45,000.0 $ 10,000.0 $ 10,000.0 $ 40,000.0 $ 40,000.0

#1-77 Concrete Riprap (Mow Strip) (4 IN)(3,000 psi) 6.00 CY $ 1,000.0 $ 6,000.0 $ 544.01 $ 3,264.06 $ 550 $ 3,300.0 $ 530 $ 3,180.0 $ 619.89 $ 3,719.34

#1-78 CL B Conc (Flume) (Retaining Wall) 88.00 SY $ 265 $ 23,320.0 $ 104.26 $ 9,174.880000000001 $ 225 $ 19,800.0 $ 80 $ 7,040.0 $ 87.97 $ 7,741.36

#1-79 Perforated Pipe Underdrains (TY 6) (6") 210.00 LF $ 15 $ 3,150.0 $ 58.57 $ 12,299.7 $ 20 $ 4,200.0 $ 25 $ 5,250.0 $ 19.12 $ 4,015.2000000000003

#1-80
Connect Wall Pipe Underdrains to Storm Drain 
System 1.00 EA $ 1,500.0 $ 1,500.0 $ 2,232.11 $ 2,232.11 $ 3,000.0 $ 3,000.0 $ 575 $ 575.0 $ 1,000.0 $ 1,000.0

#1-81
Remove Exist Block Retaining Wall (adjacent to Golf 
Course) 20.00 LF $ 50 $ 1,000.0 $ 100.61 $ 2,012.2 $ 75 $ 1,500.0 $ 50 $ 1,000.0 $ 47.53 $ 950.6

#1-82 Storm Water Pollution Prevention Plan 1.00 LS $ 750 $ 750.0 $ 2,900.0 $ 2,900.0 $ 1,200.0 $ 1,200.0 $ 730,000.0 $ 730,000.0 $ 2,000.0 $ 2,000.0

#1-83
Inlet Protection Devices (Inst./Maint./Rem.)(Erosion 
Control Logs) 66.00 EA $ 160 $ 10,560.0 $ 268.6 $ 17,727.600000000002 $ 250 $ 16,500.0 $ 120 $ 7,920.0 $ 231.55 $ 15,282.300000000001

#1-84 Silt Fence (Inst./Maint./Rem.) 2810.00 LF $ 1.84 $ 5,170.400000000001 $ 3.67 $ 10,312.699999999999 $ 2 $ 5,620.0 $ 5 $ 14,050.0 $ 3.19 $ 8,963.9

#1-85 Construction Exit 5.00 EA $ 3,000.0 $ 15,000.0 $ 3,458.2 $ 17,291.0 $ 3,500.0 $ 17,500.0 $ 5,000.0 $ 25,000.0 $ 2,981.21 $ 14,906.05

#1-86 Rock Filter Dam (Inst./Maint./Rem.) 270.00 LF $ 43 $ 11,610.0 $ 41.45 $ 11,191.5 $ 30 $ 8,100.0 $ 40 $ 10,800.0 $ 35.73 $ 9,647.099999999999

#1-87
Install New Sign & Sign Post Assembly (Frisco 
Standard) 120.00 EA $ 440 $ 52,800.0 $ 551 $ 66,120.0 $ 350 $ 42,000.0 $ 335.5 $ 40,260.0 $ 470 $ 56,400.0

#1-88
Install New Sign & Sign Post Assembly (TxDOT 
Standard)(SH 121) 2.00 EA $ 1,200.0 $ 2,400.0 $ 841 $ 1,682.0 $ 1,000.0 $ 2,000.0 $ 549.5 $ 1,099.0 $ 1,050.0 $ 2,100.0

#1-89
Refl Pav Mrk TY I & II (W) 4"(SLD) (100MIL) Includes 
Surface Prep Sealant 1630.00 LF $ 1.45 $ 2,363.5 $ 1.28 $ 2,086.4 $ 1.2 $ 1,956.0 $ 1.32 $ 2,151.6 $ 1.32 $ 2,151.6



#1-90
Refl Pav Mrk TY I & II (Y) 4"(SLD) (100MIL) Includes 
Surface Prep Sealant 490.00 LF $ 1.45 $ 710.5 $ 1.28 $ 627.2 $ 1.2 $ 588.0 $ 1.7 $ 833.0 $ 1.7 $ 833.0

#1-91

Refl Pav Mrk TY I & II (W) 4"(BRK) (100MIL) Includes 
Surface Prep Sealant, 4" WHITE DASH (10' SOLID 
WITH 30' GAP) 7970.00 LF $ 1.65 $ 13,150.5 $ 1.45 $ 11,556.5 $ 1.2 $ 9,564.0 $ 1.26 $ 10,042.2 $ 1.26 $ 10,042.2

#1-92

Refl Pav Mrk TY I & II (W) 4"(DOT) (100MIL) 
Includes Surface Prep Sealant, 4" WHITE DASH (2' 
SOLID WITH 4' GAP) 1870.00 LF $ 2.45 $ 4,581.5 $ 3.77 $ 7,049.9 $ 1.2 $ 2,244.0 $ 1.3 $ 2,431.0 $ 1.3 $ 2,431.0

#1-93

Refl Pav Mrk TY I & II (W) 4"(DOT) (100MIL) 
Includes Surface Prep Sealant, 4" WHITE DASH (2' 
SOLID WITH 2' GAP) 1150.00 LF $ 2.45 $ 2,817.5 $ 3.77 $ 4,335.5 $ 1.2 $ 1,380.0 $ 1.32 $ 1,518.0 $ 1.32 $ 1,518.0

#1-94

Refl Pav Mrk TY I & II (W) 4"(DOT) (100MIL) 
Includes Surface Prep Sealant, 4" WHITE DOT (3' 
SOLID WITH 9' GAP) 1240.00 LF $ 2.45 $ 3,038.0 $ 3.77 $ 4,674.8 $ 1.2 $ 1,488.0 $ 1.32 $ 1,636.8000000000002 $ 1.32 $ 1,636.8000000000002

#1-95
Refl Pav Mrk TY I & II (W) 8" (SLD) (100MIL) Includes 
Surface Prep Sealant 13060.00 LF $ 2.45 $ 31,997.000000000004 $ 2.61 $ 34,086.6 $ 2.2 $ 28,732.000000000004 $ 1.38 $ 18,022.8 $ 1.38 $ 18,022.8

#1-96

Refl Pav Mrk TY I & II (W) 8" (DOT) (100MIL) 
Includes Surface Prep Sealant, 8' DOT (3' SOLID 
WHITE WITH 9' GAP) 330.00 LF $ 4.25 $ 1,402.5 $ 2.9 $ 957.0 $ 2.2 $ 726.0000000000001 $ 1.4 $ 461.99999999999994 $ 1.4 $ 461.99999999999994

#1-97
Refl Pav Mrk TY I & II (W) 12" (SLD) (100MIL) 
Includes Surface Prep SealanT 700.00 LF $ 5 $ 3,500.0 $ 4.93 $ 3,451.0 $ 6 $ 4,200.0 $ 3.5 $ 2,450.0 $ 3.5 $ 2,450.0

#1-98
Refl Pav Mrk TY I & II (Y) 12" (SLD) (100MIL) 
Includes Surface Prep Sealant 120.00 LF $ 5 $ 600.0 $ 4.93 $ 591.5999999999999 $ 6 $ 720.0 $ 3.5 $ 420.0 $ 3.5 $ 420.0

#1-99
Refl Pav Mrk TY I & II (W) 24" (SLD) (100MIL) 
Includes Surface Prep Sealant 2660.00 LF $ 10 $ 26,600.0 $ 8.7 $ 23,141.999999999996 $ 11.5 $ 30,590.0 $ 5.89 $ 15,667.4 $ 5.89 $ 15,667.4

#1-100
Refl Pav Mrk TY I & II (W) (WORD) (100MIL) 
Includes Surface Prep Sealant 50.00 EA $ 185 $ 9,250.0 $ 168.2 $ 8,410.0 $ 200 $ 10,000.0 $ 120 $ 6,000.0 $ 120 $ 6,000.0

#1-101
Refl Pav Mrk TY I & II (W) (BIKE SYMBOL) (100MIL) 
Includes Surface Prep Sealant 10.00 EA $ 275 $ 2,750.0 $ 348 $ 3,480.0 $ 475 $ 4,750.0 $ 170 $ 1,700.0 $ 170 $ 1,700.0

#1-102
Refl Pav Mrk TY I & II (W) (ARROW) (100MIL) 
Includes Surface Prep Sealant 90.00 EA $ 165 $ 14,850.0 $ 174 $ 15,660.0 $ 160 $ 14,400.0 $ 119 $ 10,710.0 $ 119 $ 10,710.0

#1-103 Refl Pav MRKR TY I-C 90.00 EA $ 5 $ 450.0 $ 4.76 $ 428.4 $ 5 $ 450.0 $ 4 $ 360.0 $ 4 $ 360.0

#1-104 Refl Pav MRKR TY II-C-R 1820.00 EA $ 5 $ 9,100.0 $ 4.76 $ 8,663.199999999999 $ 5 $ 9,100.0 $ 3.2 $ 5,824.0 $ 3.2 $ 5,824.0

#1-105
Traffic Button TY II-C-R (4" Square Acrylic Reflective 
Button) 10.00 EA $ 6.75 $ 67.5 $ 4.76 $ 47.599999999999994 $ 5.5 $ 55.0 $ 4 $ 40.0 $ 4 $ 40.0

#1-106
Traffic Button TY W (4" Round Ceramic Non-
Reflective Button) 20.00 EA $ 3.65 $ 73.0 $ 4.76 $ 95.19999999999999 $ 5.5 $ 110.0 $ 4 $ 80.0 $ 4 $ 80.0

#1-107 Drill Shaft (TRF Sig Pole) (24")(PED Pole) 96.00 LF $ 305 $ 29,280.0 $ 353.8 $ 33,964.8 $ 335 $ 32,160.0 $ 127.2 $ 12,211.2 $ 305 $ 29,280.0

#1-108
Drill Shaft (TRF Sig Pole) (24")(PED Pole) (at 
Legacy/SH 121) 6.00 LF $ 305 $ 1,830.0 $ 353.8 $ 2,122.8 $ 335 $ 2,010.0 $ 127.2 $ 763.2 $ 305 $ 1,830.0

#1-109 Drill Shaft (TRF Sig Pole) (36") 26.00 LF $ 390 $ 10,140.0 $ 452.4 $ 11,762.4 $ 450 $ 11,700.0 $ 233.2 $ 6,063.2 $ 390 $ 10,140.0

#1-110 Drill Shaft (TRF Sig Pole) (48") 176.00 LF $ 440 $ 77,440.0 $ 510.4 $ 89,830.4 $ 525 $ 92,400.0 $ 445.2 $ 78,355.2 $ 440 $ 77,440.0

#1-111 Drill Shaft (TRF Sig Pole) (48") (at Legacy/SH 121) 44.00 LF $ 440 $ 19,360.0 $ 510.4 $ 22,457.6 $ 525 $ 23,100.0 $ 445.2 $ 19,588.8 $ 440 $ 19,360.0

#1-112 Elec Condr (NO.12) Insulated 732.00 LF $ 2 $ 1,464.0 $ 2.32 $ 1,698.2399999999998 $ 2 $ 1,464.0 $ 0.73 $ 534.36 $ 2 $ 1,464.0

#1-113 Elec Condr (NO.8) Insulated 9898.00 LF $ 2 $ 19,796.0 $ 2.32 $ 22,963.359999999997 $ 2 $ 19,796.0 $ 1.26 $ 12,471.48 $ 2 $ 19,796.0

#1-114 Elec Condr (NO.6) Bare 5267.00 LF $ 2 $ 10,534.0 $ 2.32 $ 12,219.439999999999 $ 2 $ 10,534.0 $ 1.25 $ 6,583.75 $ 2 $ 10,534.0

#1-115 Elec Condr (NO.4) Insulated 633 LF $ 3 $ 1,899.0 $ 3.48 $ 2,202.84 $ 3 $ 1,899.0 $ 1.96 $ 1,240.68 $ 3 $ 1,899.0

#1-116 Condt (PVC) (Sch 40) (2") 174.00 LF $ 17 $ 2,958.0 $ 19.72 $ 3,431.2799999999997 $ 14.5 $ 2,523.0 $ 8.86 $ 1,541.6399999999999 $ 17 $ 2,958.0

#1-117 Condt (PVC) (Sch 40) (2") (at Legacy/SH 121) 618.00 LF $ 17 $ 10,506.0 $ 19.72 $ 12,186.96 $ 14.5 $ 8,961.0 $ 8.86 $ 5,475.48 $ 17 $ 10,506.0

#1-118 Condt (PVC) (Sch 40) (2")(Bore) 2529 LF $ 34 $ 85,986.0 $ 39.44 $ 99,743.76 $ 27 $ 68,283.0 $ 18.9 $ 47,798.1 $ 34 $ 85,986.0

#1-119 Condt (PVC) (Sch 40) (3") 728 LF $ 20 $ 14,560.0 $ 23.2 $ 16,889.6 $ 16 $ 11,648.0 $ 13.5 $ 9,828.0 $ 20 $ 14,560.0



#1-120 Condt (PVC) (Sch 40) (3") (at Legacy/SH 121) 42.00 LF $ 20 $ 840.0 $ 23.2 $ 974.4 $ 15 $ 630.0 $ 13.5 $ 567.0 $ 20 $ 840.0

#1-121 Condt (PVC) (Sch 40) (4") 528.00 LF $ 22 $ 11,616.0 $ 25.52 $ 13,474.56 $ 16 $ 8,448.0 $ 15.65 $ 8,263.2 $ 22 $ 11,616.0

#1-122 Condt (PVC) (Sch 40) (4")(BORE) 2119.00 LF $ 39 $ 82,641.0 $ 45.24 $ 95,863.56 $ 50 $ 105,950.0 $ 33.2 $ 70,350.8 $ 39 $ 82,641.0

#1-123 Condt (PVC) (Sch 40) (4")(BORE) (at Legacy/SH 121) 117.00 LF $ 39 $ 4,563.0 $ 45.24 $ 5,293.08 $ 50 $ 5,850.0 $ 33.2 $ 3,884.4000000000005 $ 39 $ 4,563.0

#1-124
Removal of Signal Pole Assm (at Legacy/SH 121) 
(OMITTED) 0 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 0 $ 0 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-125
Removal of Signal Pole Assm (at Legacy/Warren) 
(OMITTED) 0 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 0 $ 0 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-126 Remove Ped Pole Assembly (Incl. Foundation) 3.00 EA $ 275 $ 825.0 $ 1,528.88 $ 4,586.64 $ 1,900.0 $ 5,700.0 $ 700 $ 2,100.0 $ 275 $ 825.0

#1-127
Reloc TRF SG PL AM(S) SNGL MST ARM Pole (at 
Legacy/Warren) 1.00 EA $ 3,200.0 $ 3,200.0 $ 3,712.0 $ 3,712.0 $ 8,800.0 $ 8,800.0 $ 3,000.0 $ 3,000.0 $ 3,200.0 $ 3,200.0

#1-128 Removal of Traffic GRND Boxes (OMITTED) 0 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 0 $ 0 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-129
Removal of Traffic GRND Boxes (at Legacy/SH 121) 
(OMITTED) 0 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 0 $ 0 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-130
Removal of Control Cabinet (GRND MNT)(Incl. 
Foundation) 5.00 EA $ 450 $ 2,250.0 $ 1,682.0 $ 8,410.0 $ 4,500.0 $ 22,500.0 $ 1,000.0 $ 5,000.0 $ 450 $ 2,250.0

#1-131
Remove Traffic Signals (at Legacy/SH 121) (at 
Legacy/SH 121) 1.00 EA $ 2,000.0 $ 2,000.0 $ 2,320.0 $ 2,320.0 $ 7,200.0 $ 7,200.0 $ 10,000.0 $ 10,000.0 $ 2,000.0 $ 2,000.0

#1-132
Remove Traffic Signals (at Legacy/Town and 
Country) 1.00 EA $ 2,000.0 $ 2,000.0 $ 2,320.0 $ 2,320.0 $ 7,200.0 $ 7,200.0 $ 10,000.0 $ 10,000.0 $ 2,000.0 $ 2,000.0

#1-133 Remove Traffic Signals (at Legacy/Warren) 1.00 EA $ 2,000.0 $ 2,000.0 $ 2,320.0 $ 2,320.0 $ 7,200.0 $ 7,200.0 $ 10,000.0 $ 10,000.0 $ 2,000.0 $ 2,000.0

#1-134
Installation of Highway Traffic Signal (at 
Legacy/Town and Country) 1.00 EA $ 7,500.0 $ 7,500.0 $ 8,700.0 $ 8,700.0 $ 25,500.0 $ 25,500.0 $ 15,000.0 $ 15,000.0 $ 7,500.0 $ 7,500.0

#1-135
Installation of Highway Traffic Signal (at 
Legacy/Country Club) 1.00 EA $ 7,500.0 $ 7,500.0 $ 8,700.0 $ 8,700.0 $ 25,500.0 $ 25,500.0 $ 15,000.0 $ 15,000.0 $ 7,500.0 $ 7,500.0

#1-136
Installation of Highway Traffic Signal 
(Upgrade)(Traffic Mod) (at Legacy/SH 121) 1.00 EA $ 7,500.0 $ 7,500.0 $ 8,700.0 $ 8,700.0 $ 25,000.0 $ 25,000.0 $ 10,000.0 $ 10,000.0 $ 7,500.0 $ 7,500.0

#1-137
Installation of Highway Traffic Signal 
(Upgrade)(Traffic Mod) (at Legacy/Stonebriar) 1.00 EA $ 4,500.0 $ 4,500.0 $ 8,700.0 $ 8,700.0 $ 25,000.0 $ 25,000.0 $ 10,000.0 $ 10,000.0 $ 4,500.0 $ 4,500.0

#1-138
Installation of Highway Traffic Signal 
(Upgrade)(Traffic Mod) (at Legacy/Warren) 1.00 EA $ 4,500.0 $ 4,500.0 $ 5,220.0 $ 5,220.0 $ 25,000.0 $ 25,000.0 $ 10,000.0 $ 10,000.0 $ 4,500.0 $ 4,500.0

#1-139
Temporary Traffic Signals (at Legacy/Town and 
Country) 1.00 EA $ 58,000.0 $ 58,000.0 $ 67,280.0 $ 67,280.0 $ 50,000.0 $ 50,000.0 $ 106,600.0 $ 106,600.0 $ 58,000.0 $ 58,000.0

#1-140 Temporary Traffic Signals (at Legacy/Country Club) 1.00 EA $ 58,000.0 $ 58,000.0 $ 67,280.0 $ 67,280.0 $ 50,000.0 $ 50,000.0 $ 106,600.0 $ 106,600.0 $ 58,000.0 $ 58,000.0

#1-141 Temporary Traffic Signals (at Legacy/Stonebriar) 1.00 EA $ 24,000.0 $ 24,000.0 $ 27,840.0 $ 27,840.0 $ 50,000.0 $ 50,000.0 $ 106,600.0 $ 106,600.0 $ 24,000.0 $ 24,000.0

#1-142 TRF SIG CBL (TY A)(14 AWG)(5 Condr) 1975.00 LF $ 2 $ 3,950.0 $ 2.32 $ 4,582.0 $ 3 $ 5,925.0 $ 1.84 $ 3,634.0 $ 2 $ 3,950.0

#1-143
TRF SIG CBL (TY A)(14 AWG)(5 Condr) (at Legacy/SH 
121) 515.00 LF $ 2 $ 1,030.0 $ 2.32 $ 1,194.8 $ 3 $ 1,545.0 $ 1.84 $ 947.6 $ 2 $ 1,030.0

#1-144 TRF SIG CBL (TY A)(14 AWG)(7 Condr) 1357.00 LF $ 2 $ 2,714.0 $ 2.32 $ 3,148.24 $ 3 $ 4,071.0 $ 2.05 $ 2,781.85 $ 2 $ 2,714.0

#1-145
TRF SIG CBL (TY A)(14 AWG)(7 Condr) (at Legacy/SH 
121) 2159.00 LF $ 2 $ 4,318.0 $ 2.32 $ 5,008.88 $ 3 $ 6,477.0 $ 2.05 $ 4,425.95 $ 2 $ 4,318.0

#1-146 TRF SIG CBL (TY A)(14 AWG)(10 Condr) 2747.00 LF $ 4 $ 10,988.0 $ 4.64 $ 12,746.08 $ 4.5 $ 12,361.5 $ 3.06 $ 8,405.82 $ 4 $ 10,988.0

#1-147 TRF SIG CBL (TY A)(14 AWG)(12 Condr) 3370.00 LF $ 4 $ 13,480.0 $ 4.64 $ 15,636.8 $ 5 $ 16,850.0 $ 4.1 $ 13,816.999999999998 $ 4 $ 13,480.0

#1-148 TRF SIG CBL (TY A)(14 AWG)(20 Condr) 2792.00 LF $ 5 $ 13,960.0 $ 5.8 $ 16,193.6 $ 8 $ 22,336.0 $ 7.16 $ 19,990.72 $ 5 $ 13,960.0

#1-149
TRF SIG CBL (TY A)(14 AWG)(20 Condr) (at 
Legacy/SH 121) 900.00 LF $ 5 $ 4,500.0 $ 5.8 $ 5,220.0 $ 8 $ 7,200.0 $ 7.16 $ 6,444.0 $ 5 $ 4,500.0



#1-150 TRF SIG CBL (TY C)(12 AWG)(2 Condr) 6587.00 LF $ 2 $ 13,174.0 $ 2.32 $ 15,281.839999999998 $ 3 $ 19,761.0 $ 1.44 $ 9,485.279999999999 $ 2 $ 13,174.0

#1-151
TRF SIG CBL (TY C)(12 AWG)(2 Condr) (at Legacy/SH 
121) 1470.00 LF $ 2 $ 2,940.0 $ 2.32 $ 3,410.3999999999996 $ 3 $ 4,410.0 $ 1.44 $ 2,116.7999999999997 $ 2 $ 2,940.0

#1-152 Ground Box TY D 20.00 EA $ 1,300.0 $ 26,000.0 $ 1,508.0 $ 30,160.0 $ 1,250.0 $ 25,000.0 $ 1,240.0 $ 24,800.0 $ 1,300.0 $ 26,000.0

#1-153 Ground Box TY D (at Legacy/SH 121) 5.00 EA $ 1,300.0 $ 6,500.0 $ 1,508.0 $ 7,540.0 $ 1,250.0 $ 6,250.0 $ 1,240.0 $ 6,200.0 $ 1,300.0 $ 6,500.0

#1-154
Install Battery Back Up (BBU) System (at 
Legacy/Town and Country) 1 EA $ 750 $ 750 $ 870 $ 870 $ 7,300.0 $ 7,300.0 $ 1,000.0 $ 1,000.0 $ 750 $ 750

#1-155
Install Battery Back Up (BBU) System (at 
Legacy/Country Club) 1 EA $ 750 $ 750 $ 870 $ 870 $ 7,300.0 $ 7,300.0 $ 1,000.0 $ 1,000.0 $ 750 $ 750

#1-156
Install Battery Back Up (BBU) System  (at 
Legacy/Warren) 1 EA $ 750 $ 750 $ 870 $ 870 $ 7,300.0 $ 7,300.0 $ 1,000.0 $ 1,000.0 $ 750 $ 750

#1-157 Red Confirmation Lights 10.00 EA $ 400 $ 4,000.0 $ 464 $ 4,640.0 $ 425 $ 4,250.0 $ 316.5 $ 3,165.0 $ 400 $ 4,000.0

#1-158 Red Confirmation Lights (at Legacy/SH 121) 2.00 EA $ 400 $ 800.0 $ 464 $ 928.0 $ 425 $ 850.0 $ 316.5 $ 633.0 $ 400 $ 800.0

#1-159
Street Name Sign (18" x 96") (at Legacy/Country 
Club) 2.00 EA $ 650 $ 1,300.0 $ 754 $ 1,508.0 $ 850 $ 1,700.0 $ 800 $ 1,600.0 $ 650 $ 1,300.0

#1-160 Street Name Sign (18" x 102") (at Legacy/SH 121) 2.00 EA $ 715 $ 1,430.0 $ 829.4 $ 1,658.8 $ 850 $ 1,700.0 $ 800 $ 1,600.0 $ 715 $ 1,430.0

#1-161
Push Button Pole Assembly (at Legacy/Town and 
Country) 2.00 EA $ 1,330.0 $ 2,660.0 $ 1,542.8 $ 3,085.6 $ 1,900.0 $ 3,800.0 $ 1,190.5 $ 2,381.0 $ 1,330.0 $ 2,660.0

#1-162
Push Button Pole Assembly (at Legacy/Country 
Club) 1.00 EA $ 1,330.0 $ 1,330.0 $ 1,542.8 $ 1,542.8 $ 1,900.0 $ 1,900.0 $ 1,040.5 $ 1,040.5 $ 1,330.0 $ 1,330.0

#1-163 Push Button Pole Assembly (at Legacy/Stonebriar) 3.00 EA $ 1,330.0 $ 3,990.0 $ 1,542.8 $ 4,628.4 $ 1,900.0 $ 5,700.0 $ 1,040.5 $ 3,121.5 $ 1,330.0 $ 3,990.0

#1-164 Push Button Pole Assembly (at Legacy/Warren) 1.00 EA $ 1,330.0 $ 1,330.0 $ 1,542.8 $ 1,542.8 $ 1,900.0 $ 1,900.0 $ 1,040.5 $ 1,040.5 $ 1,330.0 $ 1,330.0

#1-165 Pedestal Pole Assembly (at Legacy/SH 121) 1.00 EA $ 1,600.0 $ 1,600.0 $ 1,856.0 $ 1,856.0 $ 2,250.0 $ 2,250.0 $ 1,388.0 $ 1,388.0 $ 1,600.0 $ 1,600.0

#1-166
Pedestal Pole Assembly (at Legacy/Town and 
Country) 10.00 EA $ 1,600.0 $ 16,000.0 $ 1,856.0 $ 18,560.0 $ 2,250.0 $ 22,500.0 $ 1,388.0 $ 13,880.0 $ 1,600.0 $ 16,000.0

#1-167 Pedestal Pole Assembly (at Legacy/Country Club) 4.00 EA $ 1,600.0 $ 6,400.0 $ 1,856.0 $ 7,424.0 $ 2,250.0 $ 9,000.0 $ 1,388.0 $ 5,552.0 $ 1,600.0 $ 6,400.0

#1-168 Pedestal Pole Assembly (at Legacy/Stonebriar) 4.00 EA $ 1,600.0 $ 6,400.0 $ 1,856.0 $ 7,424.0 $ 2,250.0 $ 9,000.0 $ 1,388.0 $ 5,552.0 $ 1,600.0 $ 6,400.0

#1-169 Pedestal Pole Assembly (at Legacy/Warren) 5.00 EA $ 1,600.0 $ 8,000.0 $ 1,856.0 $ 9,280.0 $ 2,250.0 $ 11,250.0 $ 1,388.0 $ 6,940.0 $ 1,600.0 $ 8,000.0

#1-170 APS Ped Detection (2 IN Push Buttons ) 29.00 EA $ 1,275.0 $ 36,975.0 $ 1,479.0 $ 42,891.0 $ 1,250.0 $ 36,250.0 $ 740.5 $ 21,474.5 $ 1,275.0 $ 36,975.0

#1-171
Ped Detection (2 IN Push Button) (at Legacy/SH 
121) 3.00 EA $ 300 $ 900.0 $ 348 $ 1,044.0 $ 1,250.0 $ 3,750.0 $ 368 $ 1,104.0 $ 300 $ 900.0

#1-172
INS TRF SIG PL AM(S)1 ARM(60')LUM (at Legacy/SH 
121) 1.00 EA $ 27,600.0 $ 27,600.0 $ 32,016.0 $ 32,016.0 $ 29,000.0 $ 29,000.0 $ 26,260.0 $ 26,260.0 $ 27,600.0 $ 27,600.0

#1-173
INS TRF SIG PL AM(S)1 ARM(65')LUM (at Legacy/SH 
121) 1.00 EA $ 28,850.0 $ 28,850.0 $ 33,466.0 $ 33,466.0 $ 30,000.0 $ 30,000.0 $ 27,340.0 $ 27,340.0 $ 28,850.0 $ 28,850.0

#1-174 (*) Veh Head 3 Sec Horizontal 44.00 EA $ 700 $ 30,800.0 $ 812 $ 35,728.0 $ 400 $ 17,600.0 $ 130 $ 5,720.0 $ 700 $ 30,800.0

#1-175 Veh Head 3 Sec Horizontal (at Legacy/SH 121) 4.00 EA $ 1,200.0 $ 4,800.0 $ 1,392.0 $ 5,568.0 $ 400 $ 1,600.0 $ 130 $ 520.0 $ 1,200.0 $ 4,800.0

#1-176
Veh Head 3 Sec Horizontal (GRN ARROW) (at 
Legacy/SH 121) 2.00 EA $ 1,200.0 $ 2,400.0 $ 1,392.0 $ 2,784.0 $ 400 $ 800.0 $ 130 $ 260.0 $ 1,200.0 $ 2,400.0

#1-177 Veh Head 3 Sec Vertical (at Legacy/SH 121) 1.00 EA $ 1,200.0 $ 1,200.0 $ 1,392.0 $ 1,392.0 $ 400 $ 400.0 $ 130 $ 130.0 $ 1,200.0 $ 1,200.0

#1-178 Veh Head 4 Sec PLT Horizontal (at Legacy/SH 121) 2.00 EA $ 1,600.0 $ 3,200.0 $ 1,856.0 $ 3,712.0 $ 400 $ 800.0 $ 130 $ 260.0 $ 1,600.0 $ 3,200.0

#1-179 (*) Veh Head 5 Sec FLT Horizontal 23.00 EA $ 1,200.0 $ 27,600.0 $ 1,392.0 $ 32,016.0 $ 400 $ 9,200.0 $ 130 $ 2,990.0 $ 1,200.0 $ 27,600.0



#1-180 (*) Veh Head 5 Sec RT Horizontal 1.00 EA $ 1,200.0 $ 1,200.0 $ 1,392.0 $ 1,392.0 $ 400 $ 400.0 $ 130 $ 130.0 $ 1,200.0 $ 1,200.0

#1-181 (*) Veh Head 5 Sec RT Vertical 15.00 EA $ 1,200.0 $ 18,000.0 $ 1,392.0 $ 20,880.0 $ 400 $ 6,000.0 $ 130 $ 1,950.0 $ 1,200.0 $ 18,000.0

#1-182 (*) Back Plate (3 Sec) 32.00 EA $ 95 $ 3,040.0 $ 110.2 $ 3,526.4 $ 125 $ 4,000.0 $ 130 $ 4,160.0 $ 95 $ 3,040.0

#1-183 Back Plate (3 Sec) (at Legacy/SH 121) 7.00 EA $ 140 $ 980.0 $ 162.4 $ 1,136.8 $ 125 $ 875.0 $ 110 $ 770.0 $ 140 $ 980.0

#1-184 (*) Back Plate (4 Sec) 2.00 EA $ 95 $ 190.0 $ 110.2 $ 220.4 $ 135 $ 270.0 $ 110 $ 220.0 $ 95 $ 190.0

#1-185 Back Plate (4 Sec) (at Legacy/SH 121) 2.00 EA $ 150 $ 300.0 $ 174 $ 348.0 $ 135 $ 270.0 $ 110 $ 220.0 $ 150 $ 300.0

#1-186 (*) Back Plate (5 Sec) 25.00 EA $ 95 $ 2,375.0 $ 110.2 $ 2,755.0 $ 165 $ 4,125.0 $ 110 $ 2,750.0 $ 95 $ 2,375.0

#1-187 (*) Ped Sig Sec (LED)(Countdown) 32.00 EA $ 400 $ 12,800.0 $ 464 $ 14,848.0 $ 850 $ 27,200.0 $ 250 $ 8,000.0 $ 400 $ 12,800.0

#1-188 Ped Sig Sec (LED)(Countdown) (at Legacy/SH 121) 2.00 EA $ 900 $ 1,800.0 $ 1,044.0 $ 2,088.0 $ 850 $ 1,700.0 $ 250 $ 500.0 $ 900 $ 1,800.0

#1-189
(*) Traffic Signal Controller and Cabinet (at 
Legacy/Town and Country) 1.00 EA $ 4,000.0 $ 4,000.0 $ 4,640.0 $ 4,640.0 $ 8,300.0 $ 8,300.0 $ 23,000.0 $ 23,000.0 $ 4,000.0 $ 4,000.0

#1-190
(*) Traffic Signal Controller and Cabinet (at 
Legacy/Country Club) 1.00 EA $ 4,000.0 $ 4,000.0 $ 4,640.0 $ 4,640.0 $ 8,300.0 $ 8,300.0 $ 23,000.0 $ 23,000.0 $ 4,000.0 $ 4,000.0

#1-191
(*) Traffic Signal Controller and Cabinet (at 
Legacy/Warren) 1.00 EA $ 4,000.0 $ 4,000.0 $ 4,640.0 $ 4,640.0 $ 8,300.0 $ 8,300.0 $ 23,000.0 $ 23,000.0 $ 4,000.0 $ 4,000.0

#1-192 Traffic Signal Controller Cabinet Pad and Base 3 EA $ 1,000.0 $ 3,000.0 $ 1,160.0 $ 3,480.0 $ 6,150.0 $ 18,450.0 $ 2,784.0 $ 8,352.0 $ 1,000.0 $ 3,000.0

#1-193 (*) Video Monitoring Cameras 18.00 EA $ 750 $ 13,500.0 $ 870 $ 15,660.0 $ 750 $ 13,500.0 $ 600 $ 10,800.0 $ 750 $ 13,500.0

#1-194 (*) Opticom Detectors 10.00 EA $ 450 $ 4,500.0 $ 522 $ 5,220.0 $ 750 $ 7,500.0 $ 200 $ 2,000.0 $ 450 $ 4,500.0

#1-195 Opticom Detectors (at Legacy/SH 121) 2.00 EA $ 1,600.0 $ 3,200.0 $ 1,856.0 $ 3,712.0 $ 750 $ 1,500.0 $ 200 $ 400.0 $ 1,600.0 $ 3,200.0

#1-196 (*) Opticom Cable 3231.00 LF $ 1 $ 3,231.0 $ 1.16 $ 3,747.9599999999996 $ 1.75 $ 5,654.25 $ 1 $ 3,231.0 $ 1 $ 3,231.0

#1-197 Opticom Cable (at Legacy/SH 121) 925.00 LF $ 2 $ 1,850.0 $ 2.32 $ 2,146.0 $ 1.75 $ 1,618.75 $ 1 $ 925.0 $ 2 $ 1,850.0

#1-198 (*) Illuminated Street Name Sign (ILSN) 6.00 EA $ 650 $ 3,900.0 $ 754 $ 4,524.0 $ 900 $ 5,400.0 $ 1,000.0 $ 6,000.0 $ 650 $ 3,900.0

#1-199
(*) Ethernet Cable For Communication Equipment, 
Video, and PTZ 5858.00 LF $ 1 $ 5,858.0 $ 1.16 $ 6,795.28 $ 2 $ 11,716.0 $ 1.5 $ 8,787.0 $ 1 $ 5,858.0

#1-200
Ethernet Cable For Communication Equipment, 
Video, and PTZ (at Legacy/SH 121) 1855.00 LF $ 3 $ 5,565.0 $ 3.48 $ 6,455.4 $ 2 $ 3,710.0 $ 1.5 $ 2,782.5 $ 3 $ 5,565.0

#1-201 (*) Rader Units (Presence) 15.00 EA $ 850 $ 12,750.0 $ 986 $ 14,790.0 $ 850 $ 12,750.0 $ 7,325.0 $ 109,875.0 $ 850 $ 12,750.0

#1-202 (*) Radar Units (Advanced) 12.00 EA $ 850 $ 10,200.0 $ 986 $ 11,832.0 $ 850 $ 10,200.0 $ 7,325.0 $ 87,900.0 $ 850 $ 10,200.0

#1-203 (*) Radar Cable 9420.00 LF $ 1 $ 9,420.0 $ 1.16 $ 10,927.199999999999 $ 2 $ 18,840.0 $ 2.56 $ 24,115.2 $ 1 $ 9,420.0

#1-204 (*) Broadband Antenna 2.00 EA $ 300 $ 600.0 $ 348 $ 696.0 $ 700 $ 1,400.0 $ 517.5 $ 1,035.0 $ 300 $ 600.0

#1-205
Remove/Reinstall Broadband Antenna (at 
Legacy/SH 121) 1.00 EA $ 400 $ 400.0 $ 464 $ 464.0 $ 750 $ 750.0 $ 250 $ 250.0 $ 400 $ 400.0

#1-206 (*) PTZ Camera 2.00 EA $ 600 $ 1,200.0 $ 696 $ 1,392.0 $ 1,400.0 $ 2,800.0 $ 500 $ 1,000.0 $ 600 $ 1,200.0

#1-207 Remove/Reinstall PTZ Camera (at Legacy/SH 121) 1.00 EA $ 600 $ 600.0 $ 696 $ 696.0 $ 1,500.0 $ 1,500.0 $ 500 $ 500.0 $ 600 $ 600.0

#1-208 (*) Led Luminaire Fixtures (250 W) 15.00 EA $ 300 $ 4,500.0 $ 348 $ 5,220.0 $ 400 $ 6,000.0 $ 452.5 $ 6,787.5 $ 300 $ 4,500.0

#1-209 Led Luminaire Fixtures (250 W) (at Legacy/SH 121) 2.00 EA $ 700 $ 1,400.0 $ 812 $ 1,624.0 $ 700 $ 1,400.0 $ 150 $ 300.0 $ 700 $ 1,400.0



#1-210 (*) ELEC SRV TY D (120/240)060(NS)AL(E)PS(U) 5 EA $ 3,000.0 $ 15,000.0 $ 3,480.0 $ 17,400.0 $ 2,800.0 $ 14,000.0 $ 3,000.0 $ 15,000.0 $ 3,000.0 $ 15,000.0

#1-211
Install 12" ADS Pipe (or. Equiv)(Incl. Connections 
and Collars) 80.00 LF $ 75 $ 6,000.0 $ 63.11 $ 5,048.8 $ 75 $ 6,000.0 $ 26 $ 2,080.0 $ 81.46 $ 6,516.799999999999

#1-212 Install 18" RCP (Class III) (OMITTED) 0 LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 0 $ 0 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-213 Install 21" RCP (Class III) 2300.00 LF $ 138 $ 317,400.0 $ 77.59 $ 178,457.0 $ 105 $ 241,500.0 $ 60 $ 138,000.0 $ 114 $ 262,200.0

#1-214 Install 24" RCP (Class III) 50 LF $ 250 $ 12,500.0 $ 80.93 $ 4,046.5000000000005 $ 120 $ 6,000.0 $ 88 $ 4,400.0 $ 138.65 $ 6,932.5

#1-215 Install 30" RCP (Class III) 20.00 LF $ 295 $ 5,900.0 $ 107.33 $ 2,146.6 $ 170 $ 3,400.0 $ 116 $ 2,320.0 $ 199.19 $ 3,983.8

#1-216 Install 36" RCP (Class III) 50.00 LF $ 345 $ 17,250.0 $ 153.01 $ 7,650.5 $ 220 $ 11,000.0 $ 126 $ 6,300.0 $ 207.62 $ 10,381.0

#1-217 Install 42" RCP (Class III) 450.00 LF $ 195 $ 87,750.0 $ 254.97 $ 114,736.5 $ 275 $ 123,750.0 $ 151 $ 67,950.0 $ 197.61 $ 88,924.5

#1-218
Remove and Replace a portion of ex. 18" RCP (Class 
III)(incl. pipe collar) 30.00 LF $ 240 $ 7,200.0 $ 79.93 $ 2,397.9 $ 110 $ 3,300.0 $ 94 $ 2,820.0 $ 350.28 $ 10,508.4

#1-219
Remove and Replace a portion of ex. 21" RCP (Class 
III)(incl. pipe collar) 40.00 LF $ 247 $ 9,880.0 $ 114.24 $ 4,569.599999999999 $ 116 $ 4,640.0 $ 98 $ 3,920.0 $ 395.23 $ 15,809.2

#1-220 Trench Protection (Storm Drain) 3020 LF $ 10 $ 30,200.0 $ 2.4 $ 7,248.0 $ 1.15 $ 3,472.9999999999995 $ 2.8 $ 8,456.0 $ 2 $ 6,040.0

#1-221 10' Recessed Inlet 18.00 EA $ 4,500.0 $ 81,000.0 $ 5,452.0 $ 98,136.0 $ 6,700.0 $ 120,600.0 $ 5,100.0 $ 91,800.0 $ 4,650.0 $ 83,700.0

#1-222 16' Recessed Inlet 2.00 EA $ 5,300.0 $ 10,600.0 $ 7,308.0 $ 14,616.0 $ 8,500.0 $ 17,000.0 $ 6,600.0 $ 13,200.0 $ 6,100.0 $ 12,200.0

#1-223 20' Recessed Inlet 6.00 EA $ 6,800.0 $ 40,800.0 $ 9,744.0 $ 58,464.0 $ 11,000.0 $ 66,000.0 $ 9,100.0 $ 54,600.0 $ 7,450.0 $ 44,700.0

#1-224 10' Standard Inlet 6.00 EA $ 4,300.0 $ 25,800.0 $ 5,336.0 $ 32,016.0 $ 6,600.0 $ 39,600.0 $ 5,100.0 $ 30,600.0 $ 4,450.0 $ 26,700.0

#1-225 16' Standard Inlet 3.00 EA $ 5,300.0 $ 15,900.0 $ 7,192.0 $ 21,576.0 $ 8,500.0 $ 25,500.0 $ 6,600.0 $ 19,800.0 $ 6,100.0 $ 18,300.0

#1-226 20' Standard Inlet 2.00 EA $ 6,800.0 $ 13,600.0 $ 7,772.0 $ 15,544.0 $ 11,000.0 $ 22,000.0 $ 9,100.0 $ 18,200.0 $ 7,200.0 $ 14,400.0

#1-227 10' Curb Inlet (TxDOT)(Type 2) 1.00 EA $ 7,250.0 $ 7,250.0 $ 11,658.0 $ 11,658.0 $ 7,500.0 $ 7,500.0 $ 6,600.0 $ 6,600.0 $ 7,500.0 $ 7,500.0

#1-228 15' Curb Inlet (TxDOT)(Type 2) 2.00 EA $ 10,500.0 $ 21,000.0 $ 8,584.0 $ 17,168.0 $ 10,000.0 $ 20,000.0 $ 9,100.0 $ 18,200.0 $ 9,700.0 $ 19,400.0

#1-229
Remove / Replace 10' Inlet Top (Top 2') (~ sta 
56+54) 1.00 EA $ 5,500.0 $ 5,500.0 $ 5,452.0 $ 5,452.0 $ 4,000.0 $ 4,000.0 $ 3,400.0 $ 3,400.0 $ 2,860.0 $ 2,860.0

#1-230
Manhole (Complete)(TxDOT)(Ty MH-M)(4' X 
4')(Over existing storm or new storm line) 6.00 EA $ 7,000.0 $ 42,000.0 $ 5,684.0 $ 34,104.0 $ 6,000.0 $ 36,000.0 $ 5,200.0 $ 31,200.0 $ 4,580.0 $ 27,480.0

#1-231
Manhole (Complete)(TxDOT)(Ty MH-M)(5' X 
5')(Over existing storm or new storm line) 4.00 EA $ 8,800.0 $ 35,200.0 $ 8,584.0 $ 34,336.0 $ 7,500.0 $ 30,000.0 $ 6,750.0 $ 27,000.0 $ 5,855.0 $ 23,420.0

#1-232
Manhole (Complete)(TxDOT)(Ty MH-M)(6' X 
6')(Over existing storm or new storm line) 3.00 EA $ 14,500.0 $ 43,500.0 $ 11,576.8 $ 34,730.399999999994 $ 10,500.0 $ 31,500.0 $ 10,300.0 $ 30,900.0 $ 8,225.0 $ 24,675.0

#1-233 4'x4' Wye Inlet w/ Apron 2.00 EA $ 4,800.0 $ 9,600.0 $ 4,872.0 $ 9,744.0 $ 6,500.0 $ 13,000.0 $ 5,500.0 $ 11,000.0 $ 4,990.0 $ 9,980.0

#1-234
Adjust Exist Storm Sewer Manhole (replace w/ new 
Cone, Ring & Cover) 1.00 EA $ 5,000.0 $ 5,000.0 $ 1,364.12 $ 1,364.12 $ 2,500.0 $ 2,500.0 $ 2,000.0 $ 2,000.0 $ 2,700.0 $ 2,700.0

#1-235 Cap Exist Inlet (SH 121) 2.00 EA $ 3,750.0 $ 7,500.0 $ 2,262.0 $ 4,524.0 $ 800 $ 1,600.0 $ 600 $ 1,200.0 $ 2,500.0 $ 5,000.0
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#2-1 Fire Hydrant Assembly (incl. 6" Gate Valve) 9.00 EA $ 8,500.0 $ 76,500.0 $ 4,484.35 $ 40,359.15 $ 5,000.0 $ 45,000.0 $ 4,200.0 $ 37,800.0 $ 5,272.0 $ 47,448.0

#2-2
Connect Fire Hydrant to Existing Waterline 
(regarless of size) 9.00 EA $ 5,000.0 $ 45,000.0 $ 588.67 $ 5,298.03 $ 4,700.0 $ 42,300.0 $ 2,500.0 $ 22,500.0 $ 3,891.0 $ 35,019.0

#2-3 Water Line - PVC (DR 14)(6") 200.00 LF $ 90 $ 18,000.0 $ 126.83 $ 25,366.0 $ 77.25 $ 15,450.0 $ 36 $ 7,200.0 $ 104 $ 20,800.0

#2-4 Water Line - PVC (DR 18)(16") (Allowance) 100.00 LF $ 140 $ 14,000.0 $ 166.11 $ 16,611.0 $ 200.39 $ 20,039.0 $ 100 $ 10,000.0 $ 177 $ 17,700.0



#2-5 2" Water Meter 12 EA $ 1,750.0 $ 21,000.0 $ 2,277.02 $ 27,324.239999999998 $ 2,500.0 $ 30,000.0 $ 1,200.0 $ 14,400.0 $ 1,966.0 $ 23,592.0

#2-6
Connect 2" Water Service to Exist Waterline 
(regardless of size) 12 EA $ 3,750.0 $ 45,000.0 $ 463.49 $ 5,561.88 $ 4,500.0 $ 54,000.0 $ 1,450.0 $ 17,400.0 $ 2,570.0 $ 30,840.0

#2-7 6" Gate Valve 6.00 EA $ 1,200.0 $ 7,200.0 $ 1,829.36 $ 10,976.16 $ 1,500.0 $ 9,000.0 $ 1,120.0 $ 6,720.0 $ 1,552.0 $ 9,312.0

#2-8
16" Butterfly Valve (incl. cutting in to existing 16" 
line)(incl 16" x 6" Tee) 5.00 EA $ 18,500.0 $ 92,500.0 $ 12,572.69 $ 62,863.450000000004 $ 11,000.0 $ 55,000.0 $ 9,965.0 $ 49,825.0 $ 10,025.0 $ 50,125.0

#2-9 Lower Exist 16" Waterline (Allowance) 5.00 EA $ 10,000.0 $ 50,000.0 $ 8,499.03 $ 42,495.15 $ 9,000.0 $ 45,000.0 $ 9,500.0 $ 47,500.0 $ 10,124.0 $ 50,620.0

#2-10
Conduit (PVC) (SCH 40)(4")(BORE)(Water 
Service)(Allowance) 500.00 LF $ 100 $ 50,000.0 $ 40.6 $ 20,300.0 $ 80 $ 40,000.0 $ 25 $ 12,500.0 $ 20 $ 10,000.0

#2-11 Ductile Iron Water Line Fittings (Allowance) 5.00 TON $ 8,500.0 $ 42,500.0 $ 6,146.98 $ 30,734.899999999998 $ 6,000.0 $ 30,000.0 $ 6,000.0 $ 30,000.0 $ 6,490.64 $ 32,453.2
3

#3-1 Electrical Conductor (No. 6) Insulated 17790.00 LF $ 2 $ 35,580.0 $ 2.32 $ 41,272.799999999996 $ 2 $ 35,580.0 $ 1.28 $ 22,771.2 $ 2 $ 35,580.0

#3-2
Electrical Conductor (No. 6) Insulated Equipment 
Ground 8900.00 LF $ 1 $ 8,900.0 $ 1.16 $ 10,324.0 $ 2 $ 17,800.0 $ 1.28 $ 11,392.0 $ 1 $ 8,900.0

#3-3 Street Light Pole Assembly (30') 44.00 EA $ 4,500.0 $ 198,000.0 $ 5,220.0 $ 229,680.0 $ 4,142.19 $ 182,256.36 $ 3,330.0 $ 146,520.0 $ 4,500.0 $ 198,000.0

#3-4 2" PVC Conduit (Trenched) 830.00 LF $ 18 $ 14,940.0 $ 20.88 $ 17,330.399999999998 $ 14.55 $ 12,076.5 $ 9.15 $ 7,594.5 $ 18 $ 14,940.0

#3-5 2" HDPE Conduit (Trenched) 650.00 LF $ 18 $ 11,700.0 $ 20.88 $ 13,572.0 $ 14.55 $ 9,457.5 $ 10.71 $ 6,961.500000000001 $ 18 $ 11,700.0

#3-6 2" HDPE Conduit (Bored) 500.00 LF $ 34 $ 17,000.0 $ 39.44 $ 19,720.0 $ 26.87 $ 13,435.0 $ 20.96 $ 10,480.0 $ 34 $ 17,000.0

#3-7 4" PVC Conduit (Bored) 200.00 LF $ 39 $ 7,800.0 $ 45.24 $ 9,048.0 $ 50.38 $ 10,076.0 $ 16.42 $ 3,284.0000000000005 $ 39 $ 7,800.0

#3-8 Street Light Conc. Foundation (30") 380 LF $ 310 $ 117,800.0 $ 359.6 $ 136,648.0 $ 442.21 $ 168,039.8 $ 149.2 $ 56,695.99999999999 $ 310 $ 117,800.0

#3-9
Multi - Duct Conduit (3-4in / 1-2in) Trenched (SCH 
40) 7290.00 LF $ 52 $ 379,080.0 $ 60.32 $ 439,732.8 $ 72.77 $ 530,493.2999999999 $ 47.38 $ 345,400.2 $ 52 $ 379,080.0

#3-10
Multi - Duct Conduit (3-4in / 1-2in) Trenched (SCH 
80) 920.00 LF $ 57 $ 52,440.0 $ 66.12 $ 60,830.4 $ 72.77 $ 66,948.4 $ 53.56 $ 49,275.200000000004 $ 57 $ 52,440.0

#3-11 Multi - Duct Conduit (3-4in / 1-2in) Bored 900.00 LF $ 72 $ 64,800.0 $ 83.52 $ 75,168.0 $ 83.96 $ 75,564.0 $ 96.6 $ 86,940.0 $ 72 $ 64,800.0

#3-12
Multi - Duct Conduit (1-2in HDPE/ 1-2in SCH 40) 
Trenched 30.00 LF $ 31 $ 930.0 $ 35.96 $ 1,078.8 $ 55.98 $ 1,679.3999999999999 $ 31.96 $ 958.8000000000001 $ 31 $ 930.0

#3-13
Multi - Duct Conduit (2-4in HDPE/ 1-2in SCH 40) 
Trenched 180.00 LF $ 37 $ 6,660.0 $ 42.92 $ 7,725.6 $ 67.17 $ 12,090.6 $ 36.08 $ 6,494.4 $ 37 $ 6,660.0

#3-14
Multi - Duct Conduit (3-4in / 1-2in) Mounted to 
Bridge Exterior (Design & Install) 1.00 LS $ 38,902.6 $ 38,902.6 $ 24,213.84 $ 24,213.84 $ 20,990.81 $ 20,990.81 $ 14,420.0 $ 14,420.0 $ 20,874.0 $ 20,874.0

#3-15 Multi - Duct Conduit (2-4in) Trenched (HDPE) 55.00 LF $ 32 $ 1,760.0 $ 37.12 $ 2,041.6 $ 61.57 $ 3,386.35 $ 57.4 $ 3,157.0 $ 32 $ 1,760.0

#3-16 Multi - Duct Conduit (2-4in) Bored 1020.00 LF $ 48 $ 48,960.0 $ 55.68 $ 56,793.6 $ 78.37 $ 79,937.40000000001 $ 68 $ 69,360.0 $ 48 $ 48,960.0

#3-17 Multi - Duct Conduit (3-4in) Bored 608.00 LF $ 60 $ 36,480.0 $ 69.6 $ 42,316.799999999996 $ 80.6 $ 49,004.799999999996 $ 78.6 $ 47,788.799999999996 $ 60 $ 36,480.0

#3-18
ITS Pull Box (Type 1 Polymer Concrete - 26"x38" 
with Concrete Apron) 26.00 EA $ 5,500.0 $ 143,000.0 $ 6,380.0 $ 165,880.0 $ 6,157.3 $ 160,089.80000000002 $ 1,760.0 $ 45,760.0 $ 5,500.0 $ 143,000.0

#3-19 Ground Box TY C 3.00 EA $ 1,225.0 $ 3,675.0 $ 1,421.0 $ 4,263.0 $ 1,007.56 $ 3,022.68 $ 1,220.0 $ 3,660.0 $ 1,225.0 $ 3,675.0

#3-20 Relocated Street Light Pole Assembly 3.00 EA $ 1,575.0 $ 4,725.0 $ 1,827.0 $ 5,481.0 $ 3,582.43 $ 10,747.289999999999 $ 650 $ 1,950.0 $ 1,575.0 $ 4,725.0

#3-21 Connector Kit for Relocated Light 3.00 EA $ 1,150.0 $ 3,450.0 $ 1,334.0 $ 4,002.0 $ 895.61 $ 2,686.83 $ 211 $ 633.0 $ 1,150.0 $ 3,450.0

#3-22 Anchor Bolt Set for Relocated Light 3.00 EA $ 700 $ 2,100.0 $ 812 $ 2,436.0 $ 419.82 $ 1,259.46 $ 215 $ 645.0 $ 700 $ 2,100.0

#3-23 Double Breakaway Fuse Holder with 10 Amp Fuse 47.00 EA $ 85 $ 3,995.0 $ 98.6 $ 4,634.2 $ 89.56 $ 4,209.32 $ 211 $ 9,917.0 $ 85 $ 3,995.0



#3-24 (*) Type II LED Fixtures 94 EA $ 320 $ 30,080.0 $ 371.2 $ 34,892.799999999996 $ 279.88 $ 26,308.72 $ 150 $ 14,100.0 $ 320 $ 30,080.0

#3-25 ELEC SRV TY A (240/480)060(NS)SS(E)PS(U) 3.00 EA $ 7,160.0 $ 21,480.0 $ 8,305.6 $ 24,916.800000000003 $ 7,808.58 $ 23,425.739999999998 $ 6,300.0 $ 18,900.0 $ 7,160.0 $ 21,480.0
4

#4-1
Legacy Drive Median Irrigation System (incl. All 
Bores) 1.00 LS $ 178,000.0 $ 178,000.0 $ 200,000.0 $ 200,000.0 $ 200,000.0 $ 200,000.0 $ 151,500.0 $ 151,500.0 $ 178,000.0 $ 178,000.0

#4-2
Area A (Golf Course) Private Irrigation Restoration 
along Legacy 1.00 LS $ 7,000.0 $ 7,000.0 $ 50,000.0 $ 50,000.0 $ 8,000.0 $ 8,000.0 $ 8,500.0 $ 8,500.0 $ 7,000.0 $ 7,000.0

#4-3
Area B (Country Club Plaza, 1701 Legacy Drive) 
Private Irrigation Restoration along Legacy 1.00 LS $ 10,200.0 $ 10,200.0 $ 30,000.0 $ 30,000.0 $ 10,500.0 $ 10,500.0 $ 35,800.0 $ 35,800.0 $ 10,200.0 $ 10,200.0

#4-4
Area C (The Chase at Stonebriar) Private Irrigation 
Restoration along Legacy 1.00 LS $ 9,300.0 $ 9,300.0 $ 25,000.0 $ 25,000.0 $ 10,500.0 $ 10,500.0 $ 1,300.0 $ 1,300.0 $ 9,300.0 $ 9,300.0

#4-5

Misc. Private Irrigation Restoration along Legacy (In 
parkway, residential areas, subdivisions, and 
businesses) 1.00 LS $ 70,000.0 $ 70,000.0 $ 40,000.0 $ 40,000.0 $ 100,000.0 $ 100,000.0 $ 12,500.0 $ 12,500.0 $ 70,000.0 $ 70,000.0

#4-6
Town & Country Irrigation System (In Median incl. 
All Bores) 1.00 LS $ 36,600.0 $ 36,600.0 $ 50,000.0 $ 50,000.0 $ 50,000.0 $ 50,000.0 $ 33,800.0 $ 33,800.0 $ 36,600.0 $ 36,600.0

#4-7
Temporary Irrigation Controller (Furnish, Install, 
Maintain, and Remove) 8 EA $ 1,350.0 $ 10,800.0 $ 3,947.75 $ 31,582.0 $ 1,322.42 $ 10,579.36 $ 2,100.0 $ 16,800.0 $ 1,350.0 $ 10,800.0

#4-8
Connect Proposed Irrigation System to Existing Golf 
Course Irrigation System 2.00 EA $ 1,000.0 $ 2,000.0 $ 3,512.2 $ 7,024.4 $ 1,119.51 $ 2,239.02 $ 1,750.0 $ 3,500.0 $ 1,000.0 $ 2,000.0

#4-9
Connect Proposed Irrigation System @ SB Parkway 
Between Golf Course & Country Club Dr. 1.00 EA $ 1,000.0 $ 1,000.0 $ 3,512.21 $ 3,512.21 $ 1,119.51 $ 1,119.51 $ 1,750.0 $ 1,750.0 $ 1,000.0 $ 1,000.0

#4-10 Irrigation Electrical Service 8 EA $ 6,950.0 $ 55,600.0 $ 5,800.0 $ 46,400.0 $ 7,780.59 $ 62,244.72 $ 6,850.0 $ 54,800.0 $ 6,950.0 $ 55,600.0

#4-11
Private Irrigation Design and Installation (along 
Haworth Drive) 1.00 LS $ 9,800.0 $ 9,800.0 $ 20,000.0 $ 20,000.0 $ 10,971.2 $ 10,971.2 $ 3,250.0 $ 3,250.0 $ 9,800.0 $ 9,800.0

#4-12 2" Bores (for Irrigation Electrical Service) 540 LF $ 18.25 $ 9,855.0 $ 46.4 $ 25,056.0 $ 20.43 $ 11,032.2 $ 21 $ 11,340.0 $ 18.25 $ 9,855.0

#4-13 4" Bermuda Sod (Roll- min 24" wide) 10310.00 SY $ 3.1 $ 31,961.0 $ 4.55 $ 46,910.5 $ 3.5 $ 36,085.0 $ 7 $ 72,170.0 $ 3.1 $ 31,961.0

#4-14 Top 4" Soil (Parkway) 10310.00 SY $ 5 $ 51,550.0 $ 5.53 $ 57,014.3 $ 4 $ 41,240.0 $ 4.05 $ 41,755.5 $ 4.98 $ 51,343.8

#4-15 Curlex (Bermuda Grass Seed) 1830.00 SY $ 2.85 $ 5,215.5 $ 2.88 $ 5,270.4 $ 3 $ 5,490.0 $ 2.25 $ 4,117.5 $ 2.85 $ 5,215.5

#4-16 Cedar Elm (6" cal) 22.00 EA $ 1,250.0 $ 27,500.0 $ 4,063.91 $ 89,406.01999999999 $ 1,399.39 $ 30,786.58 $ 1,325.0 $ 29,150.0 $ 1,250.0 $ 27,500.0

#4-17 Cathedral Live Oak (6" cal) 28.00 EA $ 1,650.0 $ 46,200.0 $ 4,079.12 $ 114,215.36 $ 1,847.19 $ 51,721.32 $ 1,750.0 $ 49,000.0 $ 1,650.0 $ 46,200.0

#4-18 Multi-Trunk Live Oak 6.00 EA $ 3,475.0 $ 20,850.0 $ 4,452.0 $ 26,712.0 $ 3,890.3 $ 23,341.800000000003 $ 2,250.0 $ 13,500.0 $ 3,475.0 $ 20,850.0

#4-19 Texas Red Oak 26.00 EA $ 1,650.0 $ 42,900.0 $ 3,962.71 $ 103,030.46 $ 1,847.19 $ 48,026.94 $ 1,325.0 $ 34,450.0 $ 1,650.0 $ 42,900.0

#4-20 Mexican Buckeye (45 gal) 44.00 EA $ 355 $ 15,620.0 $ 860.02 $ 37,840.88 $ 397.43 $ 17,486.920000000002 $ 525 $ 23,100.0 $ 355 $ 15,620.0

#4-21 Aureo Tree Yaupon Holly (45 gal) 15.00 EA $ 395 $ 5,925.0 $ 867.23 $ 13,008.45 $ 442.21 $ 6,633.15 $ 500 $ 7,500.0 $ 395 $ 5,925.0

#4-22 Oklahoma Redbud (45 gal) 21.00 EA $ 325 $ 6,825.0 $ 859.3 $ 18,045.3 $ 363.84 $ 7,640.639999999999 $ 450 $ 9,450.0 $ 325 $ 6,825.0

#4-23 Nellie R. Stevens (45 gal) 166.00 EA $ 275 $ 45,650.0 $ 730.07 $ 121,191.62000000001 $ 307.87 $ 51,106.42 $ 425 $ 70,550.0 $ 275 $ 45,650.0

#4-24 Salmon Dance Autumn Sage (10 gal) 76.00 EA $ 24.5 $ 1,862.0 $ 162.72 $ 12,366.72 $ 27.43 $ 2,084.68 $ 50 $ 3,800.0 $ 24.5 $ 1,862.0

#4-25 Variegated Soft Leaf Yucca (10 gal) 147.00 EA $ 22.5 $ 3,307.5 $ 165.81 $ 24,374.07 $ 25.19 $ 3,702.9300000000003 $ 50 $ 7,350.0 $ 22.5 $ 3,307.5

#4-26 Kaleidoscope Abelia (10 gal) 65.00 EA $ 23.5 $ 1,527.5 $ 165.52 $ 10,758.800000000001 $ 26.31 $ 1,710.1499999999999 $ 50 $ 3,250.0 $ 23.5 $ 1,527.5

#4-27 Misc. Shrubs (10 gal) (Private Areas Replacement) 65.00 EA $ 23.5 $ 1,527.5 $ 177.36 $ 11,528.400000000001 $ 26.31 $ 1,710.1499999999999 $ 50 $ 3,250.0 $ 23.5 $ 1,527.5

#4-28 Shenandoah Switchgrass (7 gal) 345.00 EA $ 21.5 $ 7,417.5 $ 90.86 $ 31,346.7 $ 24.07 $ 8,304.15 $ 45 $ 15,525.0 $ 21.5 $ 7,417.5



#4-29 Little Bluestem (7 gal) 66.00 EA $ 18.5 $ 1,221.0 $ 92.49 $ 6,104.339999999999 $ 20.71 $ 1,366.8600000000001 $ 45 $ 2,970.0 $ 18.5 $ 1,221.0

#4-30
Landscape bed prep (12" deep)(Includes 4" blended 
compost)(planting areas) 970.00 CY $ 45 $ 43,650.0 $ 151.09 $ 146,557.30000000002 $ 50.38 $ 48,868.600000000006 $ 42.5 $ 41,225.0 $ 45 $ 43,650.0

#4-31 Turf Sod (Bermuda Grass) 860.00 SY $ 3.1 $ 2,666.0 $ 5.03 $ 4,325.8 $ 3.47 $ 2,984.2000000000003 $ 7.5 $ 6,450.0 $ 3.1 $ 2,666.0

#4-32 Turf Sod (Buffalo Grass) 5510.00 SY $ 6.75 $ 37,192.5 $ 15.09 $ 83,145.9 $ 7.56 $ 41,655.6 $ 7.5 $ 41,325.0 $ 6.75 $ 37,192.5

#4-33
Misc. Sod (Existing Areas Restoration, Includes Top 
Soil and Matching Sod) 4000 SY $ 5 $ 20,000.0 $ 8.17 $ 32,680.0 $ 5.6 $ 22,400.0 $ 7.5 $ 30,000.0 $ 5 $ 20,000.0

#4-34 Decorative Rock (Colorado River Rock 2" to 4") 3510.00 SY $ 37.85 $ 132,853.5 $ 42 $ 147,420.0 $ 42.37 $ 148,718.69999999998 $ 50 $ 175,500.0 $ 37.85 $ 132,853.5

#4-35 Boulder (2'x4'x18" Tall)(1.5 Ton min) 200.00 EA $ 518 $ 103,600.0 $ 564.99 $ 112,998.0 $ 550 $ 110,000.0 $ 800 $ 160,000.0 $ 518 $ 103,600.0

#4-36 Reinforced Concrete Mow Curb (12"x6") 690.00 LF $ 15.25 $ 10,522.5 $ 33.64 $ 23,211.600000000002 $ 16 $ 11,040.0 $ 25 $ 17,250.0 $ 15.25 $ 10,522.5

#4-37 Trim Existing Trees Limbs over Legacy and Sidewalk 45.00 EA $ 125 $ 5,625.0 $ 377 $ 16,965.0 $ 150 $ 6,750.0 $ 250 $ 11,250.0 $ 125 $ 5,625.0

#4-38
Tree Allowance (6" Caliper)(incld connecting new 
bubbler to existing irrigation) 20.00 EA $ 1,775.0 $ 35,500.0 $ 4,190.69 $ 83,813.79999999999 $ 1,775.0 $ 35,500.0 $ 2,000.0 $ 40,000.0 $ 1,775.0 $ 35,500.0

#4-39 Ornamental Fencing (Incl. Foundations) 300.00 LF $ 159 $ 47,700.0 $ 184.44 $ 55,332.0 $ 50 $ 15,000.0 $ 25 $ 7,500.0 $ 198 $ 59,400.0

#4-40
Masonry Columns (incld piers, structure, masonry, 
ect.) 14.00 EA $ 5,500.0 $ 77,000.0 $ 4,524.0 $ 63,336.0 $ 2,500.0 $ 35,000.0 $ 1,250.0 $ 17,500.0 $ 2,670.17 $ 37,382.380000000005

#4-41 Top 4" Median Top Soil (Sod Areas) 6380.00 SY $ 5 $ 31,900.0 $ 5.53 $ 35,281.4 $ 5 $ 31,900.0 $ 3.2 $ 20,416.0 $ 4.98 $ 31,772.4

#4-42
Heavy Duty Weed Barrier (for Decorative Rock 
Areas) 3508.00 SY $ 1.8 $ 6,314.400000000001 $ 15.86 $ 55,636.88 $ 2 $ 7,016.0 $ 4.5 $ 15,786.0 $ 1.8 $ 6,314.400000000001

#4-43 Private Landscape Bed Adjustment (Allowance) 1.00 LS $ 4,250.0 $ 4,250.0 $ 58,000.0 $ 58,000.0 $ 4,500.0 $ 4,500.0 $ 8,000.0 $ 8,000.0 $ 4,250.0 $ 4,250.0

#4-44
Temporary Seeded Curlex Allowance (6' wide from 
BOC) 20720.00 SY $ 2.65 $ 54,908.0 $ 2.48 $ 51,385.6 $ 3 $ 62,160.0 $ 1.5 $ 31,080.0 $ 2.65 $ 54,908.0

#4-45
Parkway Mowing Allowance (After Final 
Completion) 5.00 EA $ 1,700.0 $ 8,500.0 $ 7,034.81 $ 35,174.05 $ 2,000.0 $ 10,000.0 $ 2,500.0 $ 12,500.0 $ 1,700.0 $ 8,500.0

#4-46
Hardwood Mulch (Shade Tree Rings & Planting 
Area)(2" Deep) 5170.00 SY $ 2.66 $ 13,752.2 $ 6.95 $ 35,931.5 $ 1.83 $ 9,461.1 $ 2.1 $ 10,857.0 $ 2.66 $ 13,752.2

#4-47 Sod Restoration (Allowance) (OMITTED) 0 SY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 0 $ 0 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#4-48 Steel Edging for Planting Areas (Allownce) 2500 LF $ 6.25 $ 15,625.0 $ 7.37 $ 18,425.0 $ 7 $ 17,500.0 $ 6.5 $ 16,250.0 $ 6.25 $ 15,625.0
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