AlphaGraphics #54 Bassett Design, LLC John Sons Press OCOP Express (oak Cliff Office Products) Phase 3 LLC Sir Speedy #4023
Bid #2105-075 Print and Marketing Materials
Opened 9-21-21 at 2:00 PM CT Total Cost 34,262.96 36,982.80 64,984.81 29,014.74 121,582.90 46,646.05
Product Quantity || Minimum Unit Total Minimum Unit Total Minimum Unit Total Minimum Unit Total Minimum Unit Total Minimum Unit Total
4 Items Type Required Order Price Cost Order Price Cost Order Price Cost Order Price Cost Order Price Cost Order Price Cost
1/2 sheet
Letters to Troops pads (500 500 500 $ 0.0962 | $ 48.10 500 S 1.8200|$ 910.00 500 $ 0.1760 | $ 88.00 500 $ 02125|$ 106.25 1 $ 0.1900 | $ 95.00 500 $ 0.0925 S 46.25
#0-1 sheets)
1/2 sheet
Merry Main Street pads (500 500 500 $ 00962 | $ 48.10 500 S 1.8200|$ 910.00 500 $ 0.1760|$ 88.00 500 $ 02125|$ 106.25 1 $ 0.1900 | $ 95.00 500 $ 0.0925 (S 46.25
#0-2 sheets)
A-fi
40-3 Daddy Daughter Dance porsatr:re 20 20 $31.0000 | $  620.00 5 $ 28.0000 | $  560.00 20 $ 3.1135|$ 62.27 No Bid No Bid No Bid 1 $ 36.5600 | $ 731.20 1 $24.0000 | $  480.00
A-fi
40-4 Merry Main Street porsatr:re 20 20 $31.0000 | $  620.00 5 $ 28.0000 | $  560.00 20 $ 3.1135|$ 62.27 No Bid No Bid No Bid 1 $ 36.5600 | $ 731.20 1 $24.0000 | $  480.00
A-fi
40-5 FAC Aquatics porsatr:re 10 10 $31.5000 | $  315.00 5 $ 28.0000 | $  280.00 10 S 7.2800|$ 72.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid 1 $ 46.0800 | $ 460.80 1 $24.0000 | $  240.00
#0-6 Art in the Atrium brochure 1000 1000 $ 0.4060 | $ 406.00 1000 $ 0.2900 | $ 290.00 1000 $ 0.5070 | $ 507.00 1000 $ 02519 S 251.94 1 $ 0.9500 | $ 950.00 1000 $ 0.2650 | $ 265.00
#0-7 FAC Brochures brochure 5000 5000 $ 0.2550 | $ 1,275.00 5000 $ 0.1700 [$  850.00 5000 S 0.2668 [ S 1,334.00 1000 $ 0.1035[$ 51750 1 $ 0.6200 [ $ 3,100.00 2500 $ 0.0856 [ $  428.00
40-8 Frisco Discover Center brochure 2000 2000 $ 03440 | $  688.00 2000 $ 02500 |$  500.00 2000 $ 04135|$ 827.00 1000 $ 01469 |$ 293.75 1 $ 0.8800 | $ 1,760.00 2000 $ 0.1540 [ $  308.00
Senior Center
calendar 12000 1000 $ 0.4640 | $ 5,568.00 1000 $ 0.5000 | $ 6,000.00 1000 $ 06150 | $ 7,380.00 1000 S 06124 | S 7,348.20 1 $ 0.9600 | $ 11,520.00 1000 $ 0.3900 [ $ 4,680.00
#0-9 Newsletter calendar
FAC/Water Park Day
40-10 Passes Day passes 9000 9000 $ 0.0460 | $  414.00 9000 $ 0018 |$ 162.00 9000 $ 00394 |$ 354.60 1000 $ 00243 |$ 21875 1 $ 0.0600 | $ 540.00 1000 $ 0.0300($  270.00
Promo Day Pass (FAC &
40-11 Library) Day passes 6000 6000 $ 0.0480|$  288.00 6000 $ 0.0200|$ 120.00 6000 $ 0.0500|$ 300.00 1000 $ 00300 |$ 179.95 1 $ 0.0700|$ 420.00 1000 $ 0.0300($  180.00
#0-12 The Grove Day passes 2000 2000 $ 0.0640 | S 128.00 2000 $ 0.0340 | $ 68.00 2000 $ 0.0860 | $ 172.00 500 $ 0.0400 | $ 79.98 1 $ 0.0800 | $ 160.00 1000 $ 0.0300 | $ 60.00
40-13 Opening, ribbon cuttings| Invitations 100 100 $ 04610 | S 46.10 100 $ 0.6000 | $ 60.00 100 S 0.6800|$ 68.00 100 S 0.4666 | S 46.66 1 $ 0.8000 | $ 80.00 100 $ 03250 | $ 32.50
#0-14 Play Frisco Mailer Post card 60000 60000 | $ 0.1640 [ $ 9,840.00 60000 $ 0.0800 | $ 4,800.00 60000 $ 01436 | $ 8,616.00 5000 $ 0.0586 | $ 3,518.75 1 $ 0.1900 | $ 11,400.00 20000 $ 0.0800 [ $ 4,800.00
S Splash
1015 ”Z'thiet;tig:s Post card 50 50 |$07130|$ 3565 50 |$ 07600|% 3800 50 |$ 13400($  67.00 50 $ 09331[$ 4666 1 $ 08800[$ 4400 50 [$ 03500($  17.50
#0-16 | Winter Art Exhibition Post card 50 50 $ 07130 [ $ 35.65 50 $ 0.7600 | $ 38.00 50 $ 13400 |$ 67.00 50 $ 09331|S$ 46.66 1 $ 0.8800 | S 44.00 50 $ 0.3500 | $ 17.50
#0-17 | Music in the Chamber Post card 50 50 $ 07130 | S 35.65 50 $ 0.7600 | $ 38.00 50 S 13400 (S 67.00 50 $ 093318 46.66 1 S 0.8800 S 44.00 50 $ 03500 | $ 17.50
. Notecards . . .
Play Frisco Notecards w/ envelopes 500 No Bid No Bid No Bid 500 $ 04900 |$  245.00 500 $ 05700 |$  285.00 500 $ 05625|$ 281.25 1 $ 15600 | $ 780.00 500 $ 0.4200|$ 210.00
#0-18 P
40-19 Daddy Daughter Dance Ll;g::e?fx 1 1 $80.0000 | $ 80.00 1 $180.0000 | $ 180.00 1 $140.0000 | $ 140.00 1 $125.0000 | $ 125.00 1 $135.0000 | $ 135.00 1 $48.0000 | $ 48.00
40-20 Play Radically Ll;g::e?fx 1 1 $80.0000 | $ 80.00 1 $180.0000 | $ 180.00 1 $140.0000 | $ 140.00 1 $125.0000 | $ 125.00 1 $135.0000 | $ 135.00 1 $48.0000 | $ 48.00
40-21 Frisco Camp Ll;g::e?fx 2 2 $64.0000 | S 128.00 1 $180.0000 | $ 360.00 2 $140.0000 | $ 280.00 2 $126.6350 | $ 253.27 1 $111.0000 | $ 222.00 1 $48.0000 | $ 96.00
40-22 P&R Spring Events Ll;g::e?fx 1 1 $80.0000 | $ 80.00 1 $180.0000 | $ 180.00 1 $140.0000 | $ 140.00 1 $125.0000 | $ 125.00 1 $135.0000 | $ 135.00 1 $48.0000 | $ 48.00
40-23 Paws in the Pool Ll;g::e?fx 1 1 $80.0000 | $ 80.00 1 $180.0000 | $ 180.00 1 $140.0000 | $ 140.00 1 $125.0000 | $ 125.00 1 $135.0000 | $ 135.00 1 $48.0000 | $ 48.00
40-24 Music in the Chamber Ll;g::e?fx 1 1 $80.0000 | $ 80.00 1 $180.0000 | $ 180.00 1 $140.0000 | $ 140.00 1 $125.0000 | $ 125.00 1 $135.0000 | $ 135.00 1 $48.0000 | $ 48.00
40-25 Teen Night - FAC Ll;g::e?fx 1 1 $80.0000 | $ 80.00 1 $180.0000 | $ 180.00 1 $140.0000 | $ 140.00 1 $125.0000 | $ 125.00 1 $135.0000 | $ 135.00 1 $48.0000 | $ 48.00
Friday Night Diveln | - Light Box 1 1 |$s800000|$  80.00 1 $180.0000 | $  180.00 1 $140.0000 | $  140.00 1 $125.0000 | $  125.00 1 $1350000 | $§  135.00 1 $48.0000 [ $  48.00
#0-26 Movie - FAC Insert
40-27 FAC Services Ll;g::e?fx 16 16 $50.5000 | $ 808.00 1 $180.0000 | $ 2,880.00 16 $140.0000 | $ 2,240.00 5 $ 84.7656 | S 1,356.25 1 $ 67.0000 | $ 1,072.00 1 $48.0000 | $ 768.00
40-28 Frisco Fun Guide Ll;g::e?fx 3 3 $58.6670 | S 176.00 1 $180.0000 | $ 540.00 3 $140.0000 | $  420.00 3 $106.6400 | $ 319.92 1 $111.0000 | $ 333.00 1 $48.0000 | $ 144.00
40-29 Frosty 5K Ll;g::e?fx 1 1 $80.0000 | $ 80.00 1 $180.0000 | $ 180.00 1 $140.0000 | $ 140.00 1 $125.0000 | $ 125.00 1 $135.0000 | $ 135.00 1 $48.0000 | $ 48.00
40-30 Merry Main Street Ll;g::e?fx 1 1 $80.0000 | $ 80.00 1 $180.0000 | $ 180.00 1 $140.0000 | $ 140.00 1 $125.0000 | $ 125.00 1 $135.0000 | $ 135.00 1 $48.0000 | $ 48.00




AlphaGraphics #54 Bassett Design, LLC John Sons Press OCOP Express (oak Cliff Office Products) Phase 3 LLC Sir Speedy #4023
Light B
osy| Liveonthe Lawn '?nserfx 1 1 |$800000|$  80.00 1 $180.0000 | $  180.00 1 $140.0000 | $  140.00 1 $125.0000 [ $  125.00 1 $135.0000 | $  135.00 1 $48.0000 | $  48.00
4o.3p| Merry MainStreet |Parking Pass| 200 200 |3 06780|% 13560 200 |$ 07400|$ 14800 200 |$ 03950[$  79.00 200 $ 05784 |$ 11569 200 $ 20000 $ 40000 200 [$ 0325 |%  65.00
4o.33| Natural Resources |Parking Pass| 250 NoBid | No Bid No Bid 250 |$ 06000|$ 150.00 250 | $ 03360[$  84.00 250 $ 04318|$ 10795 200 $ 20000 $ 50000 250 | $ 03000|$ 7500
Poster 11
10,34 | Daddy Daughter Dance o8 i; X 60 60 |$ 08210(8 49.26 5 $ 65000 $  390.00 60 |$ 11667|$ 7000 60 $ 18884 |$ 11331 1 $ 10000($ 6000 60 $ 06500|$  39.00
Poster 11
o3| Nature Eggsplorers o8 i; X 60 60 |[$ 08210(8 49.26 5 $ 65000 $  390.00 60 |$ 11667|$ 7000 60 $ 18884 |$ 11331 1 $ 10000 |$ 6000 60 $ 06500|$  39.00
Poster 11
4o.36|  Your Time to Shine s i; X 60 60 |[$ 08210(8 49.26 5 $ 65000 $  390.00 60 |$ 11667|$ 7000 60 $ 18884 |$ 11331 1 $ 10000 |$ 6000 60 $ 06500|$  39.00
Poster 11
037 Frosty 5K o i; *1 100 100 |$ 06650|$ 6650 5 $ 65000 $  650.00 100 |$ 08700[$  87.00 100 $ 15330 |$ 15330 1 $ 08800(% 8800 100 |$ 06500|% 6500
Poster 11
1038 Mission Vision o i; X 25 25 [$13620(8 3405 5 $ 65000 $ 16250 25 $ 22800|$  57.00 25 $ 34658 S  86.65 1 $ 15000 $  37.50 25 $ 06500|$  16.25
Poster 11
0.3 | Music in the Chamber s i; X 12 12 [$ 23820[8 2858 5 $ 65000 (%  78.00 12 $ 43300($ 519 12 $ 44433 |$ 5332 1 $ 20000($ 2400 12 $ 1.0000|$  12.00
Poster 11
00|  Merry Main Street o i; X 60 60 |[$ 08210(8 49.26 5 $ 65000 $  390.00 60 |$ 11667|$ 7000 60 $ 18884 |$ 11331 1 $ 10000 (% 6000 60 $ 06500|$  39.00
Poster 14
o.41 | Music in the Chamber o ;; X 2 2 |$220850($ 4417 2 $ 112500 [ $  22.50 2 $ 235000 [$  47.00 2 $ 266600 |$  53.32 1 $ 380000 $  76.00 2 $11.0000 | $  22.00
Poster 22
ioun|  Community Mural o ;2 X 2 NoBid | No Bid No Bid 2 $ 160000 [ $  32.00 2 $ 235000 [$  47.00 2 $ 266600 $  53.32 1 $ 380000 (%  76.00 2 $12.5000 | $  25.00
Poster 22
043 FAC Services o8 Z; X 10 NoBid | No Bid No Bid 2 $ 200000 [ $  200.00 10 |$ s51000|$ 5100 5 $ 146630 | $  146.63 1 $ 380000 |$  380.00 10 $15.0000 | $  150.00
4o4q| TheGroveRentals |Fiyerssx1il 2000 NoBid | No Bid No Bid 2000 |$ 01350 (% 27000 2000 |$ 01725|$ 34500 500 $ 01621 |$ 32413 1 $ 03400 $  680.00 1000 |$ 02200|$  440.00
#0-45| Nature Eggsplorers Map 1600 NoBid | NoBid No Bid 1600 | $ 00450 |$ 7200 || 1600 | S 0.1044|5  167.04 1600 S 00706|%  113.03 1 S 01500 24000 1600 | S 005005 80.00
#0-46 | Merry Main Street | Program 4000 4000 | S 0.3820 | S 1,528.00 || 4000 |5 03100 | $ 1,240.00 || 4000 |$ 04710 S 1,884.00 4000 $ 04876 | S 195040 4000 | S 04800 S 1,920.00 || 4000 | $ 02900 $ 1,160.00
40-47 Frosty 5K Rack Cards | 6000 6000 | $ 0.1040|$ 62400 || 6000 |$ 00650 |% 390.00|| 6000 |$ 0.1070|$  642.00 6000 S 04181|% 70833 6000 | S 01500 $  900.00 || 3000 |$ 0.0700|S 42000
40-48 The Grove Rack Cards | 1000 1000 | $ 01280 S 12800 || 1000 |$ 0.000|$ 10000 || 1000 |S 02090 S _ 209.00 1000 $ 01586 |$  158.63 1000 |5 02200]8 22000 1000 [ $ 01400 [$ _ 140.00
#0-49|  Heritage Rentals | Rack Cards | 500 500 | S 01480|%  7400]] 500 |S 01900]S$ _ 9500 500 | $ 02260]%  113.00 500 $ 02106|% 10531 500 $ 02500 % 12500 500 | $ 025003 12500
#0-50 Heritage Rack Cards | 1000 1000 | $ 01280 |5 12800 || 1000 |$ 0.000|$ 10000 || 1000 | 02090 S _ 209.00 1000 $ 01586 |$  158.63 1000 |5 02200]5 22000 1000 [ $ 0.1400 [$ _ 140.00
#0-51| Frisco Art Gallery | Rack Cards | 200 200 | S 02330|% 4660 200 |S 03800]$  76.00 200 | $ 04000]S _ 80.00 50 S 03694|%  73.87 200 $ 03100]5 6200 200 | $ 02250]$ 4500
0.5 | Fisco Discovery Center | Rack Cards | 500 so0 |$ 01480|$ 7400 500 |$ 01900|$ 9500 500 |$ 02260[$ 113.00 100 $ 02106 |$ 10531 500 $ 02500|$ 12500 500 | $ 02500|$ 12500
Staff &
Merry Main Street Vendor 280 NoBid | NoBid No Bid 00 |$ 1.5600|$ 436.80 220 |$ 21429|$ 600,01 No Bid No Bid No Bid 200 $ 22500 % 63000 280 | $ 1.0500|$  294.00
#0-53 badges
054 | P12V Magazine - Spring | Magazine | 5000 NoBid | No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid No Bid 5000 | $ 1.5422|$ 7,711.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 5000 | $ 3.2400|$ 1620000 || 5000 |$ 1.4520| $ 7,260.00
0.55 |Play Magazine - Summer| Magazine | 8000 NoBid | No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid No Bid 8000 |$ 1.0809 | $ 8,647.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid 8000 | $ 3.1500 | § 2520000 [| 8000 |$ 1.0200|$ 8,160.00
#0-56| Play Magazine - Fall | Magazine | 5000 NoBid | NoBid No Bid NoBid | NoBid No Bid 5000 | $ 154225 7,711.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 5000 | S 3.2400 | 5 16,200.00 || 5000 | $ 1.4520| % 7,260.00
Subtotal $25,431.80 $ 27,886.80 $53,973.16 $20,977.14 $100,475.70 $40,301.75
Staff Badges . . "
Freedom Fest Lot2) 250 250 | $ 08030 |$ 20075 00 |$ 1.5600|$ 390.00 250 | $ 09080|$ 227.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 200 $ 20000 |$ 50000 250 | $ 03500|$  87.50
#0-57
Vend
o8 Freedom Fest B:gg: 250 250 |$ 08030 |$ 20075 250 |$ 06400|$ 160.00 250 | $ 09080|$ 227.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 200 $ 20000 ($ 50000 250 | $ 03000|$ 7500
#0-59 Freedom Fest Vip Badges 100 100 | $ 1.1208]5 11208 100 | S 156005  156.00 100 | $ 1.8500|$  185.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 100 S 25000 | 5 25000 100 |5 03500]5 3500
0.60 Freedom Fest Pzr:gg::r 100 100 |$ 11208|$ 11208 00 |$ 1.5600|$ 156.00 100 |$ 1.8500|$ 185.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 100 $ 25000 [$ 25000 00 [$ 03500[$ 3500
Staff Badges . . R
Freedom Fest 2012) 250 250 |$ 08030 |$ 20075 250 |$ 06400|$ 16000 250 | $ 09080|$ 227.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 200 $ 20000 |$ 50000 250 | $ 03500|$  87.50
#0-61
Volunt
062 Freedom Fest ga“d"g::' 200 200 |3 07900|$ 15800 200 |$ 08000|$ 160.00 200 |$ 10350[% 207.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 200 $ 20000 $ 40000 200 |$ 03500|$ 7000
At
063 Freedom Fest por:tre"re 20 20 [$31.0000($ 62000 5 $ 280000 [ $  560.00 20 |3 692700 | $ 1,385.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid 1 $ 365600 |$ 73120 1 $ 02400 |8 480
Poster 12.5
064 Freedom Fest o8 i; . X' 1000 1000 |$ 05400 |$ 54000 [| 1000 |$ 09800 |$ 98000 1000 |$ 04610|$ 46100 1000 $ 04901 |$  490.06 1 $ 1.0000 [ $ 1,000.00 500 | $ 04500|$ 45000




AlphaGraphics #54 Bassett Design, LL John Sons Press OCOP Express (oak Cliff Office Products) Phase 3 LLC Sir Speedy #4023
40-65 Freedom Fest Parking Pass 500 500 $ 04070 | $  203.50 500 $ 02400|$ 120.00 500 $ 03740 |$  187.00 500 $ 02533|$ 12663 200 $ 1.5000 | $ 750.00 500 $ 0.1800 | $ 90.00
#0-66 Freedom Fest Program 4000 4000 $ 0.6560 [ S 2,624.00 4000 $ 0.8300 [ $ 3,320.00 4000 $ 1.0328 | $ 4,131.20 4000 $ 0.8300 | $ 3,320.00 4000 $ 22700 | $ 9,080.00 4000 $ 0.6500 [ $ 2,600.00
#0-67 | Hotter 'n Firecracker | Rack Cards 2000 2000 [$ 0.1130|$  226.00 2000 $ 0.0900|$ 180.00 2000 $ 01815|$ 363.00 2000 $ 01260 |$ 251.94 2000 $ 0.2200($ 440.00 2000 $ 0.1400 | $  280.00
#0-68 MVP Reception Certificates 400 400 $ 0.7560 | $ 302.40 400 $ 0.4500 | $ 180.00 400 $ 0.5625| S 225.00 400 $ 1.8329|$ 733.15 1 $ 1.0000 | $ 400.00 400 $ 0.6500 | $ 260.00
40-69 MVP Reception I\Iil:tlzlgsg 400 400 $ 01980 | $ 79.20 400 $ 0.1100 | $ 44.00 400 $ 0.1250|$ 50.00 400 S 04416 | S 176.65 1 $ 03500 (S 140.00 400 $ 0.0750 | $ 30.00
Return
MVP Reception Mailing 400 400 $ 0.1050 | $ 42.00 400 $ 0.0600 | S 24.00 400 $ 0.1125|$ 45.00 400 S 04299 S 171.96 1 $ 03500 (S 140.00 400 $ 0.0750 | $ 30.00
#0-70 Labels
#0-71 MVP Reception Program 150 150 $ 2.5850 | $ 387.75 150 $ 3.9400 | $ 591.00 150 $ 41733 S 626.00 150 S 26184 (S 392.76 1 $ 7.9000 | $ 1,185.00 150 $ 1.9700 | $ 295.50
#0-72 Holiday Cards - Card 300 300 $ 05290 |$ 15870 250 $ 07600 |$ 228.00 300 $ 05100|$ 153.00 300 $ 05554 |$  166.63 1 $ 1.2500 (S 375.00 300 $ 0.7500 | $  225.00
4073 Holiday Card Envelopes | Envelope 300 300 $ 0.4960 | $  148.80 250 $ 04200|$ 126.00 300 $ 04467 |$ 13401 300 $ 04354|$ 13063 1 $ 0.5600 | $ 168.00 300 $ 04500 |$  135.00
Subtotal $ 6,316.76 $ 7,535.00 $ 9,018.60 $ 5,960.40 $ 16,809.20 $ 4,790.30
Required Notices & CHIP
4074 Notices Envelope 1400 1400 |$ 05870 |$  821.80 1400 $ 04300|$ 602.00 1400 $ 03657 |$ 51198 500 $ 03228|$ 45189 1400 $ 08700 | $ 1,218.00 1400 $ 03750 | $  525.00
R ired Noti & CHIP| Add
equirec Motices ress 1400 1400 | $ 0.0480 | $ 67.20 1400 $ 0.0550 | $ 77.00 1400 $ 0.0500 | $ 70.00 250 $ 01133|$ 15863 1400 $ 03500 (S 490.00 1400 $ 00750 | $  105.00
#0-75 Notices labels
Required Notices & CHIP .
4076 Notices Chip Packet 1400 1400 |$ 0.1320|$ 184.80 1000 $ 01100 |$  154.00 1400 $ 00843|$ 118.02 500 $ 00760 |$ 106.36 1400 $ 0.5000 | $ 700.00 1400 $ 0.0700 | $ 98.00
R ired Noti & CHIP| R ired
equirec Motices equire 1400 1400 |$ 0.5860 | $  820.40 1000 $ 04200|$ 588.00 1400 $ 04593 |$  643.02 500 $ 05580 |$ 78125 1400 $ 07500 | $ 1,050.00 1400 $ 04400 |$ 616.00
#0-77 Notices Notices
Required Notices & CHIP| Preperation
. . 1400 1400 |$ 04430|$ 620.20 1000 $ 0.1000|$  140.00 1400 $ 04643 |$  650.02 500 $ 02618|$ 36658 1400 $ 0.6000 | $ 840.00 1400 $ 0.1500 | $  210.00
#0-78 Notices for Mail
Subtotal $ 2,514.40 $ 1,561.00 $ 1,993.04 $ 1,864.70 $  4,298.00 $ 1,554.00




