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1
#1-1 6X1 BRONZE TAPPING SADDLE 5 EA $137.63 14% $118.36 Ford $118.36 $229.39 20% $183.51 FORD $183.51 $239.29 -55% $107.68 FORD $107.68
#1-2 8X1 BRONZE TAPPING SADDLE 10 EA $170.32 14% $146.48 Ford $146.48 $283.89 20% $227.11 FORD $227.11 $283.89 -55% $127.75 FORD $127.75
#1-3 6" PVC MEGALUG 30 EA $92.87 52% $44.58 Various Vendors $44.58 $92.87 20% $74.30 SIGMA $74.30 $95.31 -63% $35.26 SIGMA/STAR/FORD $35.26
#1-4 6" MEGALUG ACCESSORY PACK LESS GLAND 30 EA $40 40% $24 Various Vendors $24 $55.94 20% $44.75 PROSELECT $44.75 $40 -50% $20 SIGMA/STAR $20
2
#2-1 3/4" CC CORP 30 EA $72.46 48% $37.53 Ford $37.53 $72.45 20% $57.96 FORD $57.96 $72.45 -54% $33.33 FORD $33.33
#2-2 3/4" ANGLE STOP KEY TYPE 75 EA $88.18 48% $45.68 Ford $45.68 $88.17 20% $70.54 FORD $70.54 $88.17 -53% $41.44 FORD $41.44
#2-3 3/4" ANGLE STOP BALL TYPE 40 EA $168.17 48% $87.11 Ford $87.11 $98.40 20% $78.72 FORD $78.72 $168.17 -53% $79.04 FORD $79.04
3
#3-1 1” POLY PIPE 200 PSI RATING ENDOTRACE 40 100' ROLL $2.31 20% $1.85 Endotrace $1.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $154 0% $154 EGW $154
#3-2 BLACK PLASTIC TAPE 5 CASE $240 30% $168 EGW $168 $270.48 20% $216.48 PROSELECT $216.48 $144 0% $144 EGW $144
#3-3 16 INCH CL150 PVC DR18 - GSK BLUE 2 20’ STICK $160 35% $103.54 Various Vendors $103.54 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,599.80 0% $1,599.80 DIAMOND PLASTICS $1,599.80
4
#4-1 2” METER GASKETS 300 EA $3.16 40% $1.90 EGW $1.90 $2.53 20% $2.02 PROSELECT $2.02 $1.52 0% $1.52 EGW $1.52
#4-2 1” METER GASKETS 4000 EA $0.23 35% $0.15 EGW $0.15 $0.72 20% $0.58 PROSELECT $0.58 $0.22 0% $0.22 EGW $0.22
#4-3 14”X18” PLASTIC METER BOX 300 EA $204.62 35% $132.99 DFW Plastic $132.99 $171.45 10% $154.91 DFW $154.91 $120.75 0% $120.75 DFW PLASTICS $120.75
#4-4 1” STRAIGHT METER COUPLING/ NO LEAD 2500 EA $32.28 47% $17 Ford $17 $33.21 20% $26.57 FORD $26.57 $33.21 -55% $14.94 FORD $14.94

$929.17 $1,137.45 $2,479.73

Bid # 2205-066
Water, Sewer, Meter Parts
Opened June 28, 2022 at 2pm

Core and Main FERGUSON WATERWORKS FORTILINE WATERWORKS
Branch 143- 4650 Hwy US 377 Krugerville, TX 76227 10077 W University Dr McKinney TX 75071 600 Hays Rd Propser TX 75078

Bob O'Brien 940.365.9117 Troy McCamish 972.434.2600 Jose Jasso 972.347.4421
Bob.obrien@coreandmain.com Troy.Mccamish@ferguson.com jose.jasso@fortiline.com
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