
Total Cost
Items Quantity Unit UnitPrice TotalCost UnitPrice TotalCost UnitPrice TotalCost

1 CH33 Lounge Chair 4 Each $553.79 $2,215.16 No Bid No Bid $500.44 $2,001.76
2 CH34 Lounge Chair with arms 4 Each $571.85 $2,287.40 No Bid No Bid $516.76 $2,067.04
3 TA17 Round Table 13 Each $500.71 $6,509.23 No Bid No Bid $452.47 $5,882.11
4 CH46 Lounge Chair 21 Each $2,053.15 $43,116.15 No Bid No Bid $1,815.36 $38,122.56
5 CH47 Lounge Chair-swivel 63 Each $2,092.20 $131,808.60 No Bid No Bid $1,849.89 $116,543.07
6 HSD01 Hand Sanitizer Dispenser 12 Each $547.32 $6,567.84 No Bid No Bid $498.90 $5,986.80
7 CH11 Molded Lounge Chair 3 Each $1,386.39 $4,159.17 No Bid No Bid $1,263.74 $3,791.22
8 TA2222 Molded Ottoman 2 Each $732.98 $1,465.96 No Bid No Bid $668.13 $1,336.26
9 TA2828 Molded Coffee Table 2 Each $631.35 $1,262.70 No Bid No Bid $584.62 $1,169.24

10 TB02 Trash and Reycling Bin 40 Each $595.55 $23,822.00 No Bid No Bid $548.89 $21,955.60
11 MS01 Rolling Cart, Large 2 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $611.76 $1,223.52
12 MS02 Rolling Cart, Small 3 Each $753.46 $2,260.38 No Bid No Bid $686.80 $2,060.40
13 CG01 Mobile Demo Kitchen 1 Each $11,000.70 $11,000.70 No Bid No Bid $10,027.48 $10,027.48
14 L01 Floor lamp 15 Each
15 SA01 Safe 1 Each $1,618.46 $1,618.46 No Bid No Bid $1,620.75 $1,620.75
16 LO01 Lockers 1 Lot $11,297.25 $11,297.25 No Bid No Bid $10,297.80 $10,297.80
17 CH30 Stool, Outdoor 24 Each $960.83 $23,059.92 No Bid No Bid $974.11 $23,378.64
18 CH31 Chair, Outdoor 12 Each $437.02 $5,244.24 No Bid No Bid $443.06 $5,316.72
19 TA31 Outdoor Café Table 6 Each $863.78 $5,182.68 No Bid No Bid $875.72 $5,254.32
20 SI1884 Industrial Shelving 103 Each $302.47 $31,154.41 $325.59 $33,535.77 $322.52 $33,219.56
21 SI1284 Industrial Shelving 24 Each $340.25 $8,166.00 $367.07 $8,809.68 $259.54 $6,228.96
22 MO01 Mail Slat Wall Organizer 1 Each $988.55 $988.55 No Bid No Bid $911.14 $911.14
23 CH42-A Lounge Chair ottoman 11 Each $1,057.07 $11,627.77 No Bid No Bid $502.13 $5,523.43
24 CH45 Lounge Chair 4 Each $2,244.37 $8,977.48 No Bid No Bid $1,083.89 $4,335.56
25 CH51-A Lounge Chair 34 Each $2,043.71 $69,486.14 No Bid No Bid $979.79 $33,312.86
26 RB01 Recycling Bin 114 Each $8.28 $943.92 No Bid No Bid $13.32 $1,518.48
27 TB01 Trash Bin 114 Each $11.07 $1,261.98 No Bid No Bid $11.20 $1,276.80
28 TB03 Trash Bin on dolly 4 Each $228.43 $913.72 No Bid No Bid $296.67 $1,186.68
29 TB04 Trash Bin 1 Each $176.94 $176.94 No Bid No Bid $196.24 $196.24
30 TB05 Trash Bin 5 Each $72.15 $360.75 No Bid No Bid $74.53 $372.65
31 MB01 Metal Beads 1 Lot $9,584.16 $9,584.16 No Bid No Bid $8,736.26 $8,736.26
32 CH56-A Lounge Chair 2 Each $1,306.22 $2,612.44 No Bid No Bid $1,180.38 $2,360.76
33 CH101-A Sofa 1 Each $1,862.20 $1,862.20 No Bid No Bid $1,682.80 $1,682.80
34 AR01 Area rug, round 1 Each $9,332.20 $9,332.20 No Bid No Bid $8,506.59 $8,506.59
35 AR01 Area rug 1 Each
36 CHB01 Wood bench 6 Each $2,988.57 $17,931.42 No Bid No Bid $2,724.18 $16,345.08
37 DF01 Frame, Small 1 Each $928.28 $928.28 No Bid No Bid $846.15 $846.15
38 DF02 Frame, Large 1 Each $1,567.22 $1,567.22 No Bid No Bid $1,428.57 $1,428.57
39 DF03 Frame, X-Large 1 Each $2,019.30 $2,019.30 No Bid No Bid $1,840.66 $1,840.66
40 Freight 1 Each $40,086.11 $40,086.11 Included Included $31,947.28 $31,947.28
41 Installation 1 Each Included Included Included Included $21,525.00 $21,525.00

42

Additional COM (Customers Own 
Material-extra material for 
upholstery) 1 Each
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$502,858.83 $42,345.45 $441,336.80
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